


THE 

DICKINSON 
ALUMNUS 
Summer i967, Vol. 44, No. 3 

HONORARY EDITOR 
Dean Hoffman, '02 

EDITOR 
Vincent J. Schafmeister, Jr., '49 

ALUMNI PUBLICATIONS 
COMMITTEE 
William B. Harlan, '50, Chairman 
Robert G. Crist, '47 
David McGahey, '60 
Whitfield J. Bell, Jr., '35 
Barbara A. Buechner, '63 
M. Charles Seller, '55 

The Dickinson Alumnus is published 
quarterly. Entered as second class 
matter May 23, i923, at the Post 
Office at Carlisle, Pa., under the Act 
of Congress of March 3, i 879. 

Cover: 

See photograph, page I 

In This Issue: 
Ought Clio to be Enjoined? 

Page 1 

Commencement 1967 
Page 6 

Around the Campus 
Page 8 

Letters to the Editor 
Page 10 

Dickinson Fund Annual Report 
Page 11 

Alumni Affairs 
Page 31 

Personal Mention 
Page 35 

Obituaries 
Page 46 

Special Mention 
Page 48 





By Warren ]. Gates, Ph.D. 
Professor of History 

Professor Gates is Chairman of the Department of History 

FoR the past two years Clio, the 
muse of history, has been more than 
an interested spectator in the Court 
of Common Pleas of Cumberland 
County as the case of Frick vs. 
Stevens has attracted nationwide 
attention. Of immediate interest 
for Dickinsonians is the fact that, 
un ti! the recent hearings on excep­ 
tions to the decision began, both 
bench and bar involved in the case 
have been exclusively Dickinson­ 
ians. See the box listing of the per­ 
sonnel. This and the site of the trial 
only two short blocks from the 
campus might prompt brief notice 
in an alumni magazine. But the 
importance of the case to historians, 
biographers and all who read their 
books warrants more extended ex­ 
position of the facts and issues 
involved. 
Indicative of its significance for 

scholars is the fact that while the 
case was being argued, the two 
leading professional organizations 
for historians, the American His­ 
torical Association and the Organ­ 
ization of American Historians, 
created a Joint Committee for the 
Defense of the Rights of Historians 
under the First Amendment. They 
also mounted a nationwide drive to 
raise a defense fund. Interest in the 
suit is warranted because it involves 
the rights and responsibilities of 
historians, the public stake in un­ 
distorted history and recourses open 
to an individual who believes him­ 
self or his forebears unfairly treated 
by an historian. 

Essential facts of the case can be 
briefly stated. In 1964 Dr. Sylves­ 
ter K. Stevens, Executive Director 
of the Pennsylvania Historical and 
Museum Commission wrote, under 
contract with Random House, Penn­ 
sylvania: Birthplace of a Nation. 
At Christmas time he presented a 
copy of the book to Miss Helen C. 
Frick, daughter of Henry Clay 
Frick. Mr. Frick had been a prom­ 
inent industrialist in western Pennsyl­ 
vania, had played a leading role in 
the development of the region's 
coal and steel industries and had 
been the active spokesman of the 
Carnegie Steel Company at the 
time of the famous Homestead 
Strike in I 892. Consequently in 
treating Pennsylvania industrial and 
labor developments in the late 
nineteen th and early twentieth cen­ 
turies, Dr. Stevens referred to 
Frick at several places in connection 
with the development of industrial 
monopoly, use of immigrant labor, 
wage policies, opposition to union­ 
ization and philanthropy. Con­ 
cerning the Homestead strike, for 
example, he wrote in part (p. 209): 

The power of the union was 
broken in the bloody and 
disasterous Homestead strike 
in I!J92. by stern, brusque, 
autocratic Henry Clay Frick. 

Mrss Frick regarded this and 
several other references to her father 
as not merely uncomplimentary 
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but "false, scandalous, malicious 
and defamatory of her. father." She 
also alleged that they had impaired 
her own reputation because of her 
association with him in the public 
mind and that it damaged the mem­ 
ory of her father. In consequence 
she brought suit against Dr. Stevens 
asking that the court enjoin him 
from distributing or allowing others, 
i.e. the publishers, to distribute the 
volume unless the offensive passages 
were deleted or suitably changed. 
Dr. Stevens, through his attorneys, 
denied that the statements were 
defamatory and asserted that they 
were true. He further argued that 
in the absence of malice, which he 
denied, the statements were privi­ 
leged under the First Amendment's 
guarantees of freedom of speech and 
press and that the Fourteenth 
Amendment prohibited a state 
(through the agency of the courts in 
this instance) to abridge the privi­ 
leges or immunities of citizens of the 
United States. Hearings in the case 
began in January I 96 5 and con tin­ 
ued from time to time into the 
present year. Judge Weidner's de­ 
cision dismissing the action against 
Dr. Stevens was announced May 
25th. A hearing on numerous excep­ 
tions to that decision by the plain tiff 
occurred in late July. 
Writing from an historian's per­ 

spective it is our purpose to identify 
briefly crucial issues raised by the 
case, indicate their resolution in the 
May decision and explore their im­ 
plications for historical writing. No 



attempt is made to treat technical 
legal points; they are grist for the 
Jaw reviews. 

Above all the case raises the 
issue of whether historical and bio­ 
graphical writing may express crit­ 
ical judgments. Almost every his­ 
torical work deals, of necessity, with 
the acts and thoughts of some one's 
ancestors! Unless historians are to 
be limited to uniform and fulsome 
praise of all whom they mention 
and avoid all assessments of roles 
and motives other than these which 
are heroic, some actions and some 
individuals will be judged less 
favorably than others. In short, 
discriminating judgments are the 
stuff of history. This suit seeks by 
court order to restrain expression of 
adverse or critical evaluations con­ 
cerning Henry Clay Frick. 

EssENTIALLY what is called for is 
censorship of a historian's work. 
That censorship is demanded at the 
option of a private individual who, 
for filiopietistic reasons, believes 
that historical errors are contained 
in Pennsylvania: Birthplace of a 
Nation. The May decision rejects 
the request on several important 
grounds. Primacy is given to the 
public's right to know the back­ 
ground and history-the whole 
story, not a partial or biased ac­ 
count-of current public issues. 
The opinion defines broadly the 
scope of public interest in the his­ 
torical origins of con temporary prob­ 
lems. All of the topics which Dr. 
Stevens was discussing when he had 
reference to Mr. Frick are found to 
be objects of legitimate public 
interest. 
The defense contention that this 

particular volume was entitled to 
protection under constitutional 
guarantees of freedom of speech and 
the press was re-en forced by several 
characteristics of the book. First 
its topic supported the argument 
that this was an inquiry in to the 
background of matters of public 
interest. Second, the particular 

topics under discussion in the pas­ 
sages con tainmg the challenged 
references were germane to a history 
of the development of the state. 
Third, not only had Frick partici­ 
pated in public discussion and ex­ 
pressed public positions on most of 
these topics but also his views had 
been of importance to his contem­ 
poraries. He had "injected himself 
into the vortex of public issues" by 
his words and deeds and had thereby 
become a logical subject of atten­ 
tion for the historian. It should be 
noted that while historical works 
may find shelter under the consti­ 
tution al freedoms they do not 
qualify merely because they are 
historical in character. Further­ 
more, for many legitimate historical 
topics it might be extremely difficult 
to demonstrate a direct relevance 
to con temporary issues. The weight 
placed in this case on Frick's being 
a public figure is understandable, 
but a historian might for equally 
good cause attempt to deal with an 
individual not engaged in public 
controversy or a document not in­ 
tended for public scrutiny such as a 
personal letter or diary. A better 
basis for invocation of freedom of 
speech and press with regard to 
historical works than has been 
developed in Frick vs. Stevens is 
desirable to insure full freedom for 
historical inquiry. 
Freedom of speech and press con­ 

fer no immunity for irresponsible 
statements, hence the author whose 
work is challenged must undertake 
to establish the historical truth of 
his writing. This any historian 
always must be prepared to do be­ 
fore the historical profession in 
defense of his work. In scholarly 

Dickinsonian Bench 
And Bar Involved 
In Frz"ck vs Stevens 

The Hon. Dale F. Shughart, '34 
The Hon. Clinton R. Weidner, '37 
Miss Sylvia H. Rambo, Esq., '58 
Mr. John E. S!ike, Esq., '51 
Mr. George F. Douglas, j-, Esq.,' 50 
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publications he indicates the basis 
for his finding of fact and the extent 
of his reliance on the judgments of 
other scholars through footnotes and 
bibliography. This has the effect of 
transferring to the cited author a 
portion of the burden of proof. But 
the volume with which we are con­ 
cerned carries no footnotes, and in 
any case proof in a court of law is a 
different matter. The court insisted 
that the truth of the statements re­ 
lating to Mr. Frick be substantiated 
from con temporary sources even 
though there was no claim that 
Stevens in preparation of his book 
had worked from primary rather 
than secondary sources. 

LE truth is traditionally a de­ 
fense against libel. In this case the 
truth, i.e. historical validity of 
statements of fact and a reasonable 
basis for evaluative judgments, 
served as a defense against the 
charge of defamation. Dr. Stevens, 
in the opinion of the judge, was able 
to present convincing data support­ 
ing each of his statements concern­ 
ing Mr. Frick. Because of the 
court's insistence on presentation 
of primary sources and failure to 
consider the fact that Stevens' 
critical judgments were in each in­ 
stance similar to those of other 
historians who have written on 
these topics, the defense seems to 
have been deprived of an oppor­ 
tunity to introduce expert testi­ 
mony. Evidence to establish the 
author's professional qualifications 
to undertake the work was received. 
If no historian may take as his 
point of departure the work of 
another historian and must stand 
ready to provide in full the origin al 
evidence behind every judgment, 
few works would be produced. 
General histories, textbooks and 
encyclopedias would be almost out 
of the question. 

If court reviews of historical 
evidence and the insurance of 
orders sustaining authors or plain­ 
tiffs became frequent, the burden 



The historian has been alerted. 

He knows how perilous (y he lives 

~~~ - ---------~ 

and what a premium rests on the 

adequacy of his research. His 

profession has reacted by under- 

taking to mob i'lize support for 

its members in their publication 

of the historical truth. As for 

C Iio, the answers to date are 

reassuring. She has 'nos, she ought 

not to be enjoined. But she must 

demand of her devotees even more 

rigorous commitments to objectivity 

on the courts would be almost un­ 
limited. Judges would have to be­ 
come qualified historians and pub­ 
lished works might become not the 
product of an author-scholar exer­ 
cising critical judgment but of a 
court of equity. The decision at 
several points recognizes the prac­ 
tical problems which a judicial re­ 
view of historical evidence would 
entail as well as the adverse effects 
court authorized history would have 
upon the public's right to know 
man's heritage from the past. 
Judge Weidner's opinion referred 

and documentation of their search 

for the truth about the past. 

to the differing versions of the 
Kennedy assassination each re­ 
garded by its author as the true 
account and to the dilemmas a court 
would face if the history of that 
event came before the court. Ex­ 
trapolating from his reference it 
must be observed that the obstacles 
to producing a consensus version of 
the assassination, i.e, one acceptable 
to all parties, stagger the imagina­ 
tion. Projection of court review and 
determination of the type sought in 
Frick vs. Stevens to the Kennedy 
assassination might provide pos. 
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terity with a single court authorized 
account or none at all. The con­ 
troversy over it, which is itself a 
historical phenomenon, would be 
lost to view. For the historian the 
decision in the case which we are 
discussing shows reassuring evi­ 
dence that the presiding judge was 
acutely conscious of the impracti­ 
cality and social undesirability of 
court review of historical facts or 
interpretations. 
The case raises, but does not 

clearly resolve, the problem of 
what constitutes "reasonable in- 



vestigation and research." This 
problem, which has plagued gener­ 
ations of dissertation supervisers, 
review committees and advisers of 
honors candidates, awaits its Solo­ 
mon. The decision does find that 
evidence substantiated the truth of 
the statements about Mr. Frick. 
No distinction is made between the 
evidence which Dr. Stevens had in 
hand when he wrote the book and 
that which has been developed by 
him and his attorneys in the course 
of defending the case. Quite ob­ 
viously it is incumbent upon the 
historian, biographer or other re­ 
searcher to secure adequate evidence 
supporting both his favorable and 
his critical appraisals of individuals 
or groups about whom he writes. 
The absence of guidelines or a for­ 
mula defining what is reasonable 
investigation leaves the matter 
where it probably ought to remain. 
It is subject to the discretion of the 
individual author, his editors and the 
book reviewers; individually and 
collectively their sense of standards 
and obligations will insist upon 
adequate documentation. 

LE decision offers the historian 
several lines of defense in case his 
work comes under attack in the 
courts. First, there is insistence 
that the volume as a whole must be 
considered. Isolated sentences or 
paragraphs may not be taken as a 
basis for suits for defamation. The 
context in which the critical judg­ 
ment appears is important. If care 
is taken to relate an action to the 
practices or code of conduct pre­ 
vailing at the time, i.e. if it is 
placed in perspective, support is 
provided for arguing that no malice 
is implied toward the individual. 
The truth of a statement, of course, 
is its best defense. Second, the 
passage of time in no way exempts 
an individual from critic ism, hence 
the historian may make the types 
of judgments which he is free to 
make of persons playing similar 
roles in his own epoch. He ob- 

viously will not make judgments 
without what he regards as reason­ 
able evidence. But his freedom of 
speech is not inhibited by the fact 
that time has passed since the event 
about which he writes occurred. 

HISTORIANS are not exempt from 
actions for libel or defamation. For 
such actions to succeed, however, it 
must be shown that there was on 
the author's part "knowledge that 
the statements were false or reck­ 
less disregard of whether the state­ 
ments were false or not." In effect 
this offers protection to the his­ 
torian who has substantial evidence 
in support of his position and whose 
work attempts to treat his topic 
with objectivity. For ·an historian 
these are not new standards of 
validity. Yet it must be recognized 
that historians with different frames 
of reference or differing interpretive 
theses often draw quite dissimilar 
conclusions from the same facts. 
Consequently suits for libel or 
defamation might prove equally 
difficult for plain tiff and defendant. 
The legal remedy which is open to a 
plain tiff is an action to recover 
provable damages. Actions to re­ 
quire revision of a work by virtue 
of a court order seek an inappro­ 
priate remedy. 
The decision in this case, if it is 

upheld, is no direct barrier to 
criminal prosecution or civil action 
for damages. It recognizes the pri­ 
mary right of society to valid his­ 
tory and the founding fathers' fears 
of censorship or prior restraints 
upon publication. The founding 
fathers' remedy against abuse of 
the freedom conferred by the con­ 
s ti tu tion al guarantees for freedom 
of speech and the press and that 
suggested by Judge Weidner as the 
best protection is that enlightened 
public opinion will effectively dis­ 
credit those "who handled the 
truth carelessly or abandon It. 
Whether a descendant has a stake 
in the reputation of a forebear which 
can be damaged to such a degree as 
to give him cause for legal action 
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was a recurrent issue in this case. 
Miss Frick failed to convince the 
court that she had suffered injury 
in this instance or indeed that a 
relative has a right to institute a 
suit for defamation of a person who 
has died. 
Historians may note with concern 

and some degree of shock that the 
author, not the publisher, was the 
subject of the suit even though the 
relief sought was an end to the dis­ 
tribution of the book in its present 
form. Furthermore the publisher 
did not rush to aid his author 
either by assistance of the corpora­ 
tion's counsel or by supplying funds 
to meet the substantial costs of an 
adequate defense. Possibly there 
were technical reasons for this 
course of action, for as the case was 
handled the court disclaimed power 
to issue orders binding on the pub­ 
lisher. 

.RoBABLY the first conclusion 
which should be drawn from the 
case in its present status is that the 
old caveat emptor must be expanded 
to read caveat auctor, The relation 
of free historical inquiry and publi­ 
cation to the public interest and 
constitutional guarantees has been 
affirmed. The impracticality and 
undesirability of resort to the courts 
to establish findings of historical 
fact has been recognized by the 
court. The historian has been 
alerted. He knows how perilously 
he lives and what a premium rests 
on the adequacy of his research. 
His profession has reacted by under­ 
taking to mobilize support for its 
members in their publication of the 
historical truth. As for Clio the 
answers to date are reassuring. She 
has not, she ought not to be en­ 
joined. But she must demand of her 
devotees even more rigorous com­ 
mitments to objectivity and docu­ 
mentation of their search for the 
truth about the past. She must 
also await the outcome of the hear­ 
ings on the exceptions to the de­ 
cision and face the possibility that 
the case may be appealed. 



COMMENCEMENT 
1967 

It Was a Very Good Show! 

The College conferred honorary degrees upon four persons at its I94th Commencement 
exercises on '[une 4: S. Dillon Ripley, head of the Smithsonian Institution; ]ohn H. 
Gibbon, 'Ir, pioneer in heart surgery; Frederick K. Miller, Commissioner of Higher 
Education in Pennsylvania; and Bishop Prince /fiber! Taylor, resident head of the 
New ]erse)' Area of the Methodist Church. Left to right they are: (seated) Dr. Miller, 
Dr. Gibbon, President of the College, Dr. Howard L. Rubendall, Dr. Taylor, and 
Dr. Ripley. Standing are Dickinson faculty who presented their candidates for degrees: 
Dr. Joseph H. Schiffman, Dr. Elmer R. Herber, Dr. Harry F. Booth, and Dr. Milton 
E. Flower. 
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Homer M. Respess, '17, receives a silver 
bowl from Dr. Rubendall marking 34 
years of service to tlie Baltimore Confer­ 
ence of tlie Methodist Church, 

Dr. James R. Sliepley, '39, left, Dr. 
Rubendall, '31, and Edward /J. Phillips, 
'67, Dickinson's top student witli a 
3.978 four-year average out of a pos­ 
sible 4.00. 

Dr.James R. Shepley, '39, Publisher of Time Magazine, and a Dickin­ 
son trustee was the Commencement speaker and Dr. Charles W. Ranson 
of the Drew University Theological School preached the baccalaureate 
sermon. A scholar-scientist, a famous heart surgeon, an educator, and a 
Methodist Bishop received honorary degrees. A former Dickinson 
president, Bishop Fred Pierce Corson, '17, was presented a medal from 
Pope Paul VI. Sidney D. Kline, Jr., '54, was elected president of the 
Alumni Association. An oil portrait of value was presented to the College 
by Dr. John J. Snyder, '35, and Mrs. Evelyn Gutshall Snyder, '36. Samuel 
J. Ressetar, '27, presented to the College a marine scene in oil which he 
had painted. Dr. Hampton P. Corson, '49 and Mrs. Mary Dykstra 
Corson, '52 presented a portrait of Bishop Corson. Class Agents presented 
record sums to the Dickinson Fund. And Stephen A. Marini, '68, was the 
recipient of the '02 Award-emblematic of the most outstanding member 
of the Junior Class. It was a very good show! 

Dr. Jolin J. Snyder, ']5 and Mrs. 
Snyder, '36 witli son Jolin, '67 and 
portrait of David Watts Hulings, 1815. 

Bishop George L. Leecn of tlie Catliolic 
Diocese of Harrisburg, riglit, prepares 
to present a medal in behalf of Pope 
Paul VI to Bishop Fred Pierce Corson, 
'17. 

Dr. Hampton P. Corson, '49 and Mrs. 
Mary Dykstra Corson, '52, standing at 
riglit, witli tlie portrait of Bishop Corson 
tliey presented to tlie College. Bishop and 
Mrs. Corson are at the left of the portrait. 



Dr. Ripley, who received the doctor 
of laws degree, became the eighth 
secretary (head) of the Smithsonian in 
1964 after serving four years as director 
of Yale University's Peabody Museum 
of Natural History and 18 years on the 
Yale faculty. 

Chairman of the Federal Council on 
the Arts and Humanities and a biologist 
and ecologist, Dr. Ripley follows in the 
Smithsonian's tradition of scholarly 
leaders, one of whom was Spencer F. 
Baird, a Dickinson graduate, Class of 
1 840, who was the second head of the 
famed institution. 

The doctor of science degree was con­ 
ferred on Dr. Gibbon, surgeon-in-chief 
of the Jefferson Medical College Hos­ 
pital and a pioneer in cardiovascular 
surgery, who holds many awards for his 
work in this field. 

Dr. Gibbon has also pioneered in the 
diagnosis and surgical management of 
lung cancer and he and his associates 
developed the heart-lung machine. He 
is an honorary fellow of the Royal 
College of Surgeons of England and a 
past president of the American Surgical 
Association. 

Dr. Miller received the doctor of 
humane letters degree. Widely known 
for his work in helping shape the course 
of education in Pennsylvania in recent 
years, he is a member of the Master 
Plan Advisory Committee for Pennsyl­ 
vania and serves on the Advisory Com- )I 
mittee to the State Commission on 
Academic Facilities. 

He became the Commissioner for 
Higher Education last April after 
serving 16 years as president of Lebanon 
Valley College. Holder of the State 
Y.M.C.A. Master of Men Award, he is 
a leading layman of the Evangelical 
United Brethren Church. 

Bishop Taylor, a native of Oklahoma, 
who served Methodist parishes in 
North Carolina and New York City 
before elevation to the bishopric in 
1956 and assignment to the Monrovia, 
Liberia Area, was awarded the doctor 
of divinity degree. 

Methodism in Liberia made great 
strides in self-reliance and self-support 
under his leadership, and in 1964 he was 
assigned to the New Jersey Area. The 
Government of Liberia twice decorated 
Bishop Taylor and he holds the St. 
George's Award for distinguished service 
in the Methodist Church. 

Commencement News 
Continued on page JI 

A Delaware County young man with 
a level gaze and warm and ready smile 
swept the major academic and leader­ 
ship honors at the 194th Dickinson 
commencement. 
Edward A. Phillips, Jr., Haver town, 

graduated at the top of his class with a 
near-perfect average for the four .Years 
(3.978 out of a possible 4.00) and re­ 
ceived the coveted Hufstader Prize as 
the senior man who contributed the 
most to the college over the four years. 
He was the only one in the class of 

239 men and women to achieve honors 
in two fields of study, Latin and English. 
He'll go to the University of Chicago as 
a Woodrow Wilson Fellow. 

"The breadth of his achievement for 
the four years has rarely been equaled 
by a senior in any Dickinson graduating 
class," commented President Howard L. 
Rubendall, who presided over the exer­ 
cises, witnessed by Phillips' parents. 

To a remarkable degree, Phillips' 
counterpart in the Junior Class is 
Stephen A. Marini, Springfield (Del. 
Co.) who completed the three years 
with the highest average in his class and 
will succeed Phillips as the Senior 
Sophister next term. Marini also was 
awarded the Class of 1902 Award (a 
gold watch) to the junior most nearly 
approaching the ideal Dickinson student 
in scholarship, character and leadership. 

The 

Ca:rrip-u..s 

When John Sanders, who is sightless, 
was named just before Commencement 
to receive the Sophomore-of-the-Year 
Award, a classmate remarked that 
"he's the most outgoing fellow in the 
College." 

Another campus friend said that 
John, a resident of Cohasset, Mass., is 
also one of the happiest of students. 
"I mean he's a genuinely happy per­ 
son," said the friend. 
Sanders was selected as the out- 

standing sophomore by the Dickinson 
chapter of Omicron Delta Kappa, 
national leadership society. A recipient 
must be a leader in his class, have a good 
academic record, and have rendered 
service to the class and the College. 
John, who prepared for Dickinson at 

the Perkins School for the Blind, 
Watertown, Mass., studies with the 
help of Braille textbooks, recordings 
and, occasionally, friends who read to 
him. 
He gets good grades. 
John sings in the Dickinson Choir and 

Glee Club, is a member of Phi Mu Alpha 
Sinfonia, a national music honorary, and 
has an hour's weekly "show" on WDCV, 
the campus radio station. On the show, 
John usually describes places and people 
he has encountered on his summer trips. 
Travel is a hobby. 
"I like best to describe Peru, par­ 

ticularly its mountains, and the many 
. sights of Washington," he says. 

This summer he has been in Mexico 
with a brother, who is a graduate stu­ 
dent at Boston University. Both did 
work in Spanish literature at a univer­ 
sity near Mexico City. 

'John Sanders was named 
the outstanding sophomore 
at the College and is shown 
being congratulated by Dr. 
Rubendall and holding the 
loving cup he received from 
ODK. 



Biddle Field 
Reconditioned 
The College has reconditioned Biddle 

Field! 
On completion of the work July 1, 

Dickinson boasted a new turtleback 
gridiron (the former was one flat) and 
an all-weather running track. 

The track is six lanes and has a 220 
straightaway and is constructed of 
Tartan, a tough rubber-like surfacing 
material made by the Minnesota Min­ 
ing & Manufacturing Company and 
used at some race tracks and colleges, 
including the Universities of Pennsyl­ 
vania and Delaware. 

(The engineers measuring for the new 

i James to Full­ 
Time Teaching 
Prof. Benjamin D. James, '34, a 

prominent member of the faculty for 
nearly three decades, returns to full­ 
time teaching in the Fall after 20 years 
as a teacher-administrator. 

For the past four years Dr.James was 
the dean of students, the first person to 
hold that title at Dickinson. Before 
that he was the dean of admissions for 
15 years. 
For a long period he was also the 

chairman of the department of psychol­ 
ogy and education and since 1957 he has 
held the Richard V. C. Watkins Chair 
of Education. During all this time he 
has taught at least one course. 
During the coming semester he will 

teach three courses including one called 
the Principles of Counseling and will 
supervise some student teachers. 
Dr. James came to the faculty in 

1941 to teach and help coach varsity 
sports teams. His services to education 
began in I 934 when he took a teaching 
position at the high school in Plymouth, 
Pa., upon graduating from Dickinson. 

"As an educator, the classroom was 
my first interest," says he. "I find 
myself impatient to devote full-time to 
it again." 
In 1963 Dr. James became Dickin­ 

son's first dean of students, responsible 
for all non-academic student affairs, 

track found that the old cinder track 
was 50 feet short of the standard 
quarter-mile oval.) 

For better utilization of space, the 
stands have been relocated. This and 
other changes made room for larger 
practice areas and five more all-weather 
tennis courts, for a total of 1 I. Lacrosse 
matches, formerly played on the foot­ 
ball field, will be moved to a recondi­ 
tioned area now the site of field hockey. 

Biddle Field, built in I 909 and con­ 
taining I 1 .5 acres, is a memorial to 
Herman Bosler Biddle, Class of 1903. It 
has local fame as the site of the welcome 
for Jim Thorpe on his triumphant return 

including housing, counseling, discipline, 
heal th services, student government, 
and extra-curricular activities. The 
deans of men and women, director of 
counseling, and all student advisers 
came under his supervision. 

Dr. James believes strongly in giving 
young people responsibility for their 
own behavior and stands with those 
educators who would give students a 
voice in decision making in all affairs 
of the college. 
Last October when Dr. James asked 

to be relieved of his responsibilities as 
dean of students in order to return to 
full-time teaching, Howard L. Ruben­ 
dall, president of the college, spoke 
highly of his services. 
"In his four-year tenure as dean of 

students," said the president, "Dr. 
James undertook for the college the 
arduous task of developing and im­ 
plementing a new approach to student 
affairs. 
"The college is grateful to have had 

the benefit of his leadership during 
these transitional years and, though 
reluctant to let him go, is sympathetic 
to his wish to teach full time." 
Prof. Harold R. Gillespie of the 

English department is the new dean of 
students at Dickinson, carrying also the 
title of assistant dean of the college. 
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from the 1912 Olympics as the decath­ 
lon champion. 
Thorpe was then a student at the old 

Carlisle Indian School here, now the site 
of the U. S. Army War College. For 
years Dickinson and Indian School 
teams held Wednesday football scrim­ 
mages on Biddle Field. 

For the past three years Biddle Field 
has been the pre-season training site for 
the Washington Redskins of the Na­ 
tional Football League. 

Plans for reconditioning the field were 
drawn up by McCloud & Scatchard, 
landscape architects. 



Letters 
Te> 

(And From) 

The 
Etlite>r 

Dear Jack: 

Your note was at hand when I re­ 
turned last weekend from my third 
swing through the Far East. Also, the 
brochure from D'son concerning the 
Ford Grant, and the plans for the future. 

You will be happy to know, I'm sure, 
that I mailed a small check to the Fund, 
so that you can keep the class participa­ 
tion record high. Actually, I have con­ 
tributed my bit the past two years 
more because I feel there is new life in 
D'son, than because I wanted to see a 
class record. My interest in D'son, 
Jack, is not renewed, rather I'd say it 
has been reborn. 
It is obvious to me, even from this 

distance (Col. Himes is stationed in 
Hawaii) and judging solely from the 
information received, that "Rube" has 
breathed a new life and a new approach 
into the College administration and to 
its objectives. I'm sure that he has been 
ably assisted by the present alumni 
keynotes, i.e. Sam Witwer, Jack Hoer­ 
ner, Milt Davidson and Jack Arndt, but 
since the changes evident to me stem 
from his assumption of office, I incline 
to believe his leadership must have been 
the prime mover. 
For sure, I am now very proud to tell 

one and all that I was once a part of the 
institution and this is a switch for me! 
Believe me, I'll make a reunion some 
year. Sincerely, 

Don Himes, '31 

(Editor's note.-J ohn C. Arndt, class 
agent for '31, was elated over this letter 
from Col. Himes and shared it with this 
office. We have seldom seen a Dickin­ 
soniari's case for his alma mater put so 
well. We were pleased to have Col. 
Himes' permission to print it.) 

From the Editor: 

A distinguished book award and a 
fellowship for a year's research abroad 
were received by Allan I. Ludwig, art 
historian on the Dickinson College 
faculty. (See Graven Images, reviewed 
in the Winter 1967 Alumnus.) 
The fellowship, from the prestigious 

American Council of Learned Societies, 
carried an $8 500 stipend and is' being 
used by Dr. Ludwig to further his 
research in medieval, renaissance and 
baroque tomb art in England, Ireland, 
Scotland, and Italy. 
He is spending the 1967-68 academic 

year in the British Isles seeking out the 
relationship of stonecarving there be­ 
tween A.D. 500 and 1750 to that in 
Puritan New England. 

Dr. Ludwig's book, "Graven Images: 
New England Stonecarving and Syrn. 

From the Editor: 

So you're confused! Capital Cam­ 
paign, The Dickinson Fund, Third 
Century Program, Annual Giving, Ford 
Challenge, The Malcolm Fellows! Sev­ 
eral uncoordinated fund-raising efforts? 
Not so, reports Evan Frey '59, veteran 
Director of Annual Giving. 
"Only two programs exist which 

differ in operation and objective," 
stated Frey. "One program is necessary 
to provide for current educational ex­ 
penses, the other for capital improve­ 
ments which are long overdue." Any 
existing confusion simply stems from 
the fact that Dickinson, unlike most 
other colleges and universities, hasn't 

bols, 16w-1815," represents the first 
serious attempt on a large scale to 
interpret the symbolic art of the tomb­ 
stone carver in Colonial America in 
relation to the development and tradi­ 
tions of American art. 
The profusely illustrated book, fruit 

of 10 years of research, has just won for 
the youthful author the 1967 Decorative 
Arts Book Award of the American Life 
Foundation. 
The judges in the award citation, 

noting that New England tombstone 
carvings are often works of art whose 
visual symbolism penetrates deep into 
Colonial life, said the book raises early 
stonecarving to a significant place in 
America's primitive art and contains 
new information on early American 
thought and institutions. 

had a special capital gifts drive since 
1949, and that many alumni are un­ 
familiar with concurrent drives organ­ 
ized by a singular institution. "Re­ 
ligious congregations generally operate 
in the same way to finance a building 
program," Frey added. "Long-term 
pledges are sought and payable along 
with a member's regular gifts for current 
operations." 
Asked how The Dickinson Fund (re­ 

ported next page) is related to the other 
program, Frey supplied the graphic 
explanation below which was of consid­ 
erable help to us. We thought it worth 
passing along. V.J.S. 

FORD FOUNDATION 
CHALLENGE CAMPAIGN 

$6,000,000 

I 
I I 

THE THIRD CENTURY 
DICKINSON FUND DEVELOPMENT PROGRAM 

for for 
Current Educational Capital Funds 

Expenses I I 
Alumni Annual Giving The Share Plan 
Parents Annual Giving 
Friends Annual Giving 

I 
John Dickinson Society 

Be.njamin Rush Associates 
Gilbert Malcolm Fellows 

IO 
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Fu ND 

1963-1967 
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1963-1967 
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1963-1967 

1965 
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President's Remarks 

TO OUR DICKINSON ALUMNI, 
PARENTS AND FRIENDS: 

The response to Annual Giving during 
this first year of our Ford Challenge en­ 
courages all of us on the campus. We are 
grateful not only for the funds received but 
for the heartening knowledge that you sup­ 
port Dickinson's desire to grow in quality 
and in service. 
We especially want to thank Jack Snyder, 

our General Chairman, for three years of 
leadership unmatched in Dickinson fund­ 
raising history. To bring Annual Giving to 
such a level during a separate drive for cap­ 
ital funds deserves the highest accolade. To 
Jack's co-workers and to our Parents Fund 
Chairmen, John Ferguson and Richard 
Smith, go our profound thanks. 
The appreciation of the College goes to 

the hundreds of volunteer workers among 
you who gave much time and made many 
con tacts to insure the success of the cam­ 
paign. 
We send to all of you our best wishes and 

the thanks of Dickinson. 

Chairman's Remarks 

Although I previously circulated a letter 
to my fellow alumni who participated in the 
1967 Dickinson Fund, I would like to express 
my appreciation again and extend thanks to 
the parents of our students and our many 
friends whose gifts enabled us to exceed our 
over-all fund goal of $240,000. 

During this period of sustained growth, 
Annual Giving carries more than ordinary 
importance for members of the Dickin~on 
family. In addition to earning match~ng 
funds from the Ford Foundation, our gifts 
bring the educational budget of our College 
into balance, thus providing a firm financial 
base on which to operate. 
This year's results reflect the combined 

efforts of a vast network of alumni, parents 
and friends. During the past three years, I 
have thoroughly enjoyed my contacts with 
these "minutemen" of higher education. 
Harry Zug '34 has agreed to assume the 

position of General Chairman for. the ye~rs 
1968--70. I sincerely hope you will all give 
Harry the same loyal support you have 
given me. 

IJ 



HONORARY 
A. Merrill Allyn 

967 ALUMNI RECORD 
Oler A. Bartley 

I 
Lee H. Bristol, Jr. GMF 
H. C. Byrd 
Theodore A. Distler 
C. P. Faller 
Paul Swain Havens GlvJF 

1966 1967 PARTICI- ANNUAL Francis H. Horn 
CLASS CHAIRMAN DONORS DONORS PATION GIVING Frank W. Montgomery GMF 

Edgar C. Powers 
Wilbour E. Saunders 

1897 I '$ 25.00 Leslie R. Severinghaus 
1900 2 2 2,100.00 Hugh Taylor GMF 

Richard N. Williams, 11 GMF 
1901 3 2 60.00 
1902 6 3 '120.00 
1903 6 5 181.00 1897 
1904 A. Haven Smith 4 4 163.00 William A. Jordan 
1905 6 5 245.00 
1906 Harry H. Nuttle 9 9 585.00 
1907 George M. Briner r6 17 37J.OO 1900 
1908 15 15 871.00 Andrew Ken GMF 
1909 9 7 165.00 Boyd Lee Spahr JDS 
1910 Henry Logan 22 22 1,638.00 
19!1 Karl K. Quimby I4 13 250.00 
1912 Mary Jenkins Adamson 17 20 r,67$.50 1901 
1913 Horace L. Jacobs, Jr. 15 18 366.00 Edwin F. Hann 
1914 Charles E. Wagner '27 '26 43% 3,705.50 Henry M. Lawrence 
1915 David M. Wallace 30 28 60% 1,653.50 
1916 A. Norman Needy 28 15 P.% 585.00 1902 1917 Robert L. Myers, Jr. 26 33 65% 4,903.50 
1918 Paul L. Hurchison] 32 41 75% 1;016.00 Mary Love Collins 
19r9 Lester Johnson 37 37 53% r,321.00 Dean M. Hoffman 

Warren N. Shuman GMP 
1920 Harry S. Benck 43 41 49% So8.oo 
1921 William M. Young 59 56 89<~ 2,182.00 
1922 Albert Berkey 36 40 53°0 2,337.50 1903 
1923 Evelyn Wardle 42 36 4t% r,6J6.oo ~~ftf.>':~~s Bostwick 1924 Horace E. Rogers 51 50 4t% 1,329.00 
1925 W. Irvine Wiest 44 40 3S% 945.00 Eva Dn Hadway 
1926 Helen Douglass Gallagher 53 53 39% 2,389.00 Edgar S. Everhart GMF 

In Memory of Elmer T. Grove 
1927 Charles F. Irwin 46 60 52% 2,937.50 Charles B. Nuttle 
1928 W. Reese Hitchens 49 57 47% 2,714.50 J. Roy Strock 
1929 James A. Strite sr 47 34~ 1,031.50 
1930 Edgar J. Kohnstamm 

~~ 
62 420(l 2,934.00 

1931 John C. Arndt, III 85 56% 3,324.74 1904 
193:! Joseph J. Myers 57 73 56% 4,402.22 Isabel Goldsmith Lowengard 
1933 Thomas V. Zug SL 58 39% 2,352.00 Ivo V. Otto GMF 

A. Haven Smith GMF, A 
r934 l\fax R. Lepofsky +8 SI 38% 4,823.24 William E. Webster 
1935 John J. Snyder 56 53 37% r,843.00 
1936 Lloyd S. Persun, Jr. 54 56 33% '2;063.50 
1937 Arthur R. Mangan 50 57 40% r,81+50 1905 
r938 Harry J. Nuttle 44 42 31% I ,'l.25 .oo Clarence Dumm 
1939 Austin W. Bittle 50 54 33% 3,644.50 Kent Nicodemus GMF 
r940 WilJi,un D. Boswell 6~ 53 38% I ,765.00 William H. Rogers GMF t 

Earl M. Roush 
1941 W. Richard Eshelman 51 35~ 1,186.00 Anna J. Spears 
1942 Svlvesrer S. Aichele 39 55 39010 2,011.00 
1943 j arnes M. McElfish 55 66 5 i~! 1,870.50 
1944 Paul Neff JO 40 34~ 651.00 1906 
1945 Wilma Barkalow Prescott 28 26 JO% 1,477.50 Edward E. Bohner GMF 
1946 Virginia Twyeffor t Weber 32 34 27% 803.00 Helen Smith Harris 
1947 Wilbert C. McKim, Jr. 50 50 38% 1,388.00 Roy N. Keis<~r 

Dayton E. McClain GMP 
1948 William F. Borda 73 74 33% 3,266.04 Harry H. Nut tle A 
1949 Thomas D. Caldwell, Jr. 67 74 29% 1,587.00 Delora Armstrong Pitman GMF 
r950 THeodore H. Ely 82 JOO 31% r,996.00 Rippey T. Sadler 

Harry M. Scarborough GMF 
.r951 Donald E. Piper 77 77 29% r,977.00 Nell B. Stevens 
1952 Paul E. Haines 84 94 35% 1,975.00 
1953 James H. Houser 64 71 29~ I ,106.50 
1954 Robert B. Cohen 74 77 30 0 1,397.00 1907 
1955 Albert L. Clark B8 90 33tp 1,247.50 Florence Ralston Belt A 
r956 Walter E. Beach 83 103 35% 1,376.50 George M. Briner A 
1957 William H. Houpt 97 ro5 42% 1,054.50 Arthur H. Brown 

Russell T. Davies 
1958 Barbara Mohler McIlvaine 70 86 35% 782.00 Charles B. Derick 
1959 F. Lee Shipman 102 l 10 39% 890.60 Edwin L. Haines 
1960 John J. Curley, Jr. 103 105 36% 889.50 Eva Cass J ahn 

Ada Filler Kennedy 
1961 Stanley W. Lindberg 100 151 50% 1,599.00 Leon A. Mcintire 
1962 Richard Tull 96 !22 41% 1,312.00 George W. Peffer 
1963 Jerry D. Bole 133 138 39% 1,352.00 Mary A. Ranck 

Lewie G. Rohrbaugh 
1964 Douglas R McPherson u9 126 :37% 1,129.00 Walter F. Shenton 
1965 Andrew Y. Rogers, Jr. 85 87 28% 812.30 Mabel Blair Slack 
1966 Bradley B. Geist 76 22% 746.50 Mary Hoover Steese 

Grace Hertzler Towers 
1970 l __ . __ 5.00 Wilson I). Wallis 

Totals 3305 3640 38% i106,37+64 
Honorary Alumni __ 7 ~ _ _6-15.00 

Total Alumni Giving 3312 3654 $107,049. 64 4-Ftrnd Volunteer 
[Deceased GMI"-··Gilbert Malcolm Fellow 

J DS-J oltn Dickinson Society 
BRA-Benjamin Rush Associate 
+Deceased 
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1908 
Lillian O. Brown 
Alice M. Clarkson 
Lida M. Ebbert 
Laura Harris Ellis 
Mary Leinbach Gill 
Maurice E. Heck 
Abram M. Hess 
J. Frank Jones 
Theodore C. Jones G}IIF 
Samuel B. Landis 
Annie R. O'Brien 
Newell W. Sawyer GMF 
Henry L. Seaman 
Helen Kisner Woodward GMF 
Hugh B. Woodward GMF 

1909 
Austin A. Banks 
W. Grier Briner 
Charles Langstaff 
J. Clair McCullough 
Benjamin W. McFarren 
Lillie Reese Smith 
Sadie Rothermel Super 

1910 
Albert M. Bean 
Walter V. Edwards 
Grace Fillet 
Lydia M. Gooding A 
Jacob H. Harnish 
Ira S. Huber 
Albert G. Judd 
C. R. Kelbaugh 
John M. Kinard 
W. Earl Ledden 
Magdalene Leinbach Leininger 
Henry Logan JDS. A. 
Marjorie L. Mcintire A 
Hewlings Mumper 
De Lancey S. Pelgrif't 
Harriet S. Poffenberger 
Charles H. Rawlins, Jr. 
Karl E. Richards 
E. Roger Samuel GMF' t 
Jeannette Stevens 
Mary Robley Vanneman 
Joseph S. Vanneman 

1911 
Victor H. Boell 
Charles S. Briner 
Rankin S. Caldwell 
Clara Smith Dodd 
Charles F. Kramer, Jr. 
Karl K. Quimby A 
Grace Strock Robbins 
Jane D. Shenton 
Ray Patton Smith GMF, A 
Helen Williamson Stuart 
Roy F. Stuart 
Howard E. Thompson 
Walter M. Tobias 

1912 
Mary Jenkins Adamson GMF, A 
William M. Beard GMF 
Charles C. Bramble 
Helen Garber Bouton 
Clarence A. Fry 
Edna M. Handwork 
John H. Hemphill 
Carrie Smith Hoffman 
Ruth Stuart Jenkins 
Jacob B. Leidig 
Elva Green McCune 
Marguerite Deatrick Mill er 
Robert E. Miller 
John E. Myers GMF 
Helen Carruthers Poteat 
Mary .E. Roberts 
Melinda Zang Row 
William M. Smith 
S. Walter Stauffer GMF 
Glenn E. Todd JDS 

1913 
Anonymous 
Jessie Gruber Beard 
Edith Rinker Bramble 
Milton Conover 
Elizabeth M. Garner 
Aubrey B. Goudie 
John Groome 
Joseph Z. Hertzler 
Horace L. Jacobs, Jr. GMF, A 
Martha L. Johnson 
Julia Delavan Luise 
W. Alexander McCune GMF 
John V. Mcintire 
Elda Park McKeown 
Cecil W, Peeples 
Mary B. Robinson 
Hyman Rockmaker 
Clarence M. Spangler 

Director's Remarks 

about this report 

Only gifts and grants directly received by 
The Dickinson Fund and available for cur­ 
rent educational expenses are reflected in this 
report. Gifts to Dickinson's separate capital 
campaign, special purpose gifts and gifts-in­ 
kind will be recognized in separate publica­ 
tions. 
A number of new symbols appear this year 

with which you will want to be familiar. In 
addition to our GMF (Gilbert Malcolm 
Fellow) designation which recognizes the 
donor of a gift of $100 or more, we have 
added the designations BRA (Benjamin 
Rush Associate) and JDS (John Dickinson 
Society) to recognize those who make annual 
unrestricted gifts of $500 or more and $r ,ooo 
or more respectively. The letter A, of which 
there are over six hundred, denotes those 
alumni who served in a volunteer capacity. 
During the clerical operations involved in 

accurately listing our 4500 contributors, and 
despite preventive measures) it is likely 
errors occurred. If you note a mistake, 
please accept our apology; then inform The 
Dickinson Fund so that the official records 
may be corrected. 
We are deeply grateful for your interest 

and support which makes such a positive 
report possible. 
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1914 
Lester W. Auman 
Marie Niesley Bamitz 
Rachael S. Beam 
Ruth H. Bigham GMF 
Frank C. Bunting 
Donald W. Carruthers, Sr. 
Joel Claster JDS 
Charles C. Cole A 
George C. Dietz GMF 
Carlyle R. Earp GMF, A 
Thomas H. Ford GMF 
.E. Harold Frantz GMF 
Cora L. Handwork 
Frank V. Jaggers 
Leslie M. Karper 
Margaret Thompson McAnney 
Fred L. Mohler 
Harriet Stuart Mohler 
Samuel L. Mohler 
Adam A. Nagay 
William H. Robinson 
Emory Rockwell 
Mary Coyle VanSiclen 
Charles E. Wagner A 
Clyde M. Williams GMF 
Maude E. Wilson 

1915 
Margaret Bream Baxter 
Arthur A. Bouton 
David R. Coffman 
William W. Edel 
William L. Eshelman GMF, A 
G. Winifred Evans 
Foster H. Fanseen 
Hyman Goldstein GMF 
Roberta Reiff Gracey 
Eva Peters Ha1111ing 
Lester S, Hecht ,a 
Katherlne M. Hodgson 
J. Frank Hollinger GMF 
Elizabeth Howard 
Margaret Day Jones 
Walter W. Kistler A 
H. H. Lippincott 
Robert R. McWhinney 
J. Lother Neff 
Helen B. Neyhard 
Irene C. Ritchey 
J. Ohrurn Small 
Roger K. Todd 
David M. Wallace BRA, A 
Howard B. Warren 
Stanley G. Wilson 
G. Floyd Zimmermann 
Ethel Wagg Zimmermann 

1916 
Amelia Wiener Blumenfeld 
Olga Meloy Carter 
Robert L. Ganoe 
F. Leslie Hart 
Paul W. Heck 
Samuel H. Hoff GMF 
Thomas R. Jeffrey 
A. Norman Needy GMF, A 
Perry F. Prather 
J. Frank Puderbaugh GMF 
Arthur M. Reeves 
Herbert S. Reisler 
Pierce Shope 
Clark L. Van Auken 
Anna Shuey Whiting 

1917 
Ralph M. Bashore .BRA, A 
Fred P. Corson GMF 
Michael F. Davis ,1 
Jasper Deeter 
William M. Dougherty 
Paul M. Dutko 
Mervin G . .Eppley GJl.fF 
Francis H. S. Ede GMF 
Max Hartzell GMF, A 
In Memory of George Hering 
Florence Baker Hutchison GMF •. 4 
Mar ie Wagner Johnson 
Helen B. Jones 
Margaret McMillan Keith GMF, A 
Earl C. Lyon A 
Mary Dougherty MacGregor 
Gordon M. Marks 
Douglass S. Mead GMF, .4. 
Nora M. Mohler CMF 
Miriam Evans Morgan .4 
Samuel L. Mumma 

A-Fund Volunteer 
(;MF····Gilbert Malcolm Fellow 
JDS-John Dickinson Society 
.B.R,1-Benjamin Rush Associates 

+Deceased 



ROBERT L. MYERS, JR. 
Class of 1917 
Improvement 

in Funds Raised 
600% 

Robert L. Myers, Jr. GMF, A 
Charles R. Nicklas GMF 
Milton R. Priddis 
Homer M. Respess A 
Clarence L. Shollenberger, Jr. 
Cecilia M. Shumpp 
John M. Stevens 
Albert Strite BRA 
Gaither P. Warfield CMF. A 
Edwin D. Weinberg JDS 
Robert E- Woodward CMF, .4. 
Elizabeth Meck Young 

1918 
Frank R. Adams 
Raymond D. Adams 
J. Murray Barbour 
Charles F. Berkheimer 
Harold H. Bixler GMF 
Margaret May Bixler 
Howard R. Breisch 
Harold St. C. Carter 
M. Mabel Clark A 
Mervin G. Coyle GMF 
Hazel Sanford Davies A 
Ruth H. Eslinger 
M. Clare Filler 
Mary E. Glenwright 
In memory of M. Wilson Harris 
Ruth R. Hemminger 
W. Jackson Holtainger 
Paul L. Hutchison A t 
Lillian M. Kell A 
George C. Kerr A 
Mildred Price Lee A 
Elva R. Lippi 
James H. McNeal A 
Nell H. Marvil A 
Earle L. Mortimer 
John M. Pearson A 
Harper A. Price 
Jesse W. Probst 
Merle L Protamatr] 
Clark D. Read 
M. Marie Ritts 
Herbert K. Robinson A 
Eleanor Craine Slutzker 
Elizabeth E. Smith 
Constance Springer Trees 
John F. Walters 
J. David Weidenhafer 
Lester A. Welliver 
Seymour R. Willits 
Iva Fisher Yoos 

1919 
Edna Eppley Bagenstose 
David M. Balentine 
Kathryn Bowes Berquist 
Cornelius V. Bubb 
L. Esther Caufman 
Caroline Hatton Clark GMF, A 
M. Clare Coleman 
Evelyn Brokaw Cook 
Charles E, Davis A 
Elizabeth Schel linger Douglass 
Isabel K. Endslow 
Sylvester M. Evans+ 
John W. Garrett 
Ruth Kruger George GMF 
Beatrice Carrnitche l l Gertz 
Margaret Spotts Hall 
Benjamin F. Haws 
Elma M. Houseman 
George E. Johnson 

Lester F. Johnson A 
Mary Sche!linger Laning A 
Catharine E. Lobach GMF 
Edwin B. Long 
Urie D. Lutz GM'F 
William E. Matthews 
Robert E. Minnich A. 
Rowan C. Pearce 
Ruth Fisher Rhoads 
Ethel Ginter Skillen A 
Ruth Niesley Spare 
Ralph B. Spare 
Mariette Holton Stitzel A 
Fayette N. Talley 
Edward B. Tustin 
C.R. Willis 
Ada Bacon Wilson 
Helen L. Witmer 

1920 
Sadie Mindlin Aron 
Herbert P. Beam 
Alma Long Bittner 
Helen Purvis Blew 
Anna Pearson Brubaker A 
George H. Burke 
A. Todd Coronway 
Amy Brobst Douglass 
Allen B, L. Fisher 
Howard S. Fitzgerald 
Howard S. Fox 
A. Harland Greene 
Jean Chalfant Gwynne 
Edna Moyer Hand 
Walter E. Harnish 
Harry S. Henck A 
Acnes Hart Hoguet 
William S. Kehl 
Edna Morgan Kessler 
George G. Landis GMF 
Hazel Landsberry .4 
Edgar P. Lawrence 
Mary Bagenstose Mead A 
Edgar R. Miller GMF, A 
Ralph L. Minker 
Carl P. Obermiller 
Geraldine Zimmerman Obermiller 
Katherine Obermiller 
Mildred Conklin Page 
Charles A. Robinson 
Helen Nixon Sanderson 
Mary Davis Shockey 
Elwood W. Stitzel 
Harold H. Suenderj 
Eleanor Yeaworth Welliver 
Joseph J. Wertacnik A 
Albert E. Weston 
Edna Brurnbauzh Williams 
Mildred Weir Woodward 
Ralph L. Young 

1921 
J _ Harrington Barrus 
Frank G. Black 
Edward G. Brame 
William E. Bretz 
Alice Schwab Bryant A 
Evelyn Carr Chapin 
John G. Cornwell 
Stanley B. Crosland 
J. Fenton Daugherty A 
Herbert L. Davis GMF 
Nora Lippi Davis GMF 
George Doehne, III 
Mildred Harvey Foster 
Franklin A. Gray 
Horace B. Hand 
Margaret Wingeard Hocker A 
Anna Oakes Hoffman 
William H. Holloway 
C. Wendell Holmes GMF, A 
Kathleen LeFevre Horner 
Ruth Fasick Huller 
Sarah McCrea Jones BR.A, A 
Romer L. Kreider GMF 
Edward G. Latch 
Mary R. Learned 
Walter C. Lippert A 
Trazo vV. Lloyd 
Mildred Masonheimer Long 
John A. Lorimer 
Harvey M. Miller 
Grace Deitz Miller 
Martha Webster Moore 
John F. Morgenthaler GMF, A 
Mary Phillips Norman 
Marv Wilson Raub 
Calvin B. Rentschler GMF 
Edwin B. Rentschler 
Ethel Riker Rickenbacher 
Reba Beam Robinson 
Louise Finch Saves 
Harry W. Seabold 
Wilda S. Shope 
Milton J_ Skeath 
J. Pa11l Slaybaugh 
Malcolm JV!. Steck 
Mc Kinley H. Stevens 
Goodell W. Stroup 

Mildred Starner Taylor GMF 
Charles H. Thomas (;MF 
David W. Thompson 
Anthony F. Vitoritto GMF 
Paul R. Walker A 
Mary Hurlbert Waters 
Albert L. Wentworth 
William M. Young GMF, A 
Ethel Eisenhour Zweifel 

1922 
Katharine Patterson Beam 
Albert Berkey GMF, A 
Gladys Guyet Berkheimer 
Agnes Albright Brown GMF, A 
Ruth E. Brumbaugh 
Max R. Brunstetter 
Stanley J. Folrnsbee 
Lewis D. Gottschall 
Herbert W. Glassco A 
Mildred Burkholder Hamsher 
Clifton C. Hartman 
Ruth Dotter Heilbron GMF, A 
Cyril J. Hoover 
Ruth Herh Kehoe A 
Anna Place Klernmer 
Harry D. Kruse A 
Edith Robinson Leslie 
Winfield H. Loban 
Mary Place Lockwood 
Walter C. Merkel 
Harold S. Merwin 
Mary E. Noaker 
John B. Peters JDS. A 
W. Albert Ramey 
Elizabeth Bratton Reynolds GMF, A 
Helen Stott Rupp GMF, A 
Reuben L. Sharp 
Marcella Zoretskie Simms 
F. Clark Skellv 
JVJ vra Shearer ·smith 
Frances Horner Smythe 
Harry L. Stearns 
James C. Steen, Sr. A 
Helen Strayer Swank 
James F. Tustin 
Harry N. Waldman A 
C. Elizabeth Watts 
Helen M. Wehrle 
Mary K. Wetzel 
DeWitt D. Wise 

1923 
Albert L. Baner 
Mary Peterman Bare 
James E. Brackbill 
Robert W. Crist 
Elizabeth M. DeMaris 
Margaret Eslinger 
Mary E. Frankenberry 
Dorothy Line Garrett 
Webster C. Herzog A 
Florence M.A. Hilbish 
Edith G. Hoover 
Ivy M. Hudson 
S. Elizabeth Jones 
Harold W. Keller GMF, A 
Alta M. Kimmel A 
Virgil M. Knowles A 
Esther Leeds 
Ruth Booty Lins 
Janet E. Loy 
William K. McBride 
Elizabeth Bucke Miller GMF 
Stanford V.l. Mulholland GMF 
Charles I. Richard 
E. Cranston Rigg in 
Guy F. Rolland 
Harold K. Scheirer 
Williaro C. Schultz, Jr. GMF, A 
Lillian Mindlin Semel 
Helen E. Shaub 
C. Asbury Smith 
Carl B. Stoner A 
Morris E. Swartz, Jr. 
Mary Line Todd GMF 
Guy E. Waltman GMF 
Evelyn Wardle GMF, A 
Mary Garland Wark A 

1924 
Joseph S. Bender 
Lulu Tobias Boag 
Pan! R. Burkholder CMF 
Charles \V. Burn A 
Mary S. Dubson 
Norman M. Eberly 
Joseph R. Embery, Jr. 
Robert E. Faddis 
Gladys Cooner Fenimore 
M. 'Elizabeth Filler A 
Edward J. Gayner, III GMF 
Flo Geyer 
Thelma E. Greene 
Henrietta Bardo Gufftck A 
Evelvn Nailor Hamilton A 
Elizabeth Crawford Hench 
F- LaMont Henninger A 
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Hugh K. Johnston 
Marion C. Keen 
Janet A. Kelley 
J. Norman Klein 
Sidney D. Kline GMF 
Zada Branstetter Knickerbocker 
Charles Kutner 
Esther Riegel Long 
Isadore B. Lyon 
Charles J. Markle 
Ammon L. Miller GMF 
Ruth Jones Minker 
Rose Buckson Moore 
Elvin Clay Myers 
Ruth Bortz Raiford A 
Newton E. Randolph 
Floyd Rinker GMF 
Horace E. Rogers A 
Margaret Paul Sawyer A 
Walter H. E. Scott 
Mary Chambers Sharp 
Viola Witmer Shettel 
Paul J. Smith 
Naomi Michael Snoke 
Helen Wilson Spatz 
E. Laurence Springer 
Harold L. Stewart 
Elizabeth Morgan Stone 
Dorothy Buch Swartz 
Jane Hagerty Thorn 
Virginia Watts .4 
Milton L. Weston 
Charles T. Wilson 

1925 
Mary E. Baum 
Ann Bennett Bennethum 
Erma Porteus Brock 
Mary Thomas Brougher 
Frances Worstall Brunstetrer+ 
Katherine Smith Carpenter 
G. Custer Cromwell 
Vvl'-. Lynn Crowding 
George M. Davey A 
Frank J. Goodyear. Jr. 
Dorothy Valiant Grater 1l 
William R. Gullick 
John M. Hamilton 
Gladys B. Heim 
A. Witt Hutchison 
Elizabeth Hann Kirby 
Michael KiYko 
Eleanor B. Klemm 
Herbert F. Laise 
Jacob A. Long A 
Norman W. Lvon 
Walter 1). Mc Cahan A 
George '""- Meyer Floyd A. Mlncemover] 
Jcsenh A. Nacrel li A 
Rankin A. Nebinger 
C. Norris Rabold GMF 
Donald G. Remley 
Paul Schuchart 
J_ Mahlon Selby 
Helen Weiner Smethurst 
Andrew J_ Smith A 
Herbert A. Solenberzer 
Amanda Wcrcr. Soule 
Florence C. Speck G'MF 
Carola Learned Stuckenrath 
Norman R. Wagner 
Charles L. Warren 
W. Irvii1e Wie<t CMF, A 
Clyde E. Williamson 

1926 
George H. Armacost A 
Helen Apoleby Arnold A 
Dorothy Willits Balch 
Mary Leinhach Baldwin 
Francis C. Bayley 
Nevin L. Bitner (;MF 
Harrv L. Bush 
Clyde E. Carpenter 
Lollis Cohen 
Clarence A. Cover 
Ralph 0. Evans 
Alvin A. Fry 
Helen Dou;:do.'8 Gallagher A 
George A. Groff 
Janet Hannan Hartzell A 
Rov T. Henwoo<\ 
Kathryn Meck Hergenrother 
Robert. D. lT olfaommer 
Charles P. Hov 
Solomon litirwitz 
Jane Prior Jaeger 
Kenneth S. Jones 
Myrtle R. Keeny 

A·~·-·Fund Volunteer 
GMF-Gilbc'rt Malcolm Fellow 
JDS-John Dickinson Society 
l)[(,1-----Benjamin Rush AsB~ciate 
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Florence H. Long 
John W. McKelvev A 
Georgia Krall McMullen 
Elizabeth Madore 
John P. Milligan GMF 
Maurice Montgomery 
Ruth Taylor Myers 
Evelyn L. Naylor A 
Mary Read Oerther 
Mary Koller Peters JDS 
Ruth Teitr ick Rarchman 
Mildred Huston Renfrew 
William G. Rice A 
Herbert M. Ridgely 
J. Milton Rogers 
Anne Hoyer Rupp 
Charles F. Sampson 
In Memory of Earl Schroeder 
Leslie J. Schwalm A 
Wilhelm E. Shissler 
John E. Shoop 
Alma Moyer Sieck 
Flora W. Smiley 
Roger H. Steck A 
Margaret S. Steele 
Joseph S. Stephens 
Isabel Ward Warren 
Emma Brenneman Weaver Grv.fF 
Harry Winfield 
Robert E. Woodside GMF, A 

1927 
Rolland L. Adams JDS 
Paul C. Be Hanna GMF 
Helen Bowser Biscoe 
Willard E."Bittle 
John S. Bowman 
Marv A. Brightbill 
Kathryn Coulter Brougher GMF, A 
Reba Scott Burrows 
Elizabeth Wetzel Cover 
Velva Diven Daihl 
Dorothy Sponsler Dymond 
Ruth M. Evans 
Alfred C. Fray 
Thomas R. Gallagher GMF, A 
Mary Rombach Gray 
Eugenia Corson Halliday 
Nora Shenk Harman 
V. Rae Heim 
Edgar A. Henry 
Isabelle R. Hoover 
Charles F. Irwin, Jr. A 
Eleanor Mc Crone Jones 
G. Harold Keatley GMF 
.Merle L. Keim 
Norman F. Keller 
Margaret Armstrong 
Kirkpatrick GJ\llF 

Gertrude E. Klemm 
Leona Barkalow Kline GMF. A 
F. Eugene Klinger 
Harry M. Leonard 
J ohn Wesley Lord 
Martin F. Miller A 
Henry W. Monyer A 
J. Frederic Moore A 
Ruth Ely Nicholson 
Thelma Atkinson Obert 
Margaret McCrea Olinger 
Kenneth R. Perinchief 
Burton L. Pinkerton 
Moordeen Plough 
Jean Morris Partmann 
Charles L. Raver 
Samuel Ressetar 
Louise Patterson Rowland 
Walter A. Schlegel 
Fred J. Schmidt 
William M. Sheaffer 
Harry W. Shenk GMF 
Walter P. Shuman 
Lois Horn Silver 
Elvin R. Sirnmill 
Alvah C. Small 
Brewster B. Stearns 
George E. Steigerwald 
Catherine Ober Stephens 
Harold B. Stuart 
Anna Coover Thompson 
W. Robert Thompson (;MF 
Frances L. Willoughby A 

1928 
Ru pert G. Appleby 
Victor F. Baiz GMF 
Ravmond M. Bell 
Pamela McWilliarns Berglund 
Claude C. Bowman 
Dorothv Ritter Bowman 
Bernard E. Burr 
Robertson Cameron 
Dorothy E. Chamberlain A 
Christopher T. Crook 
Marguerite Evans Crook 
John A. Dempwolf 
Chauncey M. Depuy 11 
Earl A. Forsythe 
Theodore C. Frederick 

Carl W. Geiger GMF 
Mary P. Goodyear 
Thomas C. Graham 
Joseph E. Green, II GMF 
Mary Smith Gurney 
Victor B. Hann A 
Dorothy E. Harpster A 
Albert E. Hartman A 
W. Reese Hitchens GMF, A 
Mildred E. Hull 
Henry G. Kiessel 
Ralph S. Krouse 
Mildred F. Laird 
Samuel Lichtenfeld A 
Elizabeth Rogers Littman 
Louise A. Loper 
Raymond A. Lumley A 
Donald J. Mcintyre 
M. Kennard Markley 
Arthur Markowitz 
Helen Hackman Martin 
F. Douglas Milbury 
Benjamin 0. Nelson A 
Paul D. Olejar 
Christopher N. Peditto 
Jessie E. Poticher 
Margaret Slaughter Reese 
Lillian Rhoads Rimby 
Minerva Bernhardt Rude 
Janet Forcey Schwartz GMF, A 
John T. Shuman 
Walter Sidoriak 
Elisabeth Cloud Silver GMF 
Charles E. Smith 
William R. Smith JDS 
Fred E. Sweely A 
Lufay A. Sweet 
J. Elwood Taylor 
Charles F. Wahl 
Howard M. Wert 
Fairlee Habbart Woodside 
Clare Yoder 
Richard V. Zug 

1929 
Nathan Asbell 
Aubrey H. Baldwin, III 
Harlan L. Baxter 
Lydia B. Betts 
Donald K. Bonney 
Hester Cunningham Boss 
C. Richard Brandt GMF 
D. Perry Bucke 
C. Perry Cleaver 
Elizabeth McCoy Cryer A 
Mary Everett Dolbear 
Rosana Eckman A 
Louis G. Fetterman 
Paul A. Friedrich A 
Elmer 0. Goodwin 
Velma Roth Gordon 
Margaret Craver Grimm 
Vernard F. Group 
Kenneth E. Heagy 
Clarence F. Johnston 
Edwin G. Kephart 
Janet Smith Kingsley 
Bernice Barkalow Kirk 
John Kivko 
Harold C. Koch 
David S. Kohn 
Fred A. Lumb GMF 
John W. McConnell 
John G. Martenson 
Paul R. Moyer 
Paul B. Myers A 
Foster B. Perry 
James M. Read 
Richard H. Rouse 
Jesse B. Rubright 
Stanley H. Shirk 
Sara Lehr Stegmeier 
W. Russell Straw 
Frances Yingst Stringer 
James A. Strite A 
Warren L. Templin 
Marie Ammons Timmins 
Horace W. Vought 
W. Donald Whetsel 
R. Wallace White 
Helen Laird Winkler ;1 
Francis J. Yetter 
David M. Zall 

1930 
George W. Atkins 
Joseph P. Atkins 
Virginia Blinn Baiz 
Russell K. Baldwin 
Richard U. Bashor GMF 
Jennings B. Beam 
Frances Comly Bear 
William S. Bender 
John F. Berger 
Harry A. Berkheimer GMF 
Harold G. Bigley 
Elizabeth Berger Brown 
C. Lincoln Brown, Jr. 
John G. Cipko 
Lenore Cisney 

Dorothy Gress Dougherty 
Winifred Smith Drawbaugh 
Tobias H. Dunkelberger 
James M. Etchison 
James S. Feight 
William F. Graden 
Alice E. Hackman 
Catherine Porter Hallock 
Walter D. Heckman 
Evelyn Kinter Herritt 
Edward Hoberman GMF 
Raymond N. Hoffman 
Margaret N. Horner 
Katherine Morris Hoy 
William L. Johns 
Alfred 0. Keedy, Jr. 
John F. Kelso 
Eleanor M. Kent 
Harold A. Kline 
Frances Robinson Klinger 
Robert E. Knupp 
Edgar J. Kohnstamrn GMF, A 
Florence Shaw Kraeuter 
Edward S. Kronenberg 
Ray H. Lyon 
Miriam Horst Middleton 
Jesse Ruhl Miller 
Samuel H. Myers 
James K. Nev ling 
James E. Nolen 
Lee A. Pritchard GMF 
Elizabeth Eckard Robichaud 
Lewis H. Rohrbaugh 
Eleanor James Schneider 
William C. Schultz, Jr. 
Maurice Shaffer .BRA 
Ralph A. Sheetz 
C . Melvin Shields 
Elsie Ferriss Shuman 
Paul Smith 
Elinor Green Spencer 
Russell S. Stine 
Frank A. Suffoletta GMF 
Bessie Baker Whitman 
Willis W. Willard, Jr. 
Samuel W. Witwer JDS 

1931 
George W. Adams 
Frank W. Ake A 
W. Burg Anstine A 
John C. Arndt, III GMF, A 
Harry K. Aurand t 
Florence Reifle Bahr 
Herbert A. Baron 
Alfred R. Bax 
S. Catherine Bell 
Llewellyn R. Bingaman GMF 
Evelyn Mountz Bonney 
Sherwood M. Bonney GMF 
Evelyn Groves Boohar 
Kenneth R. Boohar 
Eleanor Lehman Bowman 
Dorothy A. Bryan A 
Flora Lynch Burns A 
Richard A. Cartmell A 
J. La'Verne Casner 
Robert L. D. Davidson A 
Minnie Dando Davis 
Harry F. Davis GMF 
Thomas D. Davis 
Robert E. Dawson 
Joseph R. W. Dodge A 
Wilton J. Dubrick 
Frank M. Durkee 
George B. Elliott A 
Mark M. Evans A 
Milton E. Flower 
Alice M. Folsom 

JOHN C. ARNDT, III 
Class of 1931 

Clark M. Forcey 
Sara Lukens Gayner 
Lewis '.F. Gayner GMF 
Robert G. Greenawalt GMF 
Raymond W. Hallman A 
Alfred Hartman 
Jeannette Burgyes Hays 
Charles Hedges 
Elizabeth Brown Heitsman 
Donald S. Himes 
Nancy Reese Hinckley 
John M. Hoerner JDS 
Harry B. Hogemyer 
Hennry S. Hutton GMF 
William S. Jenkins GMF 
Laura Crull Johnson 
Kathryn Armstrong Julstedt 
Janet Rogers Landis A 
J. Boyd Landis 
Gladys B. LeFevre 
Herman L. Levin 
August L. Lorey 
Vera Morris Loveland 
Mary L. Loy A 
George R. McCahan GMF 
Sarah F. McDonald 
Nancy Horner Machtley 
Mariorie Ekholm Metrick 
Charles M. Moyer 
Amelia LeFevre Nichols 
Frances Keefer Nicodemus 
George R. Nye 
Robert T. Patterson 
Adelaide Markley Rishel 
Robert 0. Rupp A 
Howard L. Rubendall CMF 
Patience Hartman Shomock 
Joseph J. Shornock 
Calvin H. Shultz A 
Marion Baker Snyder GMF 
Henry A. Spangler 
Beatrice Loper Stackhouse 
H . .M. Stutzman 
Henry B. Suter 
Leonard J. Timms 
Roy D. Tolliver A 
Sidney Ullman 
Richard H. Wagner A 
Raymond G. Walker A 
Melvin L. Whitmire 
Sara Whitcomb Wightman 
Agues Esbenshade Willard 
Prudence Shultzabarger Wolfe 
Elinor Dilworth Zeiter 

1932 
. Martha E. Adams 
Leon J. Arrnalavage GMF 
Albert H. Aston 
Lowell M. Atkinson 
Grant W. Bamberger GMF 
George P. Bear A 
.May Jarrett Beaver 
Matilda Nogt Booth 
Priscilla Charles Bradley A 
WiI1field C. Cook JDS 
Raymond B. Counsellor 
.Mary Oswald Cox 
Ruth Crathwohl Coyle 
Francis P. Davis 
Savilla Bonham Davis 
Arthur R. Day, Jr. 
Ruth Mumaw Engel l 
John B. Farr 
Marion Darragh Faucett A 
M. George Feingold A 
Albert W. Freeman 
Jane Hoffman Hammond 
John A. Hartman, Jr. 

Tied for Division Honors 
Participation: 56% 

JOSEPH J. MYERS 
Class of 1932 
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Herbert A. Heerwagcn G}vlF, .4 
W. Gordon Helsel 
George Hires, Ill 
David S. Holbrook GMF 
William E. Holley 
John H. Hopkins 
Albert Houck A 
A. Emerson Howell 
Seymour Hurwitz 
Robert Lee Jacobs ,[ 
Helmuth W. Joel 
Edward E. Johnson 
Howard E. Kennedy 
Abram G. Kurtz A 
Annabel Rice Lower 
John R. Maddox 
George E. Mark GJ1F 
George M. Markley G"!Y!F 
Ruth Blackwell Marshell 
Frank S. Moser 
Ida Hurwitz Mossovitz 
Charles E. Myers GMF 
Joseph J. Myers GlvlF, A 
R. Donald Ness 
Fayne L. Newlin 
J. Wesley Oler 
Meyer P. Potamkin GMF, A 
Mary Chronister Rhein 
Edward K. Rishel 
Frederick F. Rush 
Dorothy Badders Schlegel 
William W. Shaw 
Robert Siegel 
Betty Walker Skelton 
George M. Sleichter 
Lucille Blackwell Smith 
Boyd Lee Spahr. Jr. BRA. A 
Frederick R. Stegrneier 
J. \Villiam Stuart BRA 
Helen Stover Stuart 
Esther Chambers Teller 
Stephen Teller 
John J. Teti 
Frank J. Valentine 
Robert A. Waidner GMF 
Mary Grove Wenzel 
Raymond A. Wert 
Sara Rohrer West 
Richard H. Zeigler 

1933 
William P. Billow CMF 
Florence Miller Bricker 
Thomas L. Brooks 
Edwin M. Buchen CMF 
Henry l\L Buckingham A 
Lilian Baker Carlisle 
Fred E. Crosley ;l 
John F. Crow 
John B. Daugherty GMF 
John Milton Davidson CMF. A 
David E. Detweiler 
Frances Yard Fox 
Elizabeth Basset Geyer A 
Gladys Horning Gotwalt 
Mary L. Heckman .4 
Cyril F. Hetsko 
Joseph G. Hildenberger 
Mary Bate Holland 
Gertrude Barnhart Holman 
Doris Brandt Houck GMF 
George M. Houck CMF 
Mary L. Hoy 
Jesse J. Hymes CMF 
Robert W. Ingraham 
Emma Shawfield Jacobs 
E. Huber Jessop 
Dorothy Carl Kennedy 
Frederick A. Klemm A 
James Knight 
Roy R. Kuebler, Jr. 
Joseph F. Lipinski 
C. David McNaughton 
Hugh J. Mac Cotter 
Clarence E. Miller 
Helen Dickey Morris 
Marie Moore Myers 
Ida Gillis Palmer 
Robert E. Porteous 
Everett B. Post 
A. James Reeves 
Thomas F. Reilly 
Lucretia Heisey Shroat 
Leon R. Sloan A 
Hilburt Slosberg 
Charles W. Smith CMF 
John S. Snyder GMF 
William A. Snyder 
Christian C. F. Spahr GlvlF. A 
Robert G. Taylor 11 
Craig R. Thompson 
Milton Unger 
Hugo E. Vivadelli 
De Haven C. Woodcock 
J. Donald Woodruff 
Gertrude A. Yeager 
Gerald L. Zarfos G!vlF 

.Mildred Smith Zeigler 
Thomas V. Zug .4 

1934 
Elizabeth Pyles Aston 
Edgar N. Beers 
M. Elinor Betts 
John W. Bieri CMF 
Robert L. Bloom 
Ann Morris Blumenthal 
Sydney D. Brener 
Hazel le Allen Brooks 
\V. Howard Brown 
Wesley H. Day 
Helen Baker Emlet 
Lester T. Etter CMF 
Philip D. Fagans, Jr. 
Elizabeth Billow Faller 
Nelson H. Frank A 
Bertha Lynch Gladeck 
Fred C. Gladeck, Jr. 
Earl R. Handler 
George A. Hansell. Jr. 
S. Elizabeth Hess 
Harry E. Hinebauch 
Priscilla '.\lcConnell Hinebauch 
Abraham Hurwitz G_!,JF 
Benjamin D. James 
Thomas F. Lazarus CMF 
Thomas S. Lehman 
Max R. Lepofsky GMF, ,1 
Katherine Loder 
Ruth Royer McKean 
Paul A. Mangan A 
Francis R. Manlove CMF 
John C. Nebo 
Margaret Davis O'Keefe 
G. Wesley Pedlow, Jr. .TDS 
Willis T. Porch, Jr. 
Barbara Rynk Reynolds 

James L. Mcintire 
Donald K. Mcintyre 
Kathleen Rickenbaugh MacCampbell 
Edith M. Machen 
R. Gilbert Mannino 
Helen Jackson Martin 
Frank C. Matthews 
Harold M. Missal 
Andrew J. Oyler 
William H. Quay CMF 
George E. Reed A. 
Louis Reuter, Jr. 
William B. Rosenberg GMT'. A 
Virginia Fickes Rowe 
George H. Sacks 
Walter A. Shuman 
Delbert B. Sl ivinske 
Margaret Martin Sloane 
Albert E. Smigel 
John J. Snyder BRA, A 
Ruth Shawfield Spangler 
R. Edward Steele BRA. A 
Lena Ri tner Stover 
Frederick W. Turner 
G. Bruce Wagner 
Robert D. Wavne 
Elizabeth S. Williams A 

1936 
William Ackerman CMF 
Isabel Byers Binder CMF 
Leonard R. Blumberg GMF. A 
D. Owen Brubaker A 
Virginia Clark Chilton 
Raymond L. Clark 

THE LEADERS 
THE ToP FrvE-ANNUAL G1vING 

1917 $4,903 
1934 $4,823 
1932 $4,402 
1914 $3,705 
1939 $3,644 

Frieda Brown Shortlidge A 
Hershel E. Shortlidge 
Richard L. Shroat 
Spencer B. Smith 
Wilhelmina LaBar Smith 
Harvey M. Stuart GM F 
Emma Wentzel Toth A 
Philip S. Van Hook 
Duane M. Van'Wegen 
Harriet Crist Wert 
Luther M. Whitcomb CMF 
David A. Wilson, Jr. A 
R. F. Lee Wolf 
William R. Woodward 
Harry C. Zug .TDS. A 

1935 
Robert Bartley 
Herman Belopolsky c,up 
Sidney W. Bookbinder CMF 
Dorothy Shearer Briner A 
William C. Clarke, Jr. 
Bernadette DeFalco Day 
Sidney Denho 
Marv A. Duncan 
Dorothy L. Edwards A 
Logan B. Emlet 
Edward C. First, Jr. CMF 
Paul G. Fleischer 
Anthony J. Gianforti .4 
Fred II. Green, Jr. 
Alfrieda Keller Hansell 
W. Wells Hoover 
George V. Hudimatch A 
James Banks Hudson, Jr. A 
Helen Singer Idle 
Raymond E. Kaufman 
Ralph P. Kinzey 
Jean Black Lange 
Alberta Schmidt Leech 
J. Knowlton Leech 
Mary Handshaw Lindsey 
Richard A. Lindsey 
Lois Eddy McDonnell 

Elizabeth Goodyear Clarke 
William H. Dodd A 
Elizabeth Wittfoot Donaldson 
0. Herman Dreskin .4 
William H. Eastman CMF 
H. Lynn Edwards 
Rowland B. Engle 
Jack L. Fine A 
Howard C. Gale 
William D. Gordon 
Helen Carl Graham 
Sylvia Levitt Groden 
Barbara Harris Grogan 
Ray K. Grove 
Harold F. Kerchner 
William E. Kerstetter 
Paul V. Kiehl 
Kenneth M. Krebs 
Charlotte Chadwick Litchauer A 
George McClain A 
Sherwin T. McDowell 
Frank A. Mader 
Klein S. Merriman 
Naomi Gibson Miller 
John W. Mole A 
Samuel H. Myers 
Nickolas Navko 
Josephine Williams Naylor 
Margaret Jackson Pendleton CMF 
Lloyd S. Persun. Jr. GMF. ti 
Edward Raffensperger CMF, A 
Lee W. Raffensperger A 
Dorothy V. Reeve A 
C. Richard Rogers 
Renee Reinert Shannon 
Peter Sivess CMF. A 
Helen Sehreadley Snyder 
Evelvn Gutshall Snyder CMF 
Joh11 F. Spahr ,i 
Austin E. Spangler 
Kenneth C. Spengler 
Samuel JI. Spragins 
Sylvia Goldstein Stern 
Leo Stern 
C. Richard Stover 
Ruth A. Trout G},JF, A 
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Clarence H. Winans 
Marcia Lamb Zarger 
J. Gardner Zerby 

1937 
G. Stephen Allen 
Millard Altland 
Kathryn Ward Baird 
Lawrence L. Bentz 
Carl M. Binder 
Harold E. Binder CMF 
Jeanne Durn Birrell 
Adele Rosenberg Blumberg 
George L. Briner 
Tien-Hsi Cheng 
Kenneth Clinton 
J. Thomas Dale 
Ruth Crull Doolittle 
Alpheus P. Drayer 
Floyde Williams Duncan 
Helen Eisenhans Everhart A 
Olaf R. Falk 
Margaret Clark George c_,.,JF 
Emil Gerchak 
C. William Gilchrist CMF, A 
Ruth Youngbl ud Godshall A 
Virginia VanderBueckeu Goheen 
Clayton G. Going 
Robert R. Grainger GMF. A 
John P. Haines 
Eleanor Swope Holmes 
In Memory of Frank Howe 
Margery Black Howe 
Grace Carver Kline 
Charles W. Kugler GMF 
Ralph Landsnaes 
John W. Long, Jr. 
Elizabeth Shuck Lower 
Edward J. McClain 
W. Alexander Mc Cune, Jr. 
Helen Standing Mack 
Gertrude Snyder Maffett 
Arthur R. Mangan ;! r. Emanuel Meyers GMF 
Chester D. Miller 
Robert P. Miller 
Lucile Paxton Nell A 
Daniel A. Radbill 
Paul J. Roberts 
Mary Hurst Robison 
Ruth Schabacker 
George Shuman, Jr. 
Erma II. Slaight 
James W. Smith 
Vance L. Smith GMF 
Louise Mumper Stein A 
Eva lgnatovig Townley 
Joseph J. Tubbs 
William H. Vastine 
Clinton R. Weidner 
D. Frederick Wertz 
Haldeman S. Wertz 
Olive Fitzgerald Wester 

1938 
Donald E. Austin 
John F. Bacon 1l 
Dorothy Williams Baker 
Susan Storm Bartley 
W. [>:dgar Cathers A 
Jeanie Deans Chalmers 
Freel J. Charley CMF. 1l 
Robert W. Chilton CMF. A 
Charles II. Davison GMF 
Earl R. Doll 
Beecher M. Dubbs GMF, A 
Ruth Snyder Eater 
Walter V. Edwards. Jr. 
C. Joseph Foulds A 
Edward B. Goheen 
Robert ll. Griswold ti 
Virginia Bryan Hagen 
John S. Heckles 
Clarence B. Hendrickson A 
Aida Harris Hunter 
Donald S. Hyde 
Jean Heck Jones 
Barbara L. Kahn 
Woodrow W. Kern 
Mark 0. Kistler A 
Carl L. Knopf 
William C. McCarnant 
Alice Guzy Matlin 
Dorothy McBride Mowery A 
Dorothy Hyde Mowry A. 
Thomas I. Myers A 
Harry J. Nuttle GMF, A 
Moses K. Rosenberg 
John L. Scott 
Arthur B. Shaul 
Robert M. Sigler A 
Henry T. Simmonds, Jr. 
William T. Spahr 
Earle N. Stouffer 
Mildred Straka 
Clarkson Wentz GMF 
Louis E. Young 



1939 
Evelyn Zeigler Bankert 
Austin Bittle ,t 
Madeleine Raring Blair 
Donald P. Bleser 
Austin W. Brizendine A 
Elizabeth Bietsch Brizendine A 
Alice Eastlake Chew 
Evelyn Clark Craig 
Samuel B. Cupp A 
Yates Snyder Deahl 
Jerome H. Funk 
Christian V. Graf GMF' 
Penderv Spear Haines 
William R. Headington, Sr. 
Virginia E. Heisey 
William II. Ilendrickson 
William T. Hertzler 
Eugenia Learned James 
Casmer T. Kalinowski 
James C. Kinney, Jr. A 
Bernard J. Kotulak 
Saul Lazovik 
Herschel S. Lieber 
Richard H. Lindsey 
Robert H. Llewellyn 
William A. Ludwig 
John H. McAdoo 
Margaret Meals McAdoo A 
John S. McCool 
W. Gibbs McKenney JDS 
Charles H. McLaughlin, Jr. 
Harry E. Mangle 
Edward Munce 
Samuel 0. Nelson 
J. Harold Passmore 
Julia Garber Rauagan 
Elsa Bluhm Reese 
William D. Reese 
Leon M. Robinson 
Joseph Sansone GMF 
Edith Jones Scott 
Clarence S. Shenk, Jr. GMF' 
James R. Shepley 13RA 
George W. Shroyer GMF 
Judson L. Smith 
David Streger 
I. Crawford Sutton, Jr. 
Irvin R. Swartley 
Beatrice Pennell Thomas 
Anna Ward Ward 
Jacob K. Weinman GMF 
Robert B. Wharton 
James H. Wood 
F. Curtis Yoh 
.T can Lappley Young 

1940 
T. Smedley Bartram, Jr. 
Henry Blank 
William D. Boswell GN[F, A 
Guy A. Bowe, Jr. GMF' 
Jerome W. Burkepile, Jr. 
Andrew Clark, Jr. 
James P. Davenport 
Irene Yeager Duncan 
William H. Eastment 
Esper W. Fink 
Frederick A. Fry GMF 
Donald M. Geesey, Jr. 
Pauline Bleser Gibson 
H. Bernard Gingrich 
Franklin L. Gordon A 
Kenneth M. Gorrell 
Paul L. Gorsuch GMF 
Robert B. Greegor 
John Gruenberg, II 
Jean Holcomb Hertzler 
Jean Rutherford Hilton 
Hubert K. Hoyaux 
George H. Jones, Jr. GMF' 
Grace Dempwolf Jones 
Simon E. Josephson 
Gerald E. Kaufman 
J. V. Richard Kaufman 
Mary Vannernan Kinney 
Brooks E. Kleber A 
Dorothy Swomley Kotsch 
Yvonne Laird La Brecque 
James Latta, Jr. 
Dorothy Wright Marotte 
Edwin C. Marotte 
Primo P. Mori GMF, A 
William H. Myers 
Wilbur M. Rabinowitz 
Kenneth L. Rounds 
Arbelvn Wilder Sansone 
Jane Gilmore Scheuer 
Paul E. Sheer 
Harry C. Stitt, Jr. 
Robert F. Swezy 
Robert J. Thomas A 
William E. Thomas 
Arthur A. Waltmann 
Suzanne Young Watts 
Franklin C. Werner 
Howard L. Williams 
Neihl J. Williamson 
Walter S. \Villiams 
Barbara Curtis Wood 

1941 
Ralph E. Boyer 
Elizabeth Smedley Burkepile 
C. Paul Burtner, Jr. 
Margaret Burt Burtner 
John B. Carrol I 
James R. Chaffinch, Jr. 
Marianne E. Cope+ 
Charles H. Dickinson 
Edward Dixon A 
Richard H. Ellis 
W. Richard Eshelman A 
Morris Foulk, Jr. 
Ard ythe LeFevre Frey 
Mary Dagon Graf 
Madelaine Batt Grafton A 
Lester L. Greevy 
Marion Van Auken Grugan GMF 
Isabel Norcross Hanson 
Louis M. Hatter 
Thomas W. Horton 
Richard W. Hopkins A 
Marshall D. Jackson 
Charles W. Karns 
Samuel J. McCartney, Jr. GMF 
Henry J. McKinnon 
Sanford Marateck A 
Washington L. Marucci 
Elwood J. Mellott A 
Jean Mc.Allister Metzger 
John E. Metzger 
Mary B. Mohler 

Frank H. Fleming 
Robert L. Forman GMF 
Frank Gayman GMF' 
William D. Grafton 
Raymond C. Grandon GMF 
William E. Haak 
Young D. Hance 
Mary Snyder Hertzler .4 
Elizabeth Parkinson Hoffman 
Hilda Knaub Jackson 
Angela Hull Jacobs 
Elizabeth Towsend Jacobs 
Paul C. Janaske 
Virginia Lightner Janaske 
Aleta Kistler Keller 
Susan Rohrer Koch A 
William Koch GMF, A 
James H. Lee, Jr. 
James W. McGuckin GMF, A 
Harry A. McKee 
Alice Abbott MacGregor A 
Joan Riddick Manner 
George F. Myers A 
Frank 0. Nagle, Jr. 
John J. Rehr .4. 
William F. Rernphrey 
W. H. Revelle. Jr. 
George L. Rubright GJ,JF 
Harry F. Rtlth 
Albert E. Scheflen 
Harry E. Shaner 
D. Pierson Smith 
William S. Smith, Jr. 

THE LEADERS . 
IN PARTICIPATION 

25-99 in class 

100-199 in class 

200-299 in class 
1957 
I959 

300-399 in class 

William A. Nickles 
Genevieve Morgan Quigley 
Herbert E. Richards 
Jerome L. Rosenberg 
Jackson C. Rutherford 
Helen Rosengrant Schoenleber A 
Pau I S. Shaffer 
Benjamin J. Shinn 
Ruth Leavett Shinn 
Carl T. Sieg 
Diana Rosenberg Slotznick ;l 
E. Bayne Snyder 
Wanda Null Spohn 
Frank K. Stevens .4 
Louise Peters Tillotson 
Mary Mansfield Van Buskirk A 
Joyce Crickrnay Walters 
Edgar C. Washabaugh 
Russel G. Weidner 

1942 
Sylvester S. Aichele G},fF', ,1 
George H. Baker, Jr. 
William E. Barclay, Jr. GMF' 
Phyllis Fink Baumgartner 
Lee E. Chaplin 
E. Parker Colborn 
Louise Dalton Cooling 
Richard E. Derr 
Charles E. Duncan, Jr. ;\ 
Ezra J. Epstein 
Ursula Freas Faller 
Oscar L. Feller GMF 
Lillian Hendrickson Fisher 
Robert H. Fleck 

Harry W. Speidel GMF, A 
William A. Steckel GMF, A 
Margaret Johnston Stout 
Russell R. Tyson GMF, .4. 
Carolyn Loder 'Washabaugh 
Shirley Tanner Weed 
Nancy Woolf Whitacre 
Don H. Williams 

1943 
Robert S. Aronson 
John W. Aungst, Jr. 
Abner H. Bagenstose, Jr. 
Charlotte Stopford Bagenstose A 
Josephine Matthews Baum 
D. Dudley Bloom 
Winifred Sharpless Bowers 
Samuel D. Brown, Jr. 
Fred T. Cadmus, Ill 
Frank S. Cannova 
Antonio Cappello GMF 
Donald D. Deans 
M. B. DeForrest 
J. Fred Dittmann 
John A. Duvall 
Mary Mackie Eshelman 
Harry E. Fidler GMF 
Ernest A. Fockler, Jr. 
Joseph J. Freeman 
Mary Fields Gayman GMF 
Emma Gardiner Gleda 
Champion B. Goldy 
Jeannette Eddy Graham 
Robert A. Grugan GM1' 

Ann M. Halpin 
Perrin C. Hamilton 
John B. Harley A 
Helen Thompson Heritage 
Larry E. Houck GMF 
Laurence S. Jackson 
Horace L. Jacobs, III A 
Ruth Cardell Kaufman 
William H. Kenety, Jr. 
Weir L. King 
Marcia Mathews Knapp 
S. Lee Kuensell 
Newell H. Langley 
H. Paul Leap A 
Elizabeth Black Lenderman 
Edwin H. Lenderman, Jr. 
C. Law McCabe GMF 
John L. McCormick 
James M. McElfish GMF', A 
Palmer S. McGee, Jr. 
Norman R. Olewiler 
John R. Oyler 
Catherine \V. Parr 
Winfield A. Peterson, Jr. A 
John T. Pfeiffer, III GMF 
Norma Gardner Pumphrey 
Richard A. Purnell 
Ruth Coleman Ritter 
Vincent V. Rovito 
Wilbur H. Rubright 
Charles F. Saam A 
John C. Schmidt GMF 
Meta Chadwick Smith 
Grayson C. Snyder 
Ronald Souser 
Glenn A. Stambaugh 
Jean Weidner Stambaugh 
James S. Steele A 
Kathleen Boehm Tyson GMF 
Roger B. Turk 
OrvilleV, Warner 
Robert E. Weaver 

1944 
John G. Allyn 
Susan Smith Allyn 
Helen Frendlich Bott 
David M. Boyd 
Jeanne Sloan Boyd 
Robert H. Cassel 
Irma Hibbs Chaffinch 
DeWitt G. Cottrell 
Jeanne Faddis Cunliffe 
George W. Gillespie 
Newton Greenblatt 
John Harvey A 
Edith Lingle Hollan 
Mary Beagle Land 
Morton W. Leach 
Edwin E. Lippincott, II 
Robert W. Long .4 
C. William McCord 
William Mclndoe, Jr. 
Andrew Mandjuris 
Donald W. Meals 
Kathleen Briner Meals 
Mary M. Jvllllcr 
Robert E. Miller 
Arline D. Mills 
Ralph M. Mitchell 
Paul H. Neff A 
George Poust, Jr. 
James Prescott, Ill 
Louise Faupel Purnell 
David M. Rahauser GMF, A 
Ruth Bryant Rubright 
Donald Q. Sprole A 
Catherine S. Stern 
Wallace F. Stettler 
Robert J. Wharton 
Robert T. Wheeler, Jr. 
Howell O. Wilkins A 
Gail Wintermute A 
Nathaniel Yingling 

1945 
J. Paul Bright, Jr. 
Helen Boetzel Coho 
Thomas .F. Dillon 
Charles D. Foster. III 
Nancy Tatnall Fuller 
Mary Ritter Haayen 
George W. Harrison 
Zane G. Kaufman 
Dorothy Hartzell Keer 
Frederick H. Leonhardt. Jr. JDS 

A-Fund Volunteer 
GMF'-Gilbert Malcolm Fellow 
JDS-Jobn Dickinson Society 
BRA-Benjamin Rush Associate 

tDeceased 



THE JOHN DICKINSON SOCIETY 
of 

THE DICKINSON FUND 
This certifies that 

John Cox, Class of 1970 
has been designated a member of The John 

Dickinson Society for the year ending 
12-31-67 

~,t.~ 
President 

EVERY year a number of alumni, parents and 
friends are privileged to contribute a major por­ 
tion of the unrestricted monies needed to hold the 
College to its traditional high level of achieve­ 
ment. While all gifts to The Dickinson Fund are 
appreciated, special accolades for those who do 
the most toward achieving the objectives of the 
Fund are provided. The entire history of phil­ 
anthropy bears out the soundness of proportion ate 
giving. The effectiveness of exemplary generosity 
on the part of those able to extend it in large part 
determines the success or failure of The Dickin­ 
son Fund's ability to provide Dickinson College 

John Dickinson Society and Benjamin Rush Associates 
Report 50 Charter Memberships; 

Number of Malcolm Fellows Increases 31 % 

THE BENJAMIN RUSH ASSOCIATES 
of 

THE DICKINSON FUND 
This certifies that 

John Eaton, Class of 1970 
has been designated a Benjamin Rush Associate 

for the year ending 
12-31-67 

~,/.~ 
President 

THE GILBERT MALCOLM FELLOWS 
of 

THE DICKINSON FUND 

This certifies that 

John Doe, Class of 1980 
has been designated a Gilbert Malcolm Fellow for 

the academic year 
1966-67 

~,(.~ 
President 
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the financial stability she richly deserves. Mem­ 
bership in the John Dickinson Society, the Ben­ 
jamin Rush Associates and the Gilbert Malcolm 
Fellows is Dickinson's way of extending special 
thanks each year to those who contribute major 
gifts for Annual Giving. 

The formation of the John Dickinson Society 
and the Benjamin Rush Associates in late 1966 
recognizes that every worthy movement in his­ 
tory-beit social, political or educational--has been 
spearheaded by a core of staunch supporters who 
are privileged to provide the financial leadership 
and the initiative necessary for success. The 
Society and the Associates bring together such 
men and women. Memberships are granted on an 
annual basis and extended to those alumni, parents 
and friends making a gift of $1 .ooo or more or 
$500 or more, respectively, to The Dickinson Fund. 

The Gilbert Malcolm Fellows was founded in 
1965 to promote leadership in advancing the 
educational goals of Dickinson. Membership is 
secured on an annual basis by making a gift of 
$100 or more to The Dickinson Fund. The organ­ 
ization was established in the fall of 1965. Since 
then, 617 memberships have been granted. 

We are grateful for the leadership gifts provided 
by those so designated. 



'Jacob A. Myers, Class of '67, hands President Howard 
L. Rubendall a blank check with the assurance that our 
most recent graduating class will be ready to assume their 
alumni responsibilities in 1968. Sylvester Aichele '42, presents Silver 

Anniversary Reunion Gift to President 
Rubendall. 25th and 5oth Reunion 
Classes showed significant growth in 
participation as well as in funds raised. 

They did it again! Leading all 
others William M. Young's Class 
of 19;1 took top honors in partici­ 
pation-89%. A permanent award 
will cite the Class for its achieve­ 
ment. 

Howard L. Rubendall 'Ji, President of the College, 
and Samuel W. Witwer '30, President of the 
Board of Trustees, admire increased gifts given by 
reunion classes at the Alumni Luncheon. 

President Rubendall, Mr. Witwer and Dickinson Fund General 
Chairman-elect Harry C. Zug, '3,;, map strategy for the 1968 Fund 
at the president's house. 

2I 



Mary Zimmerman McKee 
Claire Merritt Millard 
Betty Hummer Mitchell 
Ellen B. Morrow 
Raymond Niehouse, Jr. 
Mary Dickerson Owen 
Wilma Barkalow Prescott A 
Irwin R. Saberski 
Mary Houck Speidel GMF 
Stratford C. Taylor 
Harriette Line Thompson 
Margaret Schaeffer Tighe 
Ruth F. Wallace, II 
Pauline Shumaker Walters 
Elizabeth Felton Williams 
Doris Spangenburg Wing 

1946 
Bruce C. Adams 
Marjorie Monroe Arnold 
Jacob L. Barber 
Foster E. Brenneman 
Bruce E. Cooper 
Christine Myers Crist A 
John D. Cunningham A 
Ruth Denny DeForrest 
Patricia Deitz 
Frederick L. Edwards A 
Catherine S. Eitemiller 
Mary Bosler Ezerski A. 
Robert W. Gillan, Jr. 
Nancy Schnelli Hambleton 
Martha Wentzel Heffelfinger 
JI. Joseph Hepford 
James B. Jamison G,HF . .4. 
Jane Breneman Kulp 
Margaret E. MacGregor 
Kenneth J. Mackley 
Jean Carson Morris 
Catherine Crouse Moyer rt 
Gilbert P. Reichert 
Jean Lentz Saam 
Lucille Sweet Schafmeister 
Martha Stough Soltow 
Patricia Rupp Sourbeer A 
Joan Thatcher Tiboni 
Dorothy Leeper Townsend 
Forrest Trumbore 
Carolyn Snyder Turk 
Marvin Z. Wallen 
Virginia Twyeffort Weber A 
Miriam Prescott Woltien 
In Memory of Roger A. Woltjen 

1947 
D. Fenton Adams 
Anna Sausser Alexander wuu, A. Alexander 
Fern McCormick Barber 
L. Glenn Barkalow 
Rebecca Kidd Bradley 
Bernard C. Brorninski 
G. Raymond Brown, Jr. GMF 
R. Dean Coddington 
Robert G. Crist A 
Miriam Koontz Drucker 
Marie Pape Foss 
Jean Uh land Foster 
Jack G. Fuller, Jr. 
Robert C. Gerhard 
Eugene L. Grandon GMF, A 
William C. Groh 
Betty Fishel Hanley 
Nancy Dunning Harris 
Joy Cameron Hicks A 
Jane Guinivan Holland 
Richard K. Hulton 
Margery E. Keiner 
Mary Preston Koza G<VIF 
William G. Kumpf 
Joyce Williams Kushinka 
Jean Doney Laufer 
George G. McClintock, Jr. 
Donald H. McGee 
Patricia Callahan McGee 
Wilbert C. McKim, Jr. G},fF, A 
:vfyron L. Mavper 
Thomas C. Mills, Jr. 
Ralph L. Minker, Jr. A 
James J. Moyer GMF, A 
Gladys R. Myers 
Thomas R. Peters 
Harriet Gilbert Petry 
Julia Stuart Rice 
Robert W. Saunderson, Jr. 
Roger M. Schecter 
Barbara Stevens Shirey 
George A. Skinner GMF 
Everett C. Smith 
Harold L. Stowell 
J. Eugene Stumpf A 
Edward F. Van Jura 
Daniel R. Wolf 
James M. Yingling 

1948 
Joseph S. Ammerman 
Dorothy Mathews Applin A 
Austin H. Armistead 
Joseph A. Barlock 
Fay Reaser Bates 
Patricia Herzig Bernard 
\.Villiam F. Borda GMF, A 
Edward G. Brame, Jr. A 
Robert E. Bull 
William W. Caldwell ,1 
Carmine A. Carucei .... 1 
Kiel I H. Christiansen 
Henrietta Hill Coddington 
Don A. Cosby 
Charles R. Crawford 
John J. Donecker 
Morton H. Elkis 
James N. Esbenshade 
Geno A. Francavil la 
Samuel J. Friedberg 
Ralph Max Gingrich GMF 
Marvin Goldstein 
Alvin E. Granite 
William T. Guy A 
Robert K. Hafer 
John H. Harris, Jr. 
Maxine Starner Harris 
Louis A. Hartheimer 
Robert M. Hinkelman 
Earl F. Hoerner 
David S. Hollenshead 
John D. Hopper GMF 
Oliver N. Hormell 
Lester A. Kern 
Arthur W. Koffenberger, Jr. GlYIF 
Daniel F. Koon 
Jane Mack Lane 
John W. Langley 
Samuel L. Lebovitz 
Henry E. Lehr 
Norman L. Levin 
George G. Lindsay GiHF 
Nancy Bashore Lindsay GlvlF 
Nancy Watkins Lucas 
Russell J. Mc Cann 
Howard J. Maxwell GlYJF, A 
Howell C. Mette 
\Villiam D. Nash A 
Robert \V. Neuber JDS 
Elizabeth Giese Norton 
Edgar Owens 
Margaret Boltz Privat 
Douglas C. Rehor 
John A. Roe 
Herbert S. Sacks GMF 
Donald K. Shearer Gk/ F 
Daniel N. Shope 
Edward Sieber, Jr. ,1 
Robert C. Slutzker 
Regina Vath Smythe A 
James H. Soltow 
Warren H. Spencer A 
John W. Springer 
Nancy Johns Springer 
Richard F. Staar GMF. A. 
Alma Anderson Staehle 
L. Holland Taylor. Jr. GMF 
Edwin C. Thomas, Jr. 
James A. Turner 
William P. Virgin .4 
Jouko J. Voutilainen 
William J Walker 
Frederick S. Wilson A 
Herbert G. Wing 
Edmund G. Young GMF 

1949 
John B. Armstrong 
James H. Bates, Jr. 
Robert S. Berryman 
Jane Jackson Betts .4 
William W. Betts. Jr. 
Mary Ritter Brassington 
\Villiam H. Brassington 
Lynn G. Brenneman 
Isabelle Bradby Brown 
Lawrence E. Brown 
Lenora Shad le Caldwell 
Thomas D. Caldwell. Jr. A 
Joseph H. Carter 
Emanuel A. Cassirnat is 
Hampton P. Corson GMF, A 
Gerald Cramer 
John R. Diefenderfer 
Barbara Thompson Doring 
David R. Eaby A 
H. James Elvin 
Robert A. Enders 
John G. Feinour 
Gordon S. Fell 
William H. Gearhart 
Witliam Gunderman 
Sally-Jo Burgheim Gundersheirner 
Johll P. Hauch, Jr. 
George W. Hess 
Pauline Hand Hess 
Joseph Hlywiak 
Howard L. Hoffman 
S. William Hollingsworth, Jr. 

James P. Hopkins 
Eleanor Slaybaugh Jones 
Klaus Kartzke 
Richard M. Keer 
Charles A. Langner, Jr. 
J. Thomas Lewin 
Robert D. Lowe GMF, A 
Samuel. M. Lyons, Jr. GMF 
William A. McDonald 
John W. McMillan, Jr. 
Robert M. Mead 
Robert E. Myers 
Harry A. Nagle, Jr. 
Walter S. Norton, Jr. 
William G. Pauley 
Robert C. Petersen 
George A. P01't 
Alan J. Reiter 
Baird S. Ritter 
Donald A. Robinson 
Dorothy Weinman Robinson 
Theodore Rodman 
Herbert C. Rubright 
Vincent J. Schafmeister, Jr. 
Ada Coller Schecter 
Minerva Adams Scherzer 
Eleanor J. Schulmann 
Lavere C. Senft 
F. M. Richard Simons .4 
Estelle Bernard Solomon 
Ellis E. Stern, Jr. 
Sally Drake Strong 
Stephen J. Szekely 
John J. Thomas A 
Bonnie Larzelere Thompson 
William R. Valentine Jr. 
Sara Frew Watson 
Ruth Bair Wilson 
Daniel B. Winters 
Robert R. Witwer 
Fred J. \Volfe 
James L. Young 

1950 
James K. Abbott 
Robert P. Banks. Jr. 
Howard G. Baum 
Mary Shaver Bemus 
Robert J. Brown 
Vilma Meszaros Brown 
Warren W. Brubaker 
James L. Bruggeman 
Robert W. Bucher 
Thomas G. Chew A 
Chuman Chun 
Robert E. Claster GMF 
Joseph H. Cooper 
E. Charles Coslett 
Robert H. Crow 
H. Chace Davis, Jr. GMF 
Thomas \V. Davis A 
Jules D. Distel A 
B. Frank Dunkle, Tr. A 
Rosalie Enders Dunkle 
Richard T. Durgin 
Charles L. Eat.er. Jr. 
Theodore H. Ely A 
Vivian Long Enders 
Doris Farquharson Erickson .4 
Pamela Burr Evans 
Royal T. Farrow 
Ethel Peterson Feinour 
Arthur C. Flandreau 
Janet Elder Flandreau 
Mary E. Fox 
Paul M. Gamble, Jr. 
John R. Gavin 
Edwin S. Gault 
Christine Bunisk Geisler 
William B. Harlan A 
Russell D. Harris 
Richard T. Harrison 
Frank N. Hofer, Jr. 
Guy T. Holcombe GMF 
Mary Emlet Hopkins 
Paul W. Houck 
Dorothy Heck Houlberg 
Harry A. Howell 
Joh11 D. Howells 
Mildred E. Hurley A 
Maurice H. Ivins 
W. Richard Jacoby 
Richard Keiser 
John F. King 
LeRoy G. Krieger GMF 
Vernon G. La Barre A 
Edgar W. Lichtenberger 
Leo F. Luciano 
David Lyon 
Eleanor Cattron Mai11 
Robert M. Mair 
Rieta Latch Maxwell 
Villie Memmi 
Elmo C. Mentzer 
Donald R. Mikesell 
William D. Morgan 
Robert L. Mumma 
James 1-1. Murray 
Joyce Shaffer Nagle 
Stanley C. Nagle, Jr. 
Robert L. Novell 
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Donald A. Olewine 
Weston C. Overholt, Jr. A 
Fred D. Oyler 
Mary Kelly Paxton 
Paul R. Paxton 
William T. Phillipy , III 
W. Don Reader 
Ann Obermiller Reed 
Bruce R. Relu GM F 
Dianne Kehler Relick 
Victoria Hann Reynolds 
Louis S. Rice, II 
Ellen Petersen Richards 
Thomas W. Richards 
Marvin L. Richeal 
Joseph B. Roberts 
W. Lehman Smith 
Paul S. Snoke GMF 
David T. Stebbins 
Eugene R. Steiner 
Donald W. Sweet 
Arthur L. Tait 
Mahlon M. Thompson 
Joseph M. Trask 
William V. Webster, Jr. A 
Robert J. Weinstein GMF 
Walther T. Weyl man 
John P. Wilgus 
David H. Williams 
Jacques E. Williams 
J. Carl Williams 

1951 
Mary Spence Altman 
James K. Arnold A 
Robert J. Avey 
George E. Bailey 
Gordon \V. Baum ,1i 
] oan Price Berry 
G. Kenneth Bishop GMF 
Richard E. Brown 
Patricia Johnson Buttenhe!m GMF 
EUn.or Pond Campaign 
Elton F. Carlson 
Howard E. Deissler 
William IT. Denlinger A 
Harold E. Dunkl<~ 
Robert D. Eppley 
James W. Evans 
Joseph E. Favuzza 
June Lovell Gamble 
Constance Kvnett, Garland 
Jimmie C. George GMF 
Joan Kline Gingrich 
Joan E. Gipple 
Seymour Z. Goldblatt 
Paul H. Gronbeck 
Zoltan A. lforasty 
!vlary Vickery Harding 
George W. Heffner 
James K. Hershberger 
William M. Hill, Jr. 
Robert G. Hopwn 
Marilyn Creasy Ivins 
David Karanovich 
Philip E. Kistler 
Howard L. Kitzmiller 
II. Robert Koltnow 
A. Carl Kriebel, Jr. 
Charles S. Lee, Jr. 
l'v!artin T. Lt•wis 
Barbara Barnitz Lillich G • ..,JF, A 
Richard W. Lins 
Thomas H. McEntee 
John G. Main 
George W. Marsdon, Jr. 
Janet Knoblaurk Miller 
Joseph J. Miller 
Paul E. M!ller 
M. George Moorarlian GMF 
Margaret McMnllen Morrison 
Richard J. Murray 
Stacy D. Myers, Jr. 
Donald H. Newman 
Diane \\'ii Iiams Oyler 
Eugene M. Oyler A 
Lois Price Pauley 
Donald E. Piper GMF, A. 
J. William Raiford 
Nancy Bain Rehr 
J. Richard Re lick A 
Ronald D. Saypol GMF 
John J. Shu maker 
Henderson G. Sigler 
John E. Slike 
Sally Spangenburg Small 
Dewey M. Stowers 
Emily Mohler Stowers 
Melvin F. Strockbine 
Paul L. Strickler 
Constance Hazelwood Taylor 
Nanette Brame Thurman 
W. Robert Van Zan<lt 11 
Barbara Ward Walter 
John E. Walter 
John T. Whitmore 
Judith Jocsting Winters 
J. Raymond Wiss 
Richard C. Wolf 



1952 
Ann Einstein Abbott 
Norman N. Aerenson 
Chauncey W. Anderson, Jr. 
Harrison W. App A 
Clarence Arnold 
Thomas W. Bare 
Richard M. Barnes 
Albert C. Benedict 
Edward M. Bermas 
Diane Stewart Bock 
Nancy Martine Breneman 
Phyllis Lamont Bruggeman 
Philip C. Capice 
Nancy Cressman Cashatt 
Stanley Chin 
Nelson M. Chitter ling A 
John E. Colburn 
Patricia Hoffman Colburn 
Jean Eastep Cooksey 
John E. Corman 
Mary Dykstra Corson 
William A. Cover 
John B. Davies 
Hugh H. Doney 
Eileen Fair Durgin 
James M. Ecker 
Milton A. Feldman 
H. M. Fredericks, Jr. 
George W. Gekas 
Wilbur J. Gobrecht 
Edward C. Goldman 
Ernest R. Griffith 
Margaret Chambers Haines GMF 
Paul E. Haines GMF, A 
Emily Peck Halpern 
Marian Breu Harlan 
Charles J. Herber 
William T. Hostetter 
Robert H. Householder 
Joseph R. Johnson, Jr. 
Robert P. Kane 
Jeanne Lloyd Keller 
Elizabeth Keller Kennedy 
Joan Davisson Knapp 
Norman M. Kranzdorf A 
Michael J. Levitt 
William S. Lewis 
Kermit L. Lloyd 
Andrew Lolli 
Jean Rowe Loper 
Earl V. Lynam 
Donald M. McCurdy 
Robert H. Marta 
Edwin J. Martin 
John C. Martin 
John L. Mersfelder 
Edna Eitemiller Miller 
C. Richard Morton 
Kathryn Kilpatrick Nunncley 
Edwin L. Ochs, Jr. 
James G. Park ll. 
Richard J. Patterson 
Robert M. Pizzini GMF 
Richard L. Placey 
Elizabeth Barclay Poling 
Doris C. Price 
Marianne Luckenbill Punchard 
Kenneth M. Querry 
Virginia Minnich Rahal 
Frances Scott Raiford 
Mary Peterson Rives 
Arlin Rojohn 
Joyce Ingham Ross 
Ralph Schwartz GMF 
Charles F. Shambaugh 
John J. Sherman, Jr. GMF 
William W. Sherman. Jr. 
Perry J. Shertz 
Scottie L. Shover 
William H. Simmons 
Lewis W. Srnal l 
Donald L. Snyder 
Louis A. Steiner A 
Herbert J. Stol itzky 
Rachel Smith Sweet 
Donald C. Taylor 
William F. Tavlor 
Richard G. Trt1b 
Conrad N. Trumbore 
Margaret Saves Van Zandt 
Arnold K. Weber, Jr. A 
Gerald Weinstein GMF 
Claude M. Williams 
Ruth Pritchard Wilson 

1953 
Edward N. Adourian, Jr. 
Ali A. Alley 
Donald E. Barber 
Carol Spangenburg Batdorf 
Richard B. Bavitz 

A-Fond Volunteer 
GMF-Giluert Malcolm Fellow 
JDS-John Dickinson Society 
BRA-Benjamin Rush Associate 

[Deceased 

Morrie Burns GJ4.F 
H. Kenneth Butera A 
William L. Clovis 
Carolyn Kahle Davis 
Joseph F. DlOrio, II 
Carole Dombro Ecker 
Phyllis Hood Fredericks 
Patricia Haddock Gasull 
H. Robert Oasull, Jr. 
Claude L. Gates 
Richard B. Goehner 
Julia A. Good 
Edward J. Greene 
Kenneth L. Harvey 
Ann Boyd Hastings 
Donald E. Heller 
George C. Hering, I II 
Robert H. High A 
Carolyn VerValen Hopson 
James H. Houser A 
Mary Ellen Irwin 
Kay Gleim Jordan 
Marlin S. Keller 
Paul W. Kendi, Jr. 
Grace Shambaugh Long 
Beverly Carlbon Martin 
Donald L. Masten 
Joanne Thompson lvlaton 
R. Barbara Mattas 
Ronald A. Millian 
Martha Weis McGill A 
Jean Gallagher Montgomery 
Renee Conrad Morton 

Jerome L. Block 
Marvin V. Brown, Jr. 
Robert A. Brown 
Nancv Knight Bubb 
Walter W. Buckingham 
Frank T. Carney Glvl F 
Richard A. Cau tilli 
William C. Chatkin 
Robert B. Cohen A 
Rae Halberstaclt Comly 
Cardell B. Cook 
Judith Harvey Cook 
Walter F. Cook 
Ann Davey Crumpton A 
Rebecca Simmons Davies 
Mary Gibson Decker A 
Harriett Gilmore Deissler 
Mark C. Eisenstein 
Joseph R. Embery, III 
Lawrence Fasano, Jr. 
Bruce C. Foster 
George M. Gill GMF 
Ronald Goldberg 
Louise Hauer Greenberg 
H. Joan Ludwig Hamm 
Henrietta Mohler Hartranft 
Dorothy Dykstra Heldt 
Betty Simpson H ernmer ly 
Althea Trochelrnan Henrich 
Marv Smith Hirt 
William J. Hissner 
Kenneth Hitchner, Jr. 
Frances Holt 

THE LEADERS 
Improvement 

PERCENTAGE INCREASE IN PARTICIPATION 

1961 

JN NUMBER OF CONTRIBUTORS 

PERCENTAGE INCREASE IN AMOUNT GIVEN 

Joan Gettig Nagle 
Paul L. Negley, Jr. 
Joyce C. Newcomb 
Barbara Fox Pagan 
Bruce S. Pagan 
Raymond C. Phillips, Jr. 
Shirley Chase Phillips 
Anthony J. Pileggi 
James L. Pritchard 
Clifford T. Rotz 
Caroline Thomas Rhodes 
Stephen A. Ritt 
William H. Searle 
John B. Schwerd t le 
E. Donald Shapiro 
Frank M. Skrapits 
Willard F. Slifer, Jr. 
Loma Rein Stike 
Elizabeth Middleton Slim 
Wclliam L. Stark 
Allan E. Stiner 
Julie Yoshizaki Takahashi 
Martha Kurtz Tourt i l lot.te 
John F. Trickett A 
Margaret Steele Trickett ,1 
Arthur D. Weeks 
Lester Weidner 
Emil R. Weiss GMF 
Robert Whitson 
George J. Wickard 
Robert J. Wise (;MF 
David W. Zi lenz iger 

1954 
Ioan Condon Bare 
ii:arl M. Barnhart 
Eileen Baumeister Barthel A 
Jean McAnally Bickel 

Robert N. Hoover 
Jay M. Hughes 
Glenn Jacoby 
Gail Bruce Joiner 
Robert L. Jones 
Howard J. Kline 
Sidney D. Kline, Jr. A 
Harold L. Krueger 
Margaret McLaughlin Lamb 
Klaus T. Lernberg 
Adelaide Houck Lewis 
J. Edwin Lintern 
Richard A. Looft 
Andrew C. Lvnch 
Ronald L. McGowan 
Robert D. Mc lntyre 
Charles Naylor 
Francis C. Oglesby 
Jacqueline Smith Olin 
George H. Orwig, JI 
Ralph E. Owens 
Joan Cappello Phillips 
Jean Thompson Pritchard 
Laurence V. Radtke 
Robert C. Reed 
Peter J. Ressler 
Samuel G. Rhood 
Elton P. Richards, Jr. 
Clifford A. Rogers, Jr. 
Roberta Lamont Schreiner 
Edward F. Sickel 
Michael G. Silver 
C. Robert Small 
Elizabeth A. Swaim 
Paul C. Tarr, III A 
Donald Testerman 
Patricia Anderson Trub 
Richard J. Westcott 
William E. Woodside 
Jeanette Leavitt Wurster 
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1955 
Lynn I. Adams 
John D. Anderson 
Joan Trier Arnold 
Carolyn Denslow Baierbach 
A. Lawrence Ban er, Jr. 
Marlyn McNeal Barber 
Ward E. Barnes 
Allen E. Beach 
Thomas A. Beckley A 
Walter W. Belfield 
Cody H. Brooks 
Eugene P. Chell 
Albert L. Clark A 
William B. Comly, Jr. 
Howard E. Davis 
Neal .H. Dice 
Ruth Costenbader Doney 
James W. Dow 
Charles H. DuBois A 
Earl R. Etzweiler 
Carol Shaw Glatt 
LeRoy R. Goldblatt 
Lynn Skow Gourley 
Neil H. Graham 
Joyce Burdick Greene 
Forwood E. Hanby GMF 
Kenneth W. High 
Louise Howard Hill 
Earl 0. Hollenbaugh 
Samuel A. Huffard 
David D. Hukill 
Carolyn Blackman Jacoby 
Ronald B. L. Jones 
William IL Klornpus 
William N. Knisely 
Robert H. Krischker, Jr. 
Joseph T. Kunda 
Ralph H. Lamb 
Marjorie Dickie Lehman 
Kenneth B. Lewis 
Rona Epstein Lewis 
Ronald L. Leymeister 
Frank D. Lorimer 
Jean Izatt Lorimer 
Bruce A. McGillivray 
Elizabeth Mountz McGowan 
Barbara Ruth Majeski 
George J. Martin, Jr. 
Eugene J. Milosh 
Richard W. Mutzabaugh A 
Theora Minzes Newmark ;l 
Andrew Padien 
Thomas N. Papoutsis 
Daniel Parlin 
John E. Perkner 
Theodore L. Phillips 
Arthur L. Piccone 
Claire A. Pinney 
Elizabeth Decker Poor 
Franklin E. Poore, III A 
Orsanne Rice Potter 
Mary Cox Powell 
Earl M. Reynolds A 
Jean Coslett Reynolds A 
John H. Rhein 
Nancy Ives Rumford 
Henry J. Rutherford GMF 
Jane Myers Seller 
M. Charles Seller 
J. Robert Sheppard 
Douglas L. Shunk 
Phoebe Stambaugh Shunk 
Joanne Roulette Slifer 
Carroll D. Srueak 
Richard C. Snelbaker 
Wilma Hatter Starkey 
Martha Miller Tappen 
Doris Wise Testerman 
Walter B. Thompson 
Susan Marquardt Tiberghien 
Robert L. Varano 
Ann Regan Weinert 
Edith Bean Welliver 
Glenn E. Welliver 
Lynn G. Weiser 
Jeanne Caretto Wilson 
Joanne Hard ick Wise 
Jane Herr \Vright 
Barbara Minnick Wyatt 
John A. Yoder 
Frederick G. Yuengling, Jr. 

1956 
Marvin D. Abrams 
Donald P. Allegretto 
Barbara Shil lingsburg Allen 
Mary Walter Baner 
Frederick L. Barton 
Walter E. Beach GMF, 1l 
Dean J. Bennett 
Stephen D. Benson 
Sue Thoenebe Bofinger 
Robert L. Boyer 
Elizabeth Baird Brooks 
Ingrid Reinhold Brown 
Ruth Herrlich Burton 
Elizabeth Royer Carpenter 
Andrew A. Cominskv 
Warren F. Dedrick - 
Lee W. Disharoon 

I'_ 



Murray S. Eckel! A 
George G. Eisley, Jr. 
Lawrence C. Fink 
J. Robert Fiscella 
Glorette A. Fisher 
Gayle Compton Folger 
Helen Herr Ford 
Joseph S. Ford A 
James W. Fredericks 
Lorraine A. Garwood 
Robert C. Gilbaugh 
Henry J. Gold 
Gary C.· Goodlin 
Bruce M. Gourley 
Alice Ditzler Graham A 
Peter N. Greeley 
Robert A. Hartley 
Jay H. Hartman 
Carla J. Hasenritter 
Barbara Lamb Heller 
Barry H. Hellman 
Sarah Anderson Hitchcock 
Barbara Ruth Hoover 
Carolyn Menin Hoppe 
Thad A. Hoppe 
William S. Hudson A 
Eleanor Nathan Isaacs 
Emma Liener Jacoby 
David N. Johnson 
Judy Mead Johnson 
Joan Howell Jones 
Shirley Cranwil l Jordan 
Jean Hampton Killcoyne 
Constance vV. Klages 
Anne Berchet Knepley 
Elise Howland Koehler 
John M. Kohlmeier 
Alan S. Kramer 
C. David Krewson G]HF 
William T. Lynam, Ill 
Ann Thompson Mahoney 
John A. Matta 
Patricia A. Matz 
Robert J. Middleton 
Ralph W. Miller 
Joseph Minkevitcb 
James L. Nellas 
Barbara Boffemyer Newcomer 
John L. Newcomer 
J. Frederick Novinger 
Charles H. Olin 
Miles L. Owens 
Joel H. Pachino 
Donald L. Rittenhouse 
Shayle Robbins 
Jennifer Westcott Roth 
Frederick E. Roth 
James S. Roth 
John W. Runkle 
Frank M. Schwartz 
Hillel Schwartz 
Phyllis Fetterman Sexton A 
Eleanor Sheperd Sheppard 
Judith Kirkpatrick Sigler 
Barry N. Sklar 
Ronald S. Sklar 
Theodore Sky 
Edwin E. Smith 
Robert F. Smith GMF 
Carolyn Burgard Snelbaker 
Harry S. Southard 
Jeanne Carlson Spangler 
Frederick H. Specht 
Kenneth Speed 
Betty Lusby Stephens 
David D. Theall 
Jerome C. Timen 
Patricia McCrane Timen 
Jane Compton Wagenbrenner 
Susanne Terbush Warren 
R. Lewis Wilkinson 
John P. Winand 
Ruth Conhagen Winand 
John H. Witmer 
George D. Wright, Jr. 
Raymond E. Zickel 

WILLIAM H. HOUPT 
Division Leader 
Class of 1957 

42% Participation 

1957 
Jeanne Longcope Anderson 
Theodore Auman, II I 
Shirley Brown Bachman 
Robert L. Bailey 
Paul W. Baker, Jr. 
William C. Beatty 
Mary Sanford Beckley 
Gordon L. Bennett 
Richard J. Biscontini 
Robert D. Burrowes 
Frank Campanelli 
Jack H. Cassel 
Jane Flynn Chance 
Margaret Cleveland Clark 
Gwendolyn Moser DeLong 
Elizabeth Spangler Detwiler 
Nancy Carpenter Dietrich 
Alvin E. Dillman, Jr. 
Olga Brown Donovan 
Pauline Friedrick Eaton A 
Jere M. Eisenstat 
Blanche Broeske Embery 
Edward R. Gilbert 
Carole Fischer Gladfelter 
H. Robert Gladfelter A 
Robert D. Gleason 
Ira D. Glick A 
Nina Samoilovich Gonchar 
Carol Ware Gould 
John H. Gould 
Margaret D. Harrison 
Edmund G. Hauff A 
Elizabeth Elderdice Hering 
Thomas A. Hetherington 
Patricia Anderson High 
Murray E. Hirshorn 
William H. Houpt A 
Joanne Rothermel Ibach 
G. William Junginger, Jr. 
William P. Keen 
William Kil lcovne 
Barbara James Kline A 
Richard R. Klotz 
David W. Knepley 
Barbara Neill Koontz 
Robert C. Koontz, Jr. A 
Paul J. Kovnat 
Virginia Burgess Laire 
Harry A. Ledgard 
Gwen E. Leidy 
B. I. Levine, Jr. 
Greta Szaban Lewis A 
Joan Gallagher Lynam 
Susan Schuck Lynne A 
Wende Buckler Mack 
French D. Mackes 
Elizabeth Polley Martin 
William Matthews, Jr. 
Mark May A 
Marjorie Denslow Meyer 
John W. Miller, Jr. 
Howard M. Nashe! 
Robert W. Page 
Eunice Stockard Palzer 
Warren P. Patzer 
C. Richard Parkins 
Edith Johnson Pennock A 
Sandra Shephard Piccone 
Anne Neide Pringle 
Joyce B. Roberts 
Jan N. Safer 
Lois Hurd Sauer 
Norman J. Schatz 
Laurence M. Schwartz 
Susan Winslow Scully 
Richard H. Seeburger 
Barbara Sklaw Sender 
Elizabeth Reichle Sbaffert 
Jane Newton Shermer 
R. Michael Shappell A 
Judith Pinkerton Shuman 
Richard F. Shuman A 
Louis P. Silverman 
Robert L. Simons 
Robert E. Singdahlsen 
Joyce Forney Skarlatos 
Gary A. Smith 
Patricia Eshelman Solomon 
Mary Gadd Specht 
Lewis Sprechrnan 
Patricia Simmons Stephan A 
Gary W. Sterner 
Donald H. Stromberg A 
Alasdair E. Swanson 
Margaret Brasaern le Theall 
George H. Thompson 
Nancy Kelley Val ego 
Ruth Stafford Wallace 
\Villiam R. Waterman 
Lee Steinwald Widhelm 
Robert J. Woodside 
Vernon W. Woodward 
Ronald M. Zeitzeff 

.... Barbara E. Berquist 
William E. Bla<:k 
Robert M. Brasier 
Elizabeth Bloss Breisch A 
Anne Saunders Burrowes 
Jack W. Carlton 
Jacqueline A. Carter 
Frank M. Caswell, Jr. 
Frederick L. Conrad 
William S. Corey 
Carol Norris Dieffenderfer 
J. Robert Dougherty 
Nancy Brown Dougherty 
James P. Fox 
John L. Frehn 
Philip C. Gery, 
John B. Gilpin 
Carl 0. Hartman 
Philip C. Herr. II A 
Ronald C. High A 
Carol J. Hiltner 
Carolyn Shoun Hobaugh 
James L. Hollinger A 
Kay Miller Hollinger 
Jean Holt 
Agnes Bruce Holst 
Jane M. Holz 
Leon I. Horner 
Benjamin Howarth 
Marv Greenside Jacobson 
Joel J. Jacobson 
Carole Seidel Jennings 
Jettie Bergman Johnston 
Robert D. Kaplan 
Francis Kaye 
Nancy Doran Kent 
G. Edward Kienzle 
Robert C. Kline .4 
Monica Warfield Kulp 
Morton P. Levitt A 
Nancy Brown Lewis 
Norman P. Lush. Jr. 
Glenn T. McGee 
Barbara Mohler Mcllvaine A 
Jeanne Wilder McNamee 
Arthur C. Mayer, Jr. 
Gwen Finkey Merolle 
John F. Morris. Jr. 
Cade Brockel bank O'Brien 
Donald O'Neill 
Wilbur M. Otto 
Robert S. Parker 
Harold S. Parlin 
Jane Platts Pebly 
Virginia Wolford Rasmussen 
Betty J. Richardson 
Brenda Roberts Roberts 
Peter J. Roberts 
Doris Weigel Rockman 
Donald H. Roeske 
Samuel Rose 
Dick T. Schafer 
Charles F. Shaffert 
Richard H. Shanaman 
Susan Hansell Shapley A 
Hilma Mimm Slechta 
Sandra Scholfield Smith 
John B. Smith 
William V. Solomon 
Inge Paul Stafford A 
Anne Biddle Tantum A 
Kermit Tantum 
Francis X. Urbanski 
Carolyn Carpenter Walker 
Thomas W. Walker 
Carol Smith Wandres 
Robert A. Watson, Ill 
G. Raymond Weaver. Jr. 
Joyce Grauel Woodside 
Anne Boyer Woodward 

1959 
Efrim Adnopoz 
Robert W. Armacost 
John J. Barranger, Jr. 
Douglas G. Best 
Don Beith 
Claude H. Benner 
George H. Bernstein 
Saralee Sachs Bernstein 
Richard R. Block 
Margaret Rutherford Boshes 
Adrian I. Bradford 
Carol Rodman Campanelli 
Arthur Cappello 
Joseph B. Carver 
Robert D. Charles 
R. Scott Clements 
Richard D. Cohen 
J. Eugene W. Connor A 
Patricia McBath Conrad 
Robert M. Davis A 
Elizabeth Bardsley DeMari110 
Thomas J. DeMarino A 
Arthur B. Duel, III 
Arlene Robinson Duprey 
Bruce F. Falconer. Jr. 
David M. Ford A 
Ann Seewald Frehn 
Marcia Brandt Frengel 

Evan C. Frey 
Michael R. Gardner 
Sally Kittredge Gifford 
David F. Gillum A 
Richard H. Goldberg A 
Philip Greenhut 
David L. Grove 
Edward Halbart 
JoAnne McKeever Hicks 
Judith Milligan Hitchner 
Ann Lemkau Houpt A 
Earl M. Hubacher 
Cynthia Phillips Hudson 
Henry C. Jones 
Joan LeVa11 Jones 
Elizabeth Kennedy Kennedy 
Ann Hooff Kline 
jonathan B. Kulp A 
Priscilla Lory Kulp 
Judson Laird. III A 
Frances Myers Lazorchick 
Paul F. Lindenmuth 
Barbara Sook Liston 
Donald M. Lockwood 
Roy H. Lockwood 
Paul A. Lotke 
Carol L. McCarty 
Anita Cowling McCarty 
Carolyn Gourley Mackes 
Henry L. Menin 
A. Vaughn Merrifield A 
Patricia Foster Moore 
Thomas L. Moore, Jr. 
Jane Aitcheson Morris 
Gordon B. Mowrer· 
Ronald M. Naditch 
Dorothy Gompf Nordwall 
Cora Reddicks Page 
Palmer L. Paules 
John H. Potts A 
G. Kirk Pusey 
Alan Rademan 
William C. Reed, Jr. 
Thomas W. Richards 
Jill Rudolph Rudzik 
Allen R. Savage 
Barbara Benedik Savage 
John M. Scarborough 
Marcia Dornin Schoettle 
Donna Wilson Schweitcr 
Joanne Totman Shanarnan 
Robert A. Shapley A 
John W. Shepherd 
Sharon Graff Shepherd 
F. Lee Shipman A 
Angelo Skarlatos A 
Alan M. Smith A 
William T. Smith 
Susan Graden S11ow A 
Leonard E. Spangler 
John R. Stafford 
Edward 0. Teitelman 
Judith Flack Urban 
Jaak Vilms 
David A. Wachter 
Roberta Snyder Wachter 
James P. Wade, Jr. 
E. Reginald Wagner 
Greta Stetser Weaver 
Jane Reader Weaver 
F. Douglas Wert 
Re.th Gordon Wert 
Nancy Mora11 Whichard 
Pamela Temrleton Wight 
John E. Williams, III A 
Carol Dorsey Wisotzki A 
Leonard A. Wood, Jr. 11 
Thomas D. Vl'right A 
Robert E. Young A 
Jay R. Zubrin 
H. Jay Zukerman 

1958 
Ward Adams 
Evan B. Alderfer, Jr. 
Charles R. Bachman, Jr. 
Walter Barnes. Jr. 
Loren F. Bayler 

1960 
David Ayers 
Dorothy Phipps Bachman 
Judith Heller Barnes 
Robert W. Earnshaw 
Herbert Bass A 
Amy Muncaster Beiler 
Dods Azin Bennett 
Casper P. Boehm, Jr. A 
Larry J. Bomgardner 
Carole Ross Bond 
Merle Tegtmeier Bottge A 
S. Lawrence Brothma.nn 
Charles R. Brown 
David W. Bupp 
Nancy Alderfer Campbell 
Daniel S. Capper 
Judith Graham Car\i'er 
Joyce Lear Cltronister 
W. Herd1rntn Clark, Jr. 
Carolyn Wherley Cleveland 
Alex T. Collins, lll 
Donald Crampton A 
Robert W. Crawford A 
John J. Curley, Jr. A 
Donald W. Davis 
Str.ph<m Davis 
Anthony J. Di Gioia A 
Robert G. Dilts 



Marjorie Crowley Edwards A 
Rocco A. Falvello 
Michael J. Feinstein 
Virginia M ussano Fisfis 
James R. Floyd 
Lucy Purvis Ford 
William C. Ford 
Bernice Foster 
Judith Ward Freeman 
Mark H. Freeman 
William A. Freeman 
George F. Gardner, III 
Eleanor Smith Gardner A 
Ira K. Goldman 
John S. Gordon 
Charles L. Haeussler 
Boyd Harbourt A 
Wendy Shea Hartman 
Judith Beck Helm 
Dorothy E. Henwood 
Richard M. Hepner 
Ann Freas Hines 
Jeanne Kaas Jones 
Edna H. Jones 
Joan Plough Kappel 
Sally Clarkson Kauffman 
Kyra Barna Keffer 
Andrew J. Knuth. Jr. 
Herbert G. Kaehler 
Neil M. Krosnev 
Gary E. Lawton 
Nelson F. Lebo A 
W. Rowland Leedy 
Marx S. Leopold A 
Ellen Weigel Liberles 
W. Lebert Lipsky 
Susan Van Cu lin Loomis A 
David L. McGahey 
Philip T. McGee 
Paul A. McGuckian 
Charles J. McMillen 
Howard J. Maat 
Jon R. Mark 
Roger E. Miller 
Rosemary Richtrnver Merest 
Aleta Stinchcomb O'Neill 
Robert )3. Ort 
Suzanne Sinclair Owens 
Robert L. Pence 
Barbara Mahn Pollock 
Wayne C. Pollock 
Nancy Cross Price A 
Thomas B. Price 
Charley Ann Perkins Rhoad' 
Elizabeth St. Claire Ruth 
John F. Shuman 
Robert F. Slifkin 
Janet Matuska Snyder 
Charles M. Spring 
Richard C. Steege 
William G. Stoddard 
Letitia Reisinger Stott 
Lee R. Supper 
Jon K. Taylor A 
Peter M. Thompson 
Carol Helfrich Webb A 
Earl D. Weiner 
Gina Ingoglia Weiner 
William B. Whichard 
Emily Robinson White 
R. A. White 
Robert G. Williamson, Jr. 
Robert T. Wilson 
Charles E. Wisor 
John Yahraes, Jr. 
Charles B. Zwally 
Mary Fox Zwally 

1961 
Anonymous 
Susan Gibbs Adnopoz 
Charlotte Stanley Alderfer 
Peter R. Andrews 
Jay A. Anglada 
Kenneth J. Barber, Jr. A 
James C. Bartoli 
"Yfary Fischer Bauer 
Thomas L. Bauer 
Sally Christmas Berman 
Bruce Bertholon ... 1 
James J. Bloom 
Howard T. Branin 
Alan S. Brown J\ 
Madelyn Nagel Bunnion 
Warren R. Butler ,1 
Andreas Bolter Campbell GMF 
Kenneth L. Campbell G1>IF 
Robert V. Carton, Jr. 
E. Gailey Chambers 
Wayne H. Claeren 
David Comly 
John Comly, Jr. 
Peggy Stephens Corey 
Ralph W. Crawford, Jr. 
Ravrnond E. Cromer 
Tlarrv B. Danner, II 
Barry Dasher 
James E. Davis A 
Stanley F. Des Marais 
Timothy S. Dinger 
Joseph C. Doyle 

STANLEY W. LINDBERG 
Class of 1961 

Division Leader 
50% Participation 

150 Donors 
FUND RECORD 

Carol Wright Drew A 
Gary L. Ehrlich 
Gerald R. Eisenberg A 
Lewis E. Elicker, III 
Ronald D. Emkcy 
Thomas E. Faley, Jr. 
Esther J. Featherer 
Margot Janssens Fetrow 
Harold W. Fitzkee, Jr. A 
Alan M. Fleishman 
Richard Flutie 
G. Alfred Forsyth 
Carol Christiansen Frey 
Robert G. Gilfillan, nr 
Barbara Miller Goodale A 
Frederick Gottshall 
Barbara Fogg Grove 
Albert D. Guckes 
James R. Haug 
John A. Heppenstal 1 .1 
Susan McDowel l Heppeustal l A 
Michael J. Hermann 
Vv. Lawrence Hess 
Lynn Reithrniller Hockenberger 
Edward W. Holmes 
June E. Holt 
Robert G. Holt, Jr. A 
Alfred J. Howell 
Chester B. Humphrey 
William D. Humphrey 
John L. 'Hurst, Ill 
Steven ]also 
Hugh W. James 
Nancy Hayes James 
Arthur L. Jenkins, Jr. A 
Charles S. Jenkins 
Linda M. Johnson 
Gretchen Kuykendall Jones 
Lynne Ness Jones 
Mary Baily Jordan 
Carol Hitchens Jordan 
Sandra Hanan Kallman 
Hans K. Kappel 
Elizabeth A. Keat 
Barbara Kelso 
W. John Layng 
Daniel L, Leahman r- 1 
Joan Yaverbau m Leopold 
Stanley W. Lindberg A 
Nina Hunsicker Lockwood 
Watson M. Lohmann 
Melissa Haynes Lokay A 
Kendall K. McCabe 
Andrea Adams McCormick A 
Reed McCormick A 
William J. McCormick 
Margot Rice McKereghan 
Robert L. McNutt .1 
W. Carey Marucci 
Richard S. Mason 
Elizabeth Matta Masters 
Lynda Bingaman Maver 
Sandra Shields Miles 
Jane Noble Mison 
Lynne Nesbitt Mitchell A 
fudith Engelke Montanaro 
J, Michael Morrissey 
Sid Mossovitz 
En ward J. Mulligan, Jr. 
Mark R. Mumma 
Nancy J. Newell A 
William J. Ober 
Nancy Fox Otto 
Lois Mecum Page 
Ronald C. Page A 
I. David Paley 
William Louis Piel A 
William H. Platt 
John J. Quirk 
Antonio Ramos-Umpiere 
Anne Sheetz Richards 
Frederick S. Richardson 

Jon W. Robbins 
John M. Rybnik 
Alan Sackman 
Lawrence M. Schecter 
Allan C. Sidle 
Barbara Keuch Simons A 
Gail Massey Simpson 
Andrea Entliss Sivitz 
Carla Seybrecht Skladany 
Jan P. Skladany 
Bruce L. Smith 
William N. Smyth 
Joan Spire 
John T. Stephens, Jr. 
Sandra Mc Pherson Sterner 
David G. Stevenson 
James R. Strohecker 
Clinton R. Studwell. Jr. 
K. R. Stuhlmuller 
M. Keith Sullivan GMF 
Ann Briner Supper 
John Terzano, Jr. 
William R. Thieler 
Barbara Jo Thome A 
Mary Lloyd Thompson A 
Alexander M. Tickner 
Richard L. Trevlvn 
William G. Tyler 
Jeanne Bartleson Van Woert 
Richard A. Vickery, Jr. A 
Douglas A. Villepique 
Ruth Hoffman Walz 
Ronald L. Waxman 
Barry R. Wickersham 
Marjorie Lawn Wilkinson 
Judith Richmond Williamson 
Joanne Macauley Wisor 
Jeffrey c. Wood 
Ruth N. Wrightstone 
Elizabeth G. Wylie 
Susan White Yahraes 
J. Gardner Zerby, Jr. A 

1962 
Anonymous 
Ann Wellington Alexander 
William G. Annan 
John W. Baker 
William D. Bitler 
Kenneth R. Bowling 
Bonnie Brown 
William J. Butcher 
Monna Klegley Clark 
Phyllis Feffer Cook A 
Sackett S. Cook A 
Carolyn Stocker Crawford 
Henry S. Crist 
Edward L. Curry 
Martha Farr Davis 
Thomas S, Davis A 
Jay A. Denbo • 
Eugene C. DeVol, Jr. 
Roberta Armstrong DeWire 
Tohn H. Dingee, Jr. 
Lorraine Mozer Eisenstat 
Frances L. Enseki 
Frank X. Eten, Jr. 
Douglas G. Everstine 
Margaret E. Fatula 
Joseph A. Feraco 
John P. Fernsler 
M. Barnett Field 
Jeffrey R. Fine A 
Barrv L. Fisher 
Harriet Harding Fitzkee A 
Charles H. Framer 
Bruce Gallit A 
Frederick C. Geiger, Jr. 
Fred S. Gilbert J\ 
B. David Giorgio 
K. B. Gosnell 
Linda Byran Goss A 
N. Bryson Goss. Jr. A 
Bert S. Gowrly, Jr. 
Elizabeth Cavanagh Gowdy 
Janet Lutz Griegel 
Patricia Cardinali Guarrera 
Carol Winzer Hatfield 
Victor J. Hetrick 
Carol Jones Hoadley 
Marcia M. Hoopes A 
R. Andrew Horsley 
Charles W. Hyman A 
H. KennctJ1 .Tackier 
Frederic Jacobs A 
David Jenney 
Helmuth W. Joel, Jr. A 
Wllliarn F. W. Jones A 
Howard E. Kalis, Ill 
Shirley Bahrs Kalis .1 
Colin P. Ke1ly, III 
Mary Cooper Kelly 
Margery A. Kepner 
Eliza beth G. Kraft 
Mary Nora .Langnas 
Julia Kerstetter Lee 
Richard Q. Lee 
Marvin I. Levin 
Jane Harry Lovinger 
Eugene Mar 
David C. Meade 
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Bernard Mjller 
Neal Miller 
Penelope L. Mitchell 
Kay Stockbridge Morrissey 
J. David Morrissey 
John W. Munca~ter 
Dorothy Ruth Neff 
William E. Owens 
Harry B. Packard 
Dean C. Pappas 
Susan White Pieroth 
Karen Johnson Primorac 
Virginia Frost Pusey 
Gwendolyn Coronway Radosevic 
Carol Lawrence Reilly A 
David C. Rilling 
Peter B. Sandmann 
Phyllis Morse Seim A 
Guy M. Selheimer 
Suzanne Sheffer 
Donald L. Shive 
Klara Moser Smith 
Charles B. Smith A 
James V. Snyder 
William M. Steckley 
Gwen Wilkins Steege 
George F. Stehley, II I 
Carl R. Steindel 
Carl B. Stoner, Jr. 
Helen W. Stuart 
Steven 'N. Swartley 
Richard S. Thatcher 
John C. Thomas A 
Sheldon C. Thomas 
Jane Bidwell Thompson A 
Walter D. Todd A 
James R. Townhill 
Richard Tull A 
Carol Weiant Villepique 
Lynn Hammond Voss A 
Durbin L. Wagner 
Angus D. Wallace 
Sally McClain Wallace 
Stephen b. Warner 
William B. Weitzel 
Gay D. Wells 
James J. Whitesell 
Lloyd S. Williams 
Donald G. Wilson 
Alice Conklin Wood 
Stuart A. Wurtman 
L. David York, Jr. 
Martha J. Young 

1963 
John D. Adams, Jr. 
Barbara St1mt Andrews 
Joseph K. Andrews 
Edward D. Blanchard 
Lyle W. Bliss 
Jerry D. Bole A 
Judith L. Bostock 
David A. Brauner 
Barbara A. Buechner A 
Donald R. Buxton. Jr. 
Richard I. Burstein 
Thomas E. Cadwallader 
Vincent G. Caruso 
Benjamin A. Cero 
David P. Chapin A 
Susan Pastore Chapin A 
Susa!l Chase 
David R, Chipkin 
Gail Schwenk Colfelt 
H. Todd Colfelt 
Michael S. Collins 
Keith B. Cooper 
\:Vayne N. Cordes 
J. Markle Costenbader 
Roger M. Craver A 
Lester A. Crens 
Janet Miller Crooks 
Peter 0. Cronse 
Ann Conser Curley A 
JoAnne L. DeMon.te 
Jean Van Orner Dick 
Donald T. Dockstader 
Rohert T. Donohue 
John W. Donglas. Jr. 
Allan M. Elf man 
Justine Englert 
David J. Eskin 
N arbeth L. Evans 
James J. Eyster, Jr. A 
Allen D. Field 
Peter Figdor 
John P. Fillman 
Gordon D. Fronk 
Louis E. Fisher A 
John W. Gibson 
Jeffrey H. Gorham 
William M. Gormly 
Robert A. Green 
Sue Anne Grier 

A-Fund Volunteer 
GMF-Gilbert Malcolm Fellow 



Allan K. Grim, Jr. 
Terrence K. Hancock 
John F. Harper 
Robert T. Henderson 
Marian Moorhouse Hetrick 
John C. Humphrey 
Susan Jacoby 
Ann Johnson Jobbins 
Joan Pawling Joel 
Nancy Arndt Jones A 
James F. Jordan 
Ann Thompson Kern 
Barbara Geyer Keyser .4 
Fred K. Kirchner, Jr. ,1 
Alice E. Knox 
Robert L. Knupp 
Richard B. Koehane 
Charlotte Berberian Lamb 
Robert E. Lamb 
Constance J, Laws 
Carol Durbin Lebo 
Marion \V. Lee A 
Jeanne Heller Lindberg .4 
Marianne Huddy Lipa 
Joan Taussig LowelJ 
Jean Weller McClelland A 
John R. McClelland 
Charles R. McCracken 
Susan Schmidt McCracken 
Barbara Duvall McGraw 
Judith Everett Mc Kee 
Hunter Mann, Ill 
Dency Hulett Mann 
Richard Mann, Jr. 
Kathleen L. Martin 
Albert G. Miller 
Jeffrey A. Monachino 
Judy A. Moneta A 
Louis D. Moore. II 
Judith Ann Morris A 
Joseph H. Newby 
Harriet Boyer Oler 
Jack E. Op passer 
Judith Northam Oppasser 
Paul H. Ostien. Jr. 
Ellen Hasenrit ter Packard 
H. Donald Pasquale 
Suellen Peltz 
Richard A. Reeder 
Ronald T. E. Rizzolo 
James L. Roberts 
Edward F. Rockman 
Ronald K. Rogers 
H. Roy Rosen 
Philip A. Rosenfeld 
George W. Rupprecht, Jr. 
Robert A. Saalfeld 
William K. Schantzenbach A 
Edith Vedova Schmitz 
l\lillard R. Shoff 
Whitney B. Smyth A 
Jerrilyn Bingaman Snyder 
William E. Spatz 
Joan L. Spicer 
John H. Standing 
Linda Goodridge Steckley A 
Richard D. Steel 
Joan Stohr Stehley 
Theodore W. Stellwag, Jr. 
Mary Wagner Stouffer 
Thomas R. Stretton, Jr. 
Thomas C. Test 
Linda Grainger Trevlyn 
Delores Barnes Truitt 
John F. Ulrich 
Louis Verdell i 
Charles Wagner A 
Emily Zilinsky Wagner A 
Barbara Greer Warden A 
Richard M. Warden A 
Charles Wasilko 
George L. Whitwell 
Michael W. Witwer .4 
Samuel W. Witwer, Jr. A. 
Scott A. Williams 
Sydney G. Willson, III 
David S. Woolston 
Suzanne Straight York 
Carol Lindstrom Young 
Richard M. Young 

1964 
Merritt J, Aldrich, Jr. A 
Sandra Currier Andrews 
Robert W. Andrus 
Carolyn Green Anstine 
Susan Earl Baker 
Joel W. Barish 
Robert E. Bellet 
Katharine E. Best 
Carolyn F. Betts 
Eugene K. Betts 
M. S. Blumenthal 
Henry H. Bolter A 
Virginia Compton Burger 
Stephen P. Burger 

A-Fund Volunteer 

Skott B. Burkland 
Katharine Strite Caldwell 
Nancy M. Carlson 
Merritt Carlton 
Hilma Forsberg Cooper .A .. 
Virginia Krueger Costenbader 
Carole Crompton Creps 
Gordon N. Crosby 
Edison C. Eater 
Judith Schenck Eater 
Jane Jackson Erlandson 
Norman Ferrell, Jr. 
H. Richard Flammer 
Blaine W. Fox 
Roberta Williams Francis 
Alexander S. Frazier 
James E. Gauntt 
John T. Gordon 
Lawrence R. Gray 
Arthur J. Greendlinger 
F. Scott Greenfield A 
Jane Howland Grim 
Eric J. Groves 
Richard H. Guckert 
David Harrell 
Ann Esterline Haug 
George W. Hemphill, Jr. 
Robert E. Hindle A 
Glenn E. Hitchens 
Leslie Davidson Hobbs 
Emily Zug Huebner A 
Joseph B. Icenhower, Jr. 
George F. Ingersoll. Jr. 
Theodore J. Johnson A 
Betsy A. Jones 
Linda J. Jones 
Thomas D. Jones 
R. Bruce Kelner, Jr. A 
Charles K. Kenney 
Fred R. Klunk 
Norma Souser Kocher 
Stuart M. Lamb, Jr. 
John P. Laszlo 
Joyce Kopenhaver Lerch 
John L. LeRoy, Jr. 
Susan Crowley LeRoy 
Alison Loew 

Peter C. Spring A 
Jeffrey L. Stambaugh 
Barbara Jacobs Mohn 
Alfred R. Stiscia ' 
John B. Taylor 
Robert F. Taylor 
Susan Teller 
Mary Ellen Templeton 
Bradley D. Thompson 
James M. Tindall, III 
Dennis E. Vance 
Phillip Washburn 
Fred C. Weidner 
Frank D. Wettstein 
Edward H. White 
H. William \'li'hite 
James H. Woodring 
Ada Enck Yost 
Peter Zuvus 

1965 
Karen Zwart Aarons A 
Linda Harvey Aldrich 
John C. Arndt, IV A 
Sally Howard Barnes 
Stephanie K. Barney 
J. Lawrence Bayley 
Dennis L. Berton 
Henry M. Bishop 
Susan Davis Bole 
James R. Brinkley, Jr. 
Ralph M. Burnett 
Richard E. Childs, Jr. 
Maureen Newton Coleman 
Lee R. Cordes 
Norman C. Coyle 
Charles R. Craig 
Forrest E. Craver, III 
Victor C. Diehm, Jr. 
Eric I. Dissinger 
Frederick H. Etherington, Jr. A 
Felicia Gaskin 

1967 DICKINSON FUND SUMMARY 
Alumni . . ..... 

Alumni-Corporate Matching Gifts 
Parents . . . 

Parent-Corporate Matching Gifts 
Friends, Faculty & Administration 
Corporate and Foundation Gifts 

$ro7,050 
3,575 

22,528 
2,410 

37,965 
75,052 

Total 

William B. Lowe 
Christopher Lowell 
Sally Phillips Luczak A 
Roger L. McAlister 
William M. McCarty, Jr. 
Clark A. McKnight .4 
Douglas R. McPherson 11 
Alan R. Markizon 
Charles A. Markley 
Robert A. Meade 
Robert H. Meyers 
Jacqueline Bahrs Montanus 
Mary Beth Nevins 
Ronald D. Nichols 
Herbert J. Orenstein 
Iole Hafer Picton 
E. Barry Pinheiro 
Gerald J. Piserchia. Jr. 
Peter M. Partmann 
Vaughan W. Pratt 
Albert R. Rago 
Michael R. Rapuano 
Martin Rathke 
W. Gale Reish 
Charlotte L. Renshaw 
M. M. Riddlesberger. Jr. A 
Millard M. Riggs, Jr. 
Connie Courtright Rockman 
Lance D. Rogers 
Brenda A. Sadler 
Sandra M. Schiavo 
Robert E. Schlosser 
Adele J. Schneider A 
Robert D. Schwarz A 
J. Daniel Shaver 
Patricia Hitchens Shaver 
Stanley M. Sheldon 
Virginia Sutton Shoff 
Paul M. Showalter, Jr. 
Shirley Berberian Skirven 
Faith Kazanjian Smith 
Carolee Birch Smith 
Milton R. Smith 
Henry C. Smither, II 1 
Howard Spencer 
Marilyn Detweiler Splete 

Muriel Friedman Green 
Virginia Hendler Greendlinger 
Betty Kay Gricsemer A 
Shelley Woods Griffith 
Thomas II. Hallam 
Judith Henning Harper 
Jane Clvma Harwood 
Andrew C. Hecker 
Gilbert B. Henyon 
Neil A. Hermann 
Joseph R. Hoffman 
Marlin E. Hofman 
James D, Hutchinson 
Linda Ashcraft Hutchinson 
Linnes Imler 
Elizabeth Sully Ireland 
Edwina Challinor Kintner 
Jonathan Kintner 
H. Elaine Koran 
Leslie D. Leong 
Glenn C. Limbaugh, Jr. 
Charles H. Lippy 
William C. Lord 
Gail Mc Brayer 
John F. McClelland 
Harry E. J:v.fangle 
Anne Tindall Markley 
Karen Almstead Meade A 
John T. Means 
Claire Madison Metcalfe 
Robert S. Mettler 
Pamela Searles Miller 
Beverly S. Morey A 
Robert L. Mumper 
Barry J. Nace 
L. Frederick Neff 
Michael Nemec 
John H. Nichols 
Carol Nuetzman 
Lawrence A. Ral1(1 
Andrew Y. Rogers. Jr. A 
Judy Rogers 
Mary Nolan Rogers 
Jeffrey R. Sandmann 
Sarah Sansbury 
Richard D. Schwarz 

Raymond E. Scurfield 
Christina Schmidt Selheimer 
James C. Shart 
Charles A. Shukis 
Ida Jane Sia 
Jay F. Smith, III 
Ralph E. Smith 
Ann Smith Snyder 
Lawrence E. Snyder 
Barbara A. Spengler 
S. Kathryn St egrneier 
Margaret F. Strong 
Kurt E. Suter 
John \V. Thomas 
Arthur L. Tillman, Ill 
Margaret Kingman Wallace 
Barry L. Warren A 
Sue Herley Wasilko 
Sandra Kagarise Weidner 
Emilie Young Wilson 
Lewis A. Wilson, III 
Nancy A. Witherell 

1966 
Carolyn Asher 
Barry W. Barto 
Ella Sue Bone 
Katherine W. Broberg 
Carolyn F. Bryant 
Kathleen Hershey Buchenauer 
Allison A. Browning 
Ronald S. Buist 
Peter G. Cleaveland 
Suzanne Pernet Cleaveland 
James R. Davis 
Charles K. Detwiler, Jr, 
Judith Smith Detwiler 
William H. Dodd, Jr. 
Nancy Wilsen Donohue 
James A. Edris 
Bradley B. Geist A 
David C. Hancock 
Frances Decker Hancock 
Karen Barrowclough Hancock 
Melbourne K. Harwood 
Virginia T. Hodge 
Pamela Graston Holston 
Robert G. Holston 
Ann E. Horlacher 
Judith McDowell Icenhower 
Anne D. Jillson 
Kim Larson Johnson 
Nicholas J. Kempf. III 
Su Carroll Kenderdine 
Lester Krasno 
Edward F. Lamson 
Elizabeth R. Lane 
C. Mark Lauer 
Richard A. Levie 
Mary J. Long 
Alan B. Lottner 
David E. Manoogian 
Judith Aux Manoogian 
Peggy F. Margolies 
\V. Thoma• Mecouch 
Jeanne E. Menzie 
Anthony B. Morris 
Donald Neidig, Jr. 
Lewis D. Oppenheimer 
Doris Detweiler Ormsby 
Robert Oskarn 
Diane Dupy Rand 
James H. Reinhart 
David Richman 
Wayne F. Rickert 
John W. Ritchie 
Paul A Rabell 
Judy Elder Rogers 
Joel I. Rome 
Patricia Salisbury 
R. William Sharer 
Jeffry Shaw 
J oanne Sherman 
James N. Snyder 
Carol L. Stamatis 
Peter G. Stanley 
Sally J. Stevenson 
Allen H. Stix 
W. Eugene Strite 
John M. Tassie, Jr. A 
George E. Thomas, II 
W. Thomas Tither A 
Judith Twigg 
Lawrence R. Veile 
Christofer A. Volz 
Elizabeth A. Wagner 
csu H. Watt 
Richard D. Weigel 
John R. Winfield 
Richard G. Wolf, Jr. 
William F. Woods 

1967 
Elizabeth Bishop Wolf 

1969 
Jennifer Langworthy Volz 

1970 
John L. Trickey 



Mrs. Elizabeth R. Adams 
C. Scott Althouse*GMF 
American Alumni Council 
Mr. and Mrs. William H. Baker" 
GMF 

Dr. and Mrs. Newell Snow 
Booth*BRA 

Mr. and Mrs. Edward H. Bower 
Mrs. John Buyer GMF 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl P. Clare*JDS 
Mr. and Mrs. Craig W. Crowell 
GMF 

George E. Deshon 
Robert C. Duffy 
Mrs. Sylvester M. Evans 
Horace S. Felton GMF 
Mrs. Mary Sharp Foucht*JDS 

Merle F. Allshouse 
Bruce R. Andrews 
Patricia B. Andrews 
Paul F. Angiolillo 
Edward J. Ashnault 
Kathleen Barber 
Daniel R. Bechtel 
John E. Benson 
William H. Benson 
Marianna Bogojavlensky 
Harry F. Booth 
William R. Bowden 
Kathleen Braught 
John H. Broujos 
Louise Broujos 
David B. Brubaker 
Truman C. Bullard 
James Carson 
Ignatius S. Cipolla 
Stephen Coslett 
Michel dcRepentigny 
Bettie Anne Doebler 
John W. Doebler 
Joseph G. DuCharme 
David B. Eavenson 
Frederick P. Ferre 
Arturo A. Fox 
Mary Ann Funk 
Warren J. Gates 
Harold R. Gillespie, Jr. 
David I. Gleim, Emeritus 
Donald T. Graffam GMF 

NON-ALUMNI FRIENDS 

Adm. and Mrs. C. E. Perkins 
GMF 

Laura F. Porter 
Mrs. Mary Ames Raffensperger* 
GMF 

Robert L. Reamy 
Julia E. Roop 
Mrs. Isaac Silverman 
Mrs. Ernest J. Simeone 
Roy M. Smith GMF 
Gilbert R. Stonesifer 
Mrs. Malcolm R. Taylor 
Dr. and Mrs. David VanPelt 
GMF 

Mr. and Mrs. Carrol J. Warrell 
Mrs. John D. Yeagley GMF 

NON-ALUMNI FACULTY 
AND ADMINISTRATION 

Board of Education of The Methodist Church 
Central Pennsylvania Conference of The Methodist Church 
Philadelphia Annual Conference of The Methodist Church 
Southern New Jersey Annual Conference of The Methodist Church 
Western Pennsylvania Conference of The Methodist Church 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert M. Fuess" 
JDS 

Mr. and Mrs. John Garrett 
Mrs. Mary A. Gawenus 
Mrs. Alice S. Goodyear 
Mrs. Emma L. Grubb 
Mrs. M. Wilson Harris 
Donald Havwood GMF 
Mrs. Helen. B. Hering BRA 
Dr. and Mrs. David A. Johnston 
Mr. and Mrs. David A. John- 
ston, Jr. 

Mrs. Rebecca C. Johnston 
H. G. Kenagy 
Clarence E. Lovejoy 
Michael Lubin JDS 
Leonard G. Mathias 
John McKee Scholarship Com­ 

mittee 
"Trustee 

Peter C. Greene 
Heber R. Harper 
Alfred N. Hartshorn GMF 
John S. Henderson 
Elmer C. Herber GMF 
Jeanne L. Hockley 
Amos B. Horlacher 
A. Craig Houston 
Gordon H. Howatt, Jr. 
William B. Jeffries 
Joyce E. Keiser 
Flint Kellogg GMF 
Charles D. Kepner, Emeritus 
John L. King 
W. Wright Kirk 
G. Richard Kuch 
John H. Light 
Philip N. Lockhart 
Howard C. Long 
Nancy J. Loughridge 
Josephine McCullough 
Barbara McDonnld 
Daniel McDonald 
Samuel H. Magill 
Donald T. Marleski 
Carolyn J. Martin 
Peter E. Martin 
Enrique Martinez 
Thomas C. Mentzer 
John H. Munch 
Cordelia M. Neitz 
Roger E. Nelson GMF 
GMF-Gilbert Malcolm Fellow 

Stanley Nodder, Jr. 
N. Ronald Pease 
John C. Pflaum 
Arthur D. Platt 
Margaret D. Platt 
J. Forrest Posey, Jr. 
Arthur Prinz, Emeritus 
Michael P. Richard 
Dieter J. Rollfinke 
Gerald C. Roper 
Eugene J. Rossi 
Herbert Royce, Emeritus 
Ralph Schecter, Emeritus 
Joseph Schiffman 
H. Wade Seaford, Jr. 
Donald R. Seibert 
Singleton Sheaffer 
Richard M. Sia GMF 
William Sloane 
Gordon A. Stegink 
Joan M. Steigleman 
John W. Steigleman, Jr. 
Adrien L. Steinberg 
William W. Virgin, Jr. 
Bruce E. Vogelsang 
Richard H. Wanner 
Nettie Rae Weidner 
Henry G. Witman 
Henry L. Yeagley 
Lawrence T. Yeo 
Henry J. Young 



PARENTS 
ANNUAL 
GIVING 

Leslie B. Aaron 
Courtney B. Adams, Jr. 
Wade S. Adams 
Mrs. Esther E. Affleck 
William R. Ainley 
Edward P. Alexander 
Hartse! Dale Allen 
Joseph J. Alvino 
Gerald H. Amsterdam 
Albert H. Angerman 
William B. Anspacher 
Walter Y. Anthony 
Robert H. Archer 
Thomas S. Armstrong Gll1F 
Woodrow G. Arnold 
Linsey S. Ashley 
Myron W. Asnis 
John B. Atherholt 
Eugene D. Badgley, Sr. 
Walter S. Bailets 
Mrs. Clarence H. Baker 
Fred J. Baker 
[Clarence V. Balancia 
Rignal W. Baldwin GMF 
Wayne L. Balthaser 
James E. Barks 
Benjamin Baram 
Alfred F. Barr 
William W. Barr 
Mrs. Dorothy Barsumian 
Archie J. Battista 
Fred P. Baughman 
Frank F. Baumgartner 
John L. Bear 
Edward Beckerman 
Harold Bedick 
Evan R. Beecher 
Richard E. Benson 
Gabriel Berk 
George E. Best 
Walter C. Betts 
Lawrence S. Bickley 
Daniel T. Birdsall 
Edward H. Bishop 
Francis A. Bishop 
Austin W. Bittle 
Henry Blank 
Vernon L. Blodgett 
Edwin M. Blumenthal 
Malcolm C. Boggs 
Joseph Bonanno 
Vance E. Booher 
Robert E. Boos 
Henry C. Borger 
David M. Boyd 

JDS-John Dickinson Society 
BRA-Benjamin Rush Associate 
GMF-Gilbert Malcolm Fellow 

John T. Bradley, Jr. 
Mrs. Brooks Branon 
Karl L. Braun 
Walter E. Brewer GMF 
Austin W. Brizendine 
Richard A. Broberg 
Philip Bronstein 
Alwin R. Brown 
John G. Bruce 
Frederick B. Bryant 
Clyde S. Buckingham 
John L. Buckley 
James N. Buckwalter 
Terrence M. Burak 
Edward B. Burr BRA 
Lawrence C. Burris 
Lawrence A. Cabot BRA 
Spencer V. Cadmus 
Joseph P. Caminiti 
Mrs. Alice Carey 
James B. Carey 
Chester L. Cashdollar 
Warren Cassel, Jr. 
Thomas A. Casev GMF 
William S. Cashel, Jr. 
William W. Cassell GMF 
William J. Cave 
Charles B. Ceppi GMF 
James R. Chaffinch, Jr. 
Henry Chauncey 
Glenn J. Christensen 
E. Ramon Clyma 
William E. Coffman 
Frank S. Cole GMF 
George W. Coleman GMF 
Mrs. Charles F. Collins, Sr. 
Robert E. Colwell 
Lawrence A. Cone 
Cameron H. Conover 
William P. Conrad 
Winfield C. Cook JDS 
Enoch W. Cook 
James W. Cooney 
Joseph S. Cordes 
David M. Cordray 
William B. Costenbader 
Joseph W. Crane 
David R. Crocker 
George R. Crompton 
William B. Cronin 
Kenneth W. Crooks 
Patrick H. Cross 
Mrs. Margaret E. Crowley 
P. W. Cummings, Jr. 
Samuel B. Cupp, Sr. 
Donald D. Dalrymple 
John M. Davidson GMF 
William H. Davidson 
Carlton Davies 
Delmar R. Davies 
George H. Davis 
Morris S. Davis, Jr. GMF 

l Alfred K. Day, Jr. 
Arthur R. Day, Jr. 
Lloyd W. Deamer 
George A. Dean 
Joseph DeBenedictis 
John P. M. DeBolt JDS 
William H. Decker, Jr. 
Martin C. Dellinger 
Mrs. H. H. Des Marais 
Ralph De Voe 
Jan A. DeVries GMF 
Edwin A. Diernand GMF 
Alvin Dischell 
Joseph N. Doctrow 
Frank P. Dodson 
John W. Douglas 
Milton M. Dubow 
Leib B. Dunlap 
Mrs. Lore M. Dye 
Mrs. Emily Easton 
John E. Eberhardt 
Richard W. Eckstein 
Harry Efraemson 
Thomas F. Egan 
Nathan Ehrens 
Brian P. Emerson 
Mrs. Mary S. Emert 
Carleton H. Endemann 
Edward W. Engel 
Ephraim J. Epstein 
Ezra J. Epstein 
Eric S. Ericsson GMF 
Oscar Erlandsen GMF 
Raymond M. Eshelman 
Leonard Eskin GMF 
Frederick H. Etherington 
Loren L. Eves 
James R. Eynon GMF 
J. Jeffries Eyster 
Eugene Fanta GMF 
H. Gordon Faulkner 
Robert H. Featherstone, Jr. 
Stephen Fedok 
James S. Feight, Sr. 
David Felsher 
Justin C. Feltham 
John B. Ferguson, Jr. GMF 
Herbert R. Ferrell 
George E. Fissel 
James 0. Flower GMF 
Woodford L. Flowers 
Robert D. Foothorap 
Al Forman 
Earl W. Fornwalt 
Edwin M. Foster 
Frederick S. Fox, Jr. 
Mrs. Julia S. Francis 
France Fraze 
G. Harrison Frazier, Jr. 
Graham French BRA 
John L. French 
Glenn B. Frey GMF 
Abraham Friedman 
George Friedman 
Jack B. Friedman 
Robert M. Fuoss 'JDS 
Richard S. Furbush 
Palmer H. Futcher 
Charles E. Galley 
Hugo H. Garbers 
Frederick M. Garfield 
Herman P. Gay 
Joseph F. Gayman GMF 
John E. Geare 
William W. Gearhart 
George Gerlay 
Lester D. Gill 
Frank X. Giustra 
Edward W. Givens 
Martin A. Glasmire 
Harold Gold 
Clarence W. Gonnerman 
E. Howard Goodwin 
William H. Gordon 
Hobert Gorfine 
Thomas Gorman 

I 
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Kenneth M. Gorrell 
Leon Gottlieb 
Ralph L. Graham 
Cyril W. Greene 
Laurence G. Griesemer 
Samuel E. C. Griffin 
Donald W. Grimes 
John H. Groome, Jr. GMF 
Carl Grossman 
Robert Hachenburg 
Harold F. Hagerty 
Matt E. Haggerty 
George A. Hahn 
Walter R. Haile GMF 
Frederick Hall 
Harold F. Hall 
W. Nelson Hall 
D. Dale Hamilton, Jr. 
Thomas R. Hancock 
Earl R. Handler 
William Handler 
Max A. Hankin GMF 
John I. Hanly 
Paul J. Hanna 
Einar C. Hansen 
James M. Harris 
Merrill S. Harris 
Albert Harrison 
Francis W. Hartzell 
H. Rushton Harwood, Jr. GMF 
John Davis Hatch 
Herbert D. Haverfield 
Paul A. Heavener 
Paul J. Herley 
Benjamin Hersh 
James M. Hess 
Mrs. Wilma S. Hill 
Mever Hirsh 
Fra.ncis G. Hodge, Jr. 
John H. Hoeveler 
Samuel M. Hoffman 
John D. Hopper GMF 
Albert J. Hornung, Jr. 
Allan A. Horowitz GMF 
John D. Horst, Jr. 
William Horwitz 
Leroy A. Howard 
B. Ray Howard 
William M. Howdon 
Ernest Humphries 
Roy E. Hunt 
John Hunter 
Robert A. Hunter JDS 
John R. Husband 
Francis X. Hutchinson 
Joel G. Ivy 
Horace L. Jacobs, Jr. 
Horace L. Jacobs, III 
Simon I. Jacobson 
Walter Jagiello 
E. Bryant Jefferson, Jr. 
Donald R. Jenkins 
Robert S. Jenks 
Bradford S. Jones 
Frank C. Jones GMF 
James A. Jones 
Lester C. Jones 
Richard F. Jost 
Albert J udelle 
Alfred H. juechter 
Abraham Kahane 
Irving Kaplan 
Bernard Kasten baum 
Kalman Kave 
Roy C. Keene 
Robert Kemp 
Mrs. Charles H. Kennedy 
H. Kaye Kerr 
James W. Kettle GMF 
Steve F. Killian 
MacGregor Kilpatrick 
Mrs. Josephine E. Kimmerle 
Walter P. Kincaid 
William H. Kinety, Jr. 
Charles C. Kirby 
John F. Kirk 



Lucien J. Kirkby GMF 
Richard A. Kittle, Sr. 
Richard A. Klein, Jr. 
William J. Kleinfelder 
J. Edward Klinger 
J. James Knox 
Blaine L. Kocoloski 
Edgar J. Kohnstarnm GMF 
John F. Kolb, Jr. 
Neil A. Koop GMF 
Andrew Korinda 
Martin Kremer 
Charles W. Kugler GMF 
Paul B. Kulik 
Ralph I:-1. Laffier 
Max H. Landsman 
Edwin A. Lane 
George T. Langdon 
Gerald V. Lannholm 
George F. Lanzi GMF 
Eric G. Larson GMF 
Berton F. Laramore 
Stanley J. Lawwill GMF 
Henry D. Lederer 

· Harry H. Lenney 
Paul Lewis Lentz 
Henry F. Lerch 
.T oseph Lerner 
Humboldt W. Leverenz 
Norman L. Levin 
Lawrence A. Lindquist 
James K. Linnan 
Allen R. Lloyd 
Robert W. Long 
H. Coulter Longcope 
Mrs. Araceli R. Loomie 
Fred A. Lorentz 
Richard S. Lowell 
Walter Luftman 
Arthur J. Lyle 
Harold W. Lynn 
John S. McAbee GMF 
Brower McClintock 
Robert C. McCormick GMF 
Richard E. McCray, Jr. 
W. Alexander McCune, Jr. 
Ellwood L. McDade 
Mrs. Lois E. McDonnell 
Donald McDonough, Jr. 
Thomas McDowell 
Robert K. Mdlnnes 
Harry A. McKee 
Oliver McKnight 
Robert C. McKnew 
Bernard McLean 
John H. Macintyre 
Finlay MacLennan GMF 
William Malloy, Jr. 
Mrs. Teresa Mangiaracina 
Arnold S. Mann JDS 
Mrs. Milton Mann 
Sanford S. Marateck 
Vincent B. Marantz 
Andy N. Marge 
Roy J. Marian 
Manfred R. Marini GMF 
Warren W. Marston 
Stanton C. Martens 
Kenneth V. Martin 
Robert J. Martin 
Abraham Massetti 
Eugene C. Mazzola 
Karl F. Mech 
James F. Merriman 
George J. Methlie, Sr. 
John J. Mezey 
J. Douglas Miller 
Mrs. Sara R. Miller 
Thomas E. Miller 
Joseph G. Mintz BRA 
Ali R. Misdik 
john D. Mitchell 
Frasiar A. Montgomery 
Robert Montgomery GMF 
Mark E. Morgenrhal 
Kenneth G. Morris GMF 

Richard B. Morrisey 
William A. Morrison, Jr. GMF 
Russell L. Morse 
Philip Moskowitz 
Charles M. Moyer 
Frank R. Munch 
Nels Munson 
Warner Munter 
Charles E. Murphy 
Jacob M. Myers 
Thomas I. Myers 
W. Ellsworth Newell 
John C. Niece GMF 
William A. Nixon 
James J. Nolan 
Ralph H. Nolan BRA 
Gilbert C. Norton 
Mrs. Althea G. Noyes 
Robert L. O'Brien 
Rahlban E. Odetts 
Mrs. Julia T. O'Hara 
Richard H. Oliver 
Samuel Oller 
Herman G. Olson 
William P. Orr, III 
William J. Osborne 
John E. Paden 
Paul P. Parker 
Dominick D. Pasquale 
Bruce R. Payne, II 
John W. Payne GMF 
Stanley W. Pearson, Jr. 
G. Wesley Pedlow JDS 
Russell G. Perkins 
Lloyd S. Persun, Jr. GMF 
Norman L. Petersen 
Arthur L. Peterson GMF 
Albin Pfeifer 
Edward A. Phillips 
Samuel R. Phillips 
Edward J. Polloway 
Samuel Popp 
Willis T. Porch, Jr. 
Ernest F. Pratt 
Thomas B. Price, Jr. 
Sandy M. Pringle 
Samuel E. Printz 
Anthony Quintile, Jr. 
Albert E. Rago · 
Roy L. Rascovar 
Milton H. Ratner 
Paul E. Rauschenbach 
Walter D. Reese 
A. T. Regelman GM.F 
Raymond C. Regnier, Jr. 
Richard N. Renshaw · 
Charles L. Resnick 
Mrs. J. C. Rettenrnayer 
George W. Reynolds 
Mrs. Murtha Reynolds 
Paul S. Rich 
Fred T. Richards GMF 
Bernard Richman 
Harold A. Richmond 
Mrs. Laree D. Riley 
John W. Ritchie, Sr. 
Jerome Robbins 
Al Roberts 
Andrew Y. Rogers 
Dew Romanovics 
Frank 0. Romeo 
Andrew Romito 
Frederick C. Rorick 
Irving Rosenberg 
Bernard Rothman 
Walter Rothschild 
Sid Rubin 
Herbert C. Rubright 
Mrs. Ettie Ruhe 
Mrs. Mildred S. Ruhl 
Gustave M. Rundbaken 
Mrs. Catharine B. Sanders GMF 
Michael T. Sands 
Vivian Sauvage 
Albert E. Scheflen 
Morris Schiff GMF 

JOHN B. FERGUSON, JR. 
Chairman 1966-67 

Parents Advisory Council 

Bert Schnell 
Richard Schoeninger 
Joseph G. Schoggen GMF 
Richard M. Schreiber 
Gustav H. Schroeder 
Martin L. Schulman GMF 
Arnold R. Schultz 
Mrs. Walter W. Schwartz, Jr. 
David A. Scott 
J. Donald Scott GMF 
John W. Scott 
John P. Seabrooke 

.Roland E. Selden 
Edward A. Shapiro 
Milton Shenkman 
Samuel B. Sherwin 
Norman J. Shirk 
Herschel E. Shortlidge 
Robert N. Shriver 
Simon Shullman 
Israel Shulman 
Robert M. Sigler 
Mrs. Mollie C. Silver 
R. Tate Simpson GMF 
Franklin J. Sirlin 
John E. Skilton 
C. Stuart Smith 
Charles W. Smith GMF 
James T. Smith, II 
Paul F.. Smith 
Richard 0. Smith BRA 
Samuel P. Smith 
William R. Smith 
J. Lowell Smithey 
William E. Snell GMF 
David T. Snowdon 
John J. Snyder BRA 
Anton W. Sohrweide 
Joseph S. Spector 
Charles L. Spoler 
Frederick W. Spooner GMF 
David Springe! 
George W. Staley 
G. Russell Stevenson 
Russell S. Stine 
Elias R. Stoller 
C. Richard Stover 
Richard W. Stowell 
Stephen J. Straub 
Don E. Strehlau 
James A. Strite, Sr. 
Ed ward Strokoff 
Harvey M. Stuart GMF 
Jay B. Stuck 
Robert K. Studenmuncl 
Amos w·. Stults 
William I. Sutton 
E. Norman Swam 
John Syrnunovich 

RICHARD 0. SMITH 
Chairman 

Finance Committee 
Parents Advisory Council 

Wilbur C. Sze 
Peter J. Tamburro 
Berwick Tavlor 
Edgar A. Taylor 
Leland B. Taylor 
Harry A. Teitelbaum 
Stephen A. Teller 
John R. Thiem 
Roger B. Thomas 
H. David Thompson, Jr. 
Oscar T. Thompson 
Emil A. Tiboni 
Arthur L. Tillman 
W. Thomas Tither GMF 
Samuel C. Totaro, Sr. 
John Trickey, Jr. GMF 
Andrew Tulley GMF 
Mrs. Daniel Turse 
Douglas Beck Tyler 
Frank Tyska 
Russell R. Tyson GMF 
Erwin I. Ulman 
Robert S. Vance 
David E. Varner 
Hewitt I. Varney 
Paul A. Vaughan GMF 
Bruno Verdelli 
Edward H. Vican 
Carl J. Vogt 
Arthur A. Wahrnann 
Quentin M. Walton 
Norman W. Walz 
Nicholas Wasilewski 
Houston H. Wasson GMF 
Neal A. Weber 
Robert H. Weiner 
William Weiner 
Roger Wellington 
John J. Whalen 
Allen J. White 
Frank L. White 
George C. White, Jr. 
W. C. Whitwell 
Charles Whitlow 
Ellis Ray Williams 
J. Palmer Williams 
John Williams, Jr. 
William P. Wilson 
Helen Laird Winkler 
Mrs. Lillian Wolff 
Donald G. Wright 
Franklin C. Yoh 
Mrs. Betty Ellen Young 
John J. Young, Jr. 
Thomas R. Young GMF 
E. Parker Yutzler 
David Zakroff 
I. Edward Zeitz 



Thank You 

CORPORATION AND FOUNDATION 
SUPPORT FOR ANNUAL GIVING 

Aero Oil Company 
Aetna Life Insurance Company" 
Alcoa Foundation** 
AMP Incorporated 
American Bank and Trust Com­ 
pany of Pennsylvania** 

American Home Products Cor- 
poration" 

American Oil Foundation 
Armco Foundation" 
Armstrong Cork Company" 
Atlas Chemical Industries, Inc.* 
Boardwalk National Bank 
Budd Company Foundation, Inc. 
Bulletin Contributionship 
Burlington Industries Founda- 
tion* 

Buttonwood Foundation, Inc. 
Cameron Auto, Inc. 
Campbell Soup Company" 
Carlisle Tire and Rubber Com- 
pany 

Carpenter Steel Company 
Cerro Corporation" 
Charles H. Clark Foundation 
Charles Weinstein Foundation 
The Chase Manhattan Bank 
Foundation" 

Chemical Bank New York Trust 
Company" 

Christian R. and Mary F. Lind­ 
back Foundation 

Connecticut Bank and Trust 
Company 

Connecticut General Life Insur­ 
ance" 

Connecticut Mutual Life Insur­ 
ance Company" 

Container Corporation of Amer­ 
ica* 

Corning Glass Works Founda­ 
tion" 

Crucible Steel Charitable Foun- 
dation 

Delaware County National Bank 
Diamond Crystal Salt Company" 
Earley' s, Inc. 
Eaton-Dikeman Company" 
Elmer H. Adams and Associates 
Equitable Life Assurance Society 
of United States 

Esso Education Foundation?" 

First National City Educational 
and Charitable Foundation 

First Pennsylvania Banking and 
Trust Company" 

Ford Motor Company Fund 
Foundation for Independent Col. 
leges, Inc. 

Frank L. Black, Jr., Inc. 
Frank C. Marino Foundation, 
Inc. 

General Electric Company" 
General Motors Corporation 
George's Flowers 
Girard Trust Bank* 
Gordon Davis Linen Supply 
Gulf Oil Corporation Founda, 

rion" 
Hagerstown Paint and Glass 
Company 

Hamilton Watch Company" 
Harrisburg Paper Company 
Hartridge School, Inc. 
Hercules Incorporated" 
Household Finance Foundation 
Insurance Company of North 
America" 

International Business Machines 
Corporation" 

International Nickel Company, 
Inc. 

J. P. Stevens and Company, 
Inc. Foundation" 

John Wiley and Sons, Inc." 
Johnson and Higgins* 
Johnson and Johnson* 
Johns-Manville Sales Corpora­ 
. tion 
Kidder Peabody Foundation" 
Kirnberlv-Clark Foundation, Inc. 
Koebel Diamond Tool Company 
Koppers Foundation" 
Kruger Dairy . . 
Latrobe Foundry Machine and 

Supply Company 
McCormick and Company, Inc. 
McCloud, Scatchard, Derck and 
Edson 

McGraw-Edison Company" 
M and Z Rug Company 
Merck Company Fouudation" 
Metropolitan Life Insurance 
Company* 

Million Dollar Round Table 
Foundation 

Montclair Educational Fund, 
Inc. 

National Merit Scholarship Cor­ 
poration 

Neges Service Corporation" 
New England Mutual Life In­ 
surance Company" 

Perinsalt Chemicals Foundation" 
Pennsylvania Power and Light 
Company** 

Penton Publishing Foundation" 
Pitcairn-Crabbe Foundation 
Pitney-Bowes, Inc.* 
Pittsburgh National Bank* . 
Pittsburgh Plate Glass Founda. 

tion" 
Prudential Insurance Company" 
Quality Courts and Embers 
Restaurant 

R. J. Reynolds Tobacco Com- 
pany** 

Restaurant Equipment House 
Roth Foundation 
Sand H Foundation, Inc. 
Scott Paper Company Founda, 

tion" 
Sears-Roebuck Foundation 
Shenango Furnace Company 
Shenk Athletic Equipment Com- 
pany 

Simonds Saw and Steel Com­ 
pany* 

Singer Company Foundation" 
Smith Kline and French Founda, 
tion" 

Stauffer Chemical Company" 
Taylor Corporation" 
Texaco, Inc. 
Time, Inc.* 
Towers, Perrin, Foster & Crosby, 

Inc.* 
Uniroyal Foundation* 
United States Rubber Company 
Foundation" 

United Telephone Company of 
Pennsylvania 

United States Steel Foundation 
Wallingford Steel Company" 
Warner.Lambert" 
Woolrich Woolen Mills, Inc. 
Xerox Corporation" 

"Matching Gift Companies 
**Matching Gifts plus Direct 
Grants 

The Ford Challenge: Giving for a Greater Dickinson 
Ford Matching Funds Earned by the 1967 

Dickinson Fund: $8 2, 777 

30 



RE-ELECTED TRUSTEE 
Term Expires in 1971 

Weston C. Overholt, Jr., Esq., '50 

ELECTED TO COUNCIL 
Term Expires in 1970 

Miss Virginia 
Watts, '24 

James K. 
Nevli ng , '30 

Ralph L. 
Minker, Jr., '47 

II. Chase Davis, '50 

Miss Dorothy 
Chamberlain, '28 

Mrs. Mary Mackie 
Eshelman, '43 

Douglas Rehor, '48 

ALUMNI CLUBS 
Chairman Howell C. Mette reported the 
establishment of five new clubs bringing 
the total number to thirty-four. The 
newly established clubs are Binghamton, 
Rochester and Syracuse, New York, 
Atlanta, Georgia, and Jacksonville, 
Florida. 

Minutes-June 2, 1967 Alumni Council Meeting 

President Samuel J. McCartney called 
the meeting to order at 8 P.M. in the 
Holland Union Building. Those present 
included: 

Council Trustees 
Mrs. Katherine Smith Carpenter, Win­ 
field C. Cook, Roy R. Kuebler, Weston 
C. Overholt. 

Council Members 
Austin W. Brizendine, Robertson C. 
Cameron, Dorothy Chamberlain, Hamp­ 
ton P. Corson, Catherine S. Eitemiller, 
Mary Mackie Eshelman, George C. 
Hering, John D. Hopper, G. Harold 
Keatley, Constance Klages, Sidney D. 
Kline, Jr., James K. Nevling, Virginia 
Watts, Thomas V. Zug. 

President McCartney reported the 
results of the 1967 election of the 
General Alumni Association as follows: 

Alumni Trustee 
Weston C. Overholt, Jr. 

Alumni Council Members 
Dorothy Chamberlain, H. Chase Davis, 
Mary Mackie Eshelman, Ralph L. 
Minker, j r., James K. Nev ling, Douglas 
Rehor, Virginia Watts. 

TREASURER'S REPORT 
Dr. George Shuman, Treasurer of the 
Lemuel T. Appold Life Membership 
Fund (used to finance the Dickinson 
Alumnus and other expenses of the 
Alumni Office,) reported as follows: 

Balance, June 30, 1966 $96,077.50 
Receipts to April 30, 

1967 
Balance, April 30, 1967 

677.50 
$96,7 5 5 .00 

CONTINUING EDUCATION 
Chairman Sidney D. Kline, Jr., r ported 
that the Committee recommends that a 
panel-type program on the topic "The 
Role of Athletics in the Small Liberal 
Arts College" be considered for next 
year. 

ALUMNI AFFAIRS 
Chairman Robertson C. Cameron an­ 
nounced that Homecoming will be 
November 4, 1967. The new library 
will be dedicated at this time. 

JI 

ALUMNI TRUSTEES 
Roy Kuebler reported on the day-long 
meeting of the Board of Trustees. His 
report, as only he can give it, was in­ 
teresting, informative and entertaining. 

ANNUAL GIVING 
Evan Frey, Director of the Dickinson 
Fund, reported on a special meeting of 
the Dickinson Fund Committee held on 
January 2, 1967 to consider certain 
recommendations made by the pro­ 
fessional fund-raising organization of 
Marts and Lundy following a study of 
the Dickinson Fund. After due deliber­ 
ation, the following resolution was 
adopted by the Committee: 
"Whereas the Dickinson Fund repre­ 
sents a highly organized and effective 
alumni activity in the support of the 
College; and 
Whereas the Dickinson Fund represents 
an increasingly important long-range 
program to assist in meeting the operat­ 
ing expenses of the College; and 
Whereas it is vital that the Dickinson 
Fund show a definite pattern of growth 
each year; and 
Whereas historically the previous cam­ 
paign of the College and the Dickinson 
Fund were conducted simultaneously 
with success as separate and iden ti­ 
f able efforts. 
Now, therefore, be it resolved that this 
procedure be continued and that there 
be no interruption or temporary dis­ 
continuance of The Dickinson Fund or 
Dickinson Fund solicitation activities 
during the Third Century Development 
Program." 
Mr. Frey further stated that Samuel W. 
Witwer, President of the Board of 
Trustees, sent a letter to all alumni of 
the College in February 1967 setting 
forth the fact that the Annual Giving 
Fund (used for current operating ex­ 
penses of the College) and the Third 
Century Fund (capital funds) will con- 

Continued on Next Page 



tinue to be maintained as separate funds. 
He reported gratifying progress for the 
1967 Fund, although at this date our 
goal has not been reached. 

NOMINATIONS 
Chairman Robertson C. Cameron re­ 
ported for the Nominating Committee, 
propos111g the following officers for 
1967-68: 
President-Sidney D. Kline, Jr. 
Vice President-John D. Hopper 
Secretary-Mary Mackie Eshelman 

It was moved, seconded and passed that 
a unanimous ballot be cast for these 
nominees. 
President Kline then took the chair 

and introduced our dynamic Alumni 
Secretary, Vince Schafmeister, who pre­ 
sented his year-end report to the Council 
as follows: 

ALUMNI SECRETARY 
Over 1,500 alumni administrators from 
other institutions saluted Dickinson 
College last July at the Greenbriar in 
White Sulphur Springs, West Virginia, 
when, during the annual awards pro­ 
gram, we were presented one of four 
national honor citations emblematic of 
superior alumni service to education 
and to their college. The occasion was 
the National Conference of the Ameri­ 
can Alumni Council. The citation read, 
"In recognition of Distinguished Service 
to alma mater and to education through 
organized alumni effort, the American 
Alumni Council gratefully confers this 
1966 Honor Citation for Alumni Service 
on Dickinson College and its Alumni 
Club of Washington, D. C." This 
citation marked the third successful 
year of a tutoring project that adminis­ 
tered to the culturally and socially 
deprived in Washington. Dickinson 
alumni directed this inspiring project 
and in terms of productivity for those 
whom they teach it is a joy to be able 
to advise you that during the second 
phase of our testing program, where 
these underprivileged youngsters are 
brought to the campus for a weekend 
and thoroughly examined, one young 
lady has shown such remarkable im­ 
provement and has demonstrated such 
potential that the College has sought 
entrance for her into a private school 
system in New England. We are hope­ 
ful she will be accepted, awarded a 
sufficient scholarship, complete her 
secondary schooling creditably and 
enter Dickinson, where her private 
fairy tale will become a reality. 

It is likely that in two other major 
metropolitan centers, Dickinson alumni . 
will inaugurate similar efforts soon. 

Later 111 the Greenbriar program, 
Dickinson received the United States 
Steel Company's check in the amount of 
$3,000 emblematic of first place in the 
nation in competition to discover the 
small college most improved in terms of 
support for an annual giving campaign. 
We replaced Harvard. And Dickinson 
was the only institution to be honored 
with two major awards. 
Our serious attention to alumni clubs 
and continued amplification of off­ 
campus relationships is intended to 
bring Dickinsonians together for oc­ 
casions of fellowship, enlightenment in 
the business of higher education, and to 
relate the Dickinson story. Five new 
clubs, as Howell mentioned, have been 
formed in the past year bringing our 
total to 37, a number considerably in 
excess of schools larger than Dickinson. 
They join in the serious matters of 
proselyting in secondary schools, pro­ 
viding strength for annual giving and 
the capital campaign, promoting the 
College locally through active publicity 
chairmen and welcoming parents into 
their structures with their student­ 
children. 
The Alumni Council grows in strength 
as increasing numbers of alumni of 
significance permit their names to ap­ 
pear on the yearly ballot. Our long 
range goal for the Council continues to 
attract and hold Dickinsonians of such 
stature that in time and with appro­ 
priate involvement in the affairs of the 
College, they might be advanced to the 
Board of Trustees. 
The Dickinson Alumnus is now pub­ 
lished in 12,800 lots as additional "lost 
sheep" are discovered through applica­ 
tion of more sophisticated techniques in 
tracing. The magazine continues to 
reflect an image of the total picture of 
the College instead of solely the aca­ 
demic institution. Faculty and alumni 
are writing for us with enthusiasm as we 
seek to continually improve upon the 
magazine's intellectual thrust without 
losing its values as a purveyor of the 
newsier matters relevant to both in­ 
stitution and constituency. 

Placement enjoyed a fine season with 
124 corporations and governmental 
agencies recruiting on campus. Eleven 
graduate schools also recruited and the 
results are gratifying. More Dickin­ 
sonians will enter the better graduate 
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and professional schools than at any 
other time in our history. Vocationally, 
some of our young men and women will 
receive a starting salary in excess of 
$8,ooo. And not even narrow geo­ 
graphical limitations deny first-rate 
positions to those going into teaching. 
In a recent administrative reorganiza­ 
tion, Dr. Rubendall brought together 
the individual strengths of the Office of 
Information Services, the Dickinson 
News Bureau and the Alumni Office. 
This new department is described as the 
Office of Public Relations and Alumni 
Affairs, and Dr. Rubendall has honored 
me with the appointment of Director; 
another evidence of the high regard, I 
believe, that the President has for the 
Dickinson family and of his genuine 
encouragement to us to assume our 
appropriate role in the affairs of the 
College. This new office continues to be 
represented in the President's Cabinet, 
and when it is coupled with the new 
Development function prescribed for 
Fred Lumb of the Class of 1929, the 
College will surely be the richer in the 
total business of External Affairs. 
At the present we accept the fact that 
there is an interdependency of fond 
raising, public relations, placement, 
admissions and alumni relations within 
Dickinson's over-all communications 
effort. Coordination is required. So we 
ar_e attending to four primary matters 
in publications: 

(1) in-depth planning for the audience 
approach; 

(2) design for readership and identity; 
(3) organization, writing and pro­ 

gram ming for the audience; and 
(4) establishment of a team effort. 

Hopefully, you have witnessed this 
change in our publications and you 
approve. 
I participated in a considerable number 
of conferences and symposiums last 
year with attention to my competence 
as the motivator, and it has been my 
continued pleasure to serve as Chief of 
District VI for Beta Theta Pi National 
Fraternity, and locally as Alumni Ad­ 
visor and Financial Advisor for the 
Dickinson Chapter. Offices added since 
the Council meeting last October are 
the vice presidency of the Beta Alumni 
Corporation, and the Faculty Secretary­ 
ship of Omicron Delta Kappa. This 
latter office was especially heartwarm­ 
ing since it was an election by the stu­ 
dents which brought it about. 
And again, as immodest as I continue 
to project myself, as your representa- 
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tive on the campus I must advise you, 
not without, I confess, great delight, 
that the lnterfraternity Council pre­ 
sented me their certificate of apprecia­ 
tion for what they described as "De­ 
voted and Creative Service to IFC and 
Dickinson College." 
The harshness of youth at times is 
trying; but never oppressive here. 
Personnel deans, college presidents, 
trustees, food services, most administra­ 
tors are the bad guys (this is fashion­ 
able) and today's students cannot be 
fooled (or diverted) merely by the don­ 
ning of a white hat. So it is particularly 
gratifying when a student group has 
something kind to say about an ad­ 
ministrator. 
And this hair fact leads me to a point I 
should like to make. It takes a touch 
of carbon to make good steel, a touch 

of salt to make a worthwhile stew. In 
any mix of elements or personal skills a 
missing ingredient always shows up in 
the quality of the end product ... in 
an unsatisfactory result. Its importance 
is then fully realized and appreciated. 
In the business of alumni and student 
affairs, it seems to me that one of the 
most important ingredients is a human 
attitude called Care. Without this 
virtue on the part of the administrator, 
his services can be as unappetizing as 
the stew without salt ... flat to the 
taste. 
If our own profession al pride did not 
demand the use of plenty of Care we 
would use it any way. We might lose 
an alumnus or a student because of our 
inability to solve his problem or meet 
his concern but we will never lose one 
through lack of Care! 

FORD CHALLENGE CAMPAIGN 
Mike Elliott of the firm of Marts 

and Lundy, reported that as of J L1!1e r , 
1967, pledges and cash received in this 
campaign total $2,188,000. He felt 
that this amount was just about what 
could be expected at this particular 
time in the campaign. 
President Kline then introduced Ken­ 

neth Claus, a graduating senior, and the 
immediate past president of the Inde­ 
pendent Students of Dickinson. Mr. 
Claus delivered a most provocative talk 
on "The Old Dickinson and the New 
Dickinson." Council members and their 
guests evidenced great interest in his 
views and a lively and spirited dis­ 
cussion followed. 
The meeting was officially adjourned 

at 10:45 P.M. Respectfully submitted, 
Mary Mackie Eshelman, Secretary 

Goal of $265,000 Set For 1968 Annual Giving 

Harry Zug, '34 
Assumes Chairmanship 
of Dickinson Fund 

A glance at the Zug family tree and a 
quick check against the alumni records 
at Dickinson would be enough to assure 
a nomination. Add to that an eminently 
successful business career, a civic 
calendar that would floor Cassius Clay 
and a genuine concern for his alma mater 
and you begin to understand the 
difficulty of the task at hand and the 
man who has been chosen to accomplish 
it. For during the years 1968-1970, 
The Dickinson Fund must raise ap­ 
proximately $900,000 to meet current 

educational expenses anticipated by 
our College. 

It therefore seems that the choice of 
an accountant was not simply an 
accident. Harry Zug '34, is a partner 
of Lybrand, Ross Bros. and Mont­ 
gomery, worldwide accountants. After 
graduation from Dickinson, he went on 
to Harvard Business School where he 
received an M.B.A. in 1936 and later 
qualified as a CPA in nine states. A 
former president and director of the 
American Institute of Certified Public 
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Accountants, he is also a member of the 
Board of Directors of the United Fund, 
the Chamber of Commerce of Phila­ 
delphia, the Philadelphia YMCA and 
the Merion Cricket Club. He is Cur­ 

rently secretary of the World Affairs 
Council of Philadelphia and a member 
of that city's Crime Commission. He 
serves Dickinson as a member of the 
Board of Trustees and of its Executive 
Committee. 

We welcome to the chairmanship 
Harry C. Zug, Class of 1934. 





Persoria.1 
1'11er1 tiori 

1901 
The Rev. Dr. EDWIN F. 

HANN, SR., was awarded a 
citation for distinguished service 
at the 129th Commencement of 
the Pennington School. Dr. 
Hann graduated from Penning­ 
ton in 1897 and returned to the 
school to celebrate his 7oth 
reunion. Dr. Hann, who was a 
trustee of the school for nearly 
three decades, was awarded an 
honorary degree from Dickinson 
in 1925. 

1908 
Donald D. Mondul, grandson 

of Dr. MAURICE E. HECK, of 
Miami, Florida, graduated from 
the U. S. Naval Academy in 

June. 

1910 
DeLANCEY PELGRIFT, at­ 

torney of West Hartford, Con­ 
necticut, returned in May from 
a trip to Holland and England. 
While in England he visited his 
grandson who was an exchange 
student at Rugby. 

1912 
ROBERT HEFFLEFINGER, 

of Los Angeles, California, re­ 
ports he could not attend the 
Class reunion because he suffered 
a heart attack in April and the 
trip was too long. He sent his 
best wishes to the class. 

1913 
Dr. MIL TON CONOVER, of 

Newark, New Jersey, is pro­ 
fessor of law at Seton Hall and 
will continue his teaching through 
this year. 
Rev. A. B. GOUDIE, of 

Cornwall, reports that his one 
son graduated from Duke and 
Temple and another son from 
Drexel. His grandsons are stu­ 
dents at Elizabethtown, North 

Carolina State, Princeton, Kent 
and Worcester Technology in 
Massachusetts. 

1914 
Dr. SAMUEL THOMAS 

DAY, of Port Norris, New 
Jersey, was honored on May 13 
at the convention of the Medical 
Society of New Jersey in Atlantic 
City for having been a practicing 
physician for 50 years. He was 
the recipient of the Golden Merit 
Award, which reads ". . . splen­ 
did service, of dedication to high 
ideals and demanding duties, and 
for 50 years of giving of self that 
others might be enriched." 

1917 
PAUL M. DUTKO, of Miami 

Beach, Florida, retired from 
the Foreign Service of the U. S. 
after 40 years of service, and 
failing health, during which time 
he served at more than 10 posts. 

1918 
Miss RUTH R. HEM- 

MINGER, of Carlisle, has been 
ill for more than a year. She 
had been a patient in the Carlisle 
Hospital. 

Since retiring Ii ve years ago, 
Dr. CHARLES F. BERK­ 
HEIMER has been serving as 
the librarian and curator of the 
Central Pennsylvania Methodist 
Historical Society Library housed 
in the John W. Long Library at 
Lycoming College. He also 
serves as ch airman of an Edi­ 
torial Board doing research for a 
History of Methodism in Central 
Pennsylvania. 

1919 
Mrs. ELIZABETH SCHEL­ 

LINGER DOUGLASS, of Madi­ 
son, New Jersey, reports that 
her son, Thomas, has become 
chairman of the Spanish De- 

partment at Simpson College. 
She and her husband are spend­ 
ing the summer at A.M.C. Camp 
in Maine. 
ROBERT E. MINNICH has 

been called from retirement for 
the second time to work on a 
teacher certification project. Mr. 
Minnich, who lives in Albany, 
New York, originally retired 
in December 196 5. 

1920 
Rev. HERBERT P. BEAM 

has been serving as assistant 
rmrnster at the Grandview 
Heights Methodist Church, Lan­ 
caster, since his retirement in 
June 1964. He and his wife, the 
former KATHARINE PATTER­ 
SON, '22, live at 1716 Manor 
Ridge Drive, Lancaster 17603. 
After 48 years as a Methodist 

minister, the Rev. HARRY S. 
HENCK retired at the May 
Wyoming Conference meeting. 
The Hencks new address is 1114 
Prospect Ridge Boulevard, Had­ 
don Heights, New Jersey 08035. 
During the summer Rev. and 
Mrs. Henck served on the staff 
of the Silver Bay Association. 

1921 
After 40 years service as an 

aide to 10 New Jersey banking 
and insurance commissioners, 
ANTHONY F. VITORITTO 
left state service in June. He 
has become president of the 
Roma Savings and Loan Asso­ 
ciation of Trenton. He and his 
wife live at 279 West Upper 
Ferry Road, Trenton, New J er­ 
sey. 

1924 
Dr. NORMAN N. WEISEN­ 

FLUH, professor of education 
and psychology, who remains on 
the active teaching staff at 
Elizabethtown College, was 
granted emeritus status. For­ 
merly president of Slippery Rock 
State College, he has been on the 
faculty at Elizabethtown since 
196+ 
Mrs. ROSE BUCKSON 

MOORE, Rehoboth Beach, Del­ 
aware, and her husband spent 
five months touring the north­ 
west (California) and points east 
in a V W Campmobile. 

1925 
MELVIN W. HENDREN 

retired after teaching in Radnor 
for 39 years. He was a teacher 
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Judge Elvin R. Simmill, '27 

Victor F. Baiz, '28 



of social studies and sociology at 
the senior high school. 

1926 
On June 2, SOLOMON HUR­ 

WITZ, attorney of Harrisburg, 
was elected a member of the 
Board of Trustees of the Dickin­ 
son School of Law. 

After 25 years service with the 
American Red Cross, MARIAN 
S. DAVIDSON was honored 
with a tea upon her retirement 
in Alexandria, Virginia. A pro­ 
gram and presentation of gifts 
was held in May, at which time 
she was presented a life member­ 
ship certificate in the General 
Alumni Association of the Col­ 
lege, the gift of THELMA E. 
GREEN, '24, and MARY E. 
FRANKENBERRY, '23. 

1927 
Judge ELVIN R. SIMMILL 

was a warded an honorary degree 
of Doctor of Laws at the Com­ 
mencement exercises of Mon­ 
mouth College on June Io. 
Judge Simmill was a member of 
the Monmouth Board of Trus­ 
tees from 1955 to 1967 and 
served as its chairman from 1959 
until 1967. 

1928 
VICTOR F. BAIZ, an educa­ 

tor for 39 years, resigned as 
principal of Coughlin High 
School in June. Prior to becom­ 
ing principal at Coughlin in 
1960, he served in a similar 
capacity at GAR High School. 
Mr. Baiz, who resides in Wilkes­ 
Barre, will serve as associate 
director of the Federal Science­ 
Mathema tics Project at Wilkes 
College. 
During the period 1963-67, 

DONALD J. McINTYRE, at­ 
torney of Lancaster, Wisconsin, 
served on a study committee 
undertaken by the Wisconsin 
Bar Association which resulted 
in a "Proposed Wisconsin Pro­ 
bate Code"-this has been sub­ 
mitted to the Legislature for 
consideration. 

DOROTHY HARPSTER, an 
associate professor of English 
at Shippensburg State College, 
was elected president of their 
Faculty Association. 

1929 
Since retiring from govern­ 

ment service in December, Dr. 

VERNARD F. GROUP is em­ 
ployed part time as a member of 
the faculty of the Harrisburg 
Area.Community College, spec­ 
ializing in vocational counseling 
of veterans. 
Mrs. HESTER CUNNING­ 

HAM BOSS, of Drexel Hill, was 
an exhibitor at the Creative Arts 
Center in Cape May Court 
House, New Jersey, where she is 
an instructor for the summer 
months. She has had her work 
exhibited extensively in the 
Philadelphia area and has won 
numerous prizes. 

1930 
Professor ALEXANDER R. 

BURKOT, Dean of Campbell 
College, Buies Creek, North 
Carolina, was awarded the hon­ 
orary degree of Doctor of 
Humanities at the Commence­ 
ment exercises of Elon College, 
Greensboro, North Carolina, in 
June, 
On July 1, Dr. TOBIAS H. 

DUNKELBERGER left Quito, 
Ecuador, after four years as 
consultant in chemistry in Uni­ 
versidad Central del Ecuador, 
for a similar assignment in the 
Universidad de San Carlos in 
Guatemala. This assignment is 
in conjunction with a USAID 
contract with the University of 
Pittsburgh. His new address is 
USAID/G University of Pitts­ 
burgh, U. S. Embassy, Guate­ 
mala City, C. A. His oldest 
daughter, Judith, graduated Phi 
Beta Kappa from the University 
of Pittsburgh in April and is 
continuing her studies in an­ 
thropology in Ecuador. In Sep­ 
tember she will return to the 
states for graduate work. 
Mrs. EVELYN GREEVY 

FINSTER and Harold C. Hand, 
of Williamsport, were married 
on April 8 in the Immanuel 
United Church of Christ, Wil­ 
liamsport. She was given in 
marriage by her brother, Judge 
CHARLES F. GREEVY, '35. 
Mr. Hanel is employed by the 
Williamsport Bureau of Police. 
The couple now reside at 1518 
Penn Street. 
LENORE CISNEY retired 

after a 20 year career as a_n in­ 
terior decora tor with W & J 
Sloane, New York City. A ski 
enthusiast, she is a free lance 
writer and painter. Jackie lives 
in an old mill on a waterfall at 
Phillipsport, New York. 

RAYMOND HARTSHORN, 
who has been managing the 
Harry M. Stevens Catering 
Company for the past 22 years, 
was honored in April at the 
Maryland Race Track at Pim­ 
lico when a race was named in 
his honor for his outstanding 
service. He expects to be leaving 
early in the year for New York 
as he has been named assistant 
to Joseph Stevens, Jr., for the 
opening of the new Madison 
Square Garden and the new 
Belmont Park. "Gus" not only 
manages all the catering opera­ 
tions at the Maryland tracks but 
also the Meadows, trotting track 
near Pittsburgh. 

1931 
Mrs. MARJORIE EKHOLM 

MERRICK, of Valhalla, New 
York, was installed as president 
of Westchester Panhellenic in 
May. She is a past president of 
Westchester Alumnae of Chi 
Omega. 

Dr. FRANK M. DURKEE, 
Belleville, New Jersey, is with 
the Pennsylvania Department of 
Public Instruction, Director of 
Applied Research in Education. 

Dr. ROBERT L. D. DAVID­ 
SON, president of Westminster 
College, was the recipient of a 
"Significant Sig" medal at the 
Sigma Chi Fraternity· Grand 
Chapter National Convention in 
Miami Beach, Florida. The 
fraternity in citing Dr. Davidson 

Lenore Cisney, 'Jo 

recognized his high achievement 
in his professional life. 

Rev. WILTON J. DUBRICK, 
of Binghamton, New York, was 
recently elected president of the 
newly organized Board of Di­ 
rectors of the Children's Home 
of the Wyoming Conference. 
He was the recipient of the Silver 
Beaver Scout award for work 
with chaplains for summer camp 
in the Susqunango Council, Boy 
Scouts of America. 

1932 
Mrs. RUTH MUMAW EN­ 

G ELL reports that less than 
two months after moving to 
Leawood, Kansas, last fall, her 
husband, Frederick J. Engell, 
collapsed and died at his desk. 
She and her family plan to return 
to the East during the summer. 
Dr. LOWELL M. ATKIN­ 

SON, minister of the First 
Methodist Church, Montclair, 
New Jersey, is serving as a sum­ 
mer preacher in Jamaica during 
the month of August. In May, 
he represen tecl American Meth­ 
odism at the inauguration of the 
newly-formed Methodist Con­ 
ference of the West I nclies, held 
in Antigua. 

Col. ARTHUR R. DAY, JR., 
commanding officer of the 1608th 
Logistical Command Reserve 
Unit at New Cumberland Army 
Depot, retired on June 14 from 
the Army Reserve after 28 years 
service. Col. Day, who resides 
in Mechanicsburg, is assistant 



personnel director, Department 
of Public Welfare. His daughter, 
Marjorie Ann, is a member of the 
sophomore class. 

1933 
Dr. JACK B. DAUGHERTY, 

professor of Health, Physical 
Education and Recreation at 
Indiana University, was the 
Commencement speaker at the 
West Washington High School, 
Campbellsburg, Indiana, in May. 

Rev. G. ELLIOTT PRFSBY, 
pastor of Dolgeville Presbyter­ 
ian Church in New York, was 
one of the speakers at the open­ 
ing service of the zoorh anniver­ 
sary program of the Brick 
Presbyterian Church, Salem, 
New Jersey on July 2. Rev. 
Presby is a former pastor of the 
church. 

1934 
E. MAC TROUTMAN IS a 

presidential nominee for a U. S. 
District Court Judge for Eastern 
Pennsylvania. He has been 
practicing law for the last JO 
years in Schuylkill County. A 
graduate of the Dickinson School 
of Law, he is a member of the 
Perry and Schuylkill County 
Bar Associations. In 1937 he was 
permitted to practice before the 
Pennsylvania Supreme Court 
and two years later before the 
Pennsylvania Superior Court 
and the U. S. District Court for 
the Eastern District of Penn­ 
sylvania and the U. S. Circuit 
Court of Appeals. 

1935 
Dr. WHITFIELD J. BELT., 

JR., librarian of the American 
Philosophical Society, founded 
by Benjamin Franklin, is a mem­ 
ber of the National Historical 
Publications Commission, the 
Council of the Smithsonian In­ 
stitution, and the Advisory 
Committee of the Eleutherian 
Mills-Hagley Foundation. 

1936 
Colonel PAUL V. KIEHL, M.C., 
is Deputy Commander, Brooke 
General Hos pi ral, Fort Sam 
Houston, Texas. On February 
14, he became a grandfather for 
the first time. 

1~37 
Mrs. ELFA~R SWOPE 

HOLMES, of Waynesboro, Vir- 

ginia, has had two questions 
used on the Metropolitan Opera 
Quiz, both times being the lead 
question. She is a board member 
of the Waynesboro Community 
Concerts and writes some of the 
reviews of the concerts presented. 

1938 
Mrs. DOROTHY HYDE 

MOWRY, of Spofford, Connec­ 
ticut, attended a Study-Training 
Conference for Missionary Edu­ 
cation leaders and another on 
"Educating for Ecumenism" held 
at the Netherland Hilton Hotel, 
Cincinnati, Ohio in March. She 
represen ted the Board of Mis­ 
sions of the New Hampshire 
Conference of the Methodist 
Church. The Mowrys son, 
Stephen, graduated from the 
University of New Hampshire 
in June. 
The Rev. JOHN G. RHINE­ 

SMITH, of Troy, New York, 
was appointed superintendent of 
the Bennington-Troy District 
at the annual conference in May. 
He had served as pastor of 
Memorial Methodist Church 111 

Troy. 
In August, F.T.JZABETH S. 

MICHAELS assumed the posi­ 
tion of administrative assistant 
to the Executive Director of the 
International City Managers' 
Association. The oflices of this 
association are moving to Wash­ 
ington. Miss Michaels Ii ves at 
302 South Orange Street, Media 
19063. 

1939 
Barbara Reese Jacobsen, 

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
WILLIAM D. REESE (F.LSA 
BLUHM), and her husband, 
David, are both teaching on 
Guam for two years. The Reeses 
three sons are: David, Jr., a mud 
driller in Texas; Robert, a junior 
at Harvard, and Michael, who is 
in the Navy. The Reeses live in 
Casper, Wyoming. 

WILLIAM A. LUDWIG's 
daughter is a student at Mary 
Washington College of the Uni­ 
versity of Virginia. The Lud­ 
wigs, who have two younger 
daughters, live in Chambersburg. 

1940 
Commander and Mrs. WIL­ 

LIAM E. THOMAS, of North 
Reading, Massachusetts, an­ 
nounced the birth of a daughter, 

Janice Ellen, on April 25. Mr. 
Thomas was recently appointed 
assistant to the vice president for 
technical operations, Avco Space 
Systems Division in Lowell. 
The Rev. CORTLAND R. 

PUSEY has accepted a call to 
become assistant rector of St. 
Stephen's Episcopal Church, 
Pittsfield, Massachusetts in Aug­ 
ust. During the past year he has 
been studying at St. Augustine's 
College, Canterbury, England. 
A graduate of Drew Theological 
Seminary, Rev. Pusey served 
three Methodist Churches before 
joining the Episcopal Church in 
1953. The Puseys are the par­ 
ents of two children: Cortland, 
Jr., who recently graduated from 
Cornell University and has en­ 
tered the VISTA program, and 
Betsy, a sophomore at Boston 
University. The Puseys new 
address is 35 Waverly Street, 
Pittsfield, Massachusetts. 

1941 
Chaplain BENJAMIN J. 

SHINN was recently promoted 
to Colonel and has been re­ 
assigned to SAC Hqs., Staff 
Chaplain's Oflice. Chaplain and 
Mrs. Shinn (RUTH LEAVITT) 
are the parents of Benjamin, Jr., 
agraduateofSouthern Methodist 
University and now studying at 
Perkins School of Theology; 
George, a sophomore at SMU, 
and Marguerita, a freshman at 
Morningside College, Sioux City, 
Iowa. The Shinns live in Ne­ 
braska. 
Dr. WALTER T. JAMES, 

associate professor of sociology 
at Western Maryland College, 
served as a moderator of a panel 
of candidates for delegate to the 
Constitutional Convention. 
Dr. FRANK STEVENS has 

been named J 968 Bellefonte Area 
Community Fund drive chair­ 
man. A graduate of the Uni ver­ 
siry of Pittsburgh School of 
Dentistry, he has been practicing 
in Bellefonte since 1950. 

1942 
Captain JAMES H. LEE, Jr., 

retired from the U. S. Navy 
Medi ca I Corps on January I 
after 23 years service and was 
awarded the Certificate of Merit 
of the Bureau of Medicine and 
Surgery. On the same clay, Dr. 
Lee was appointee! professor of 
obstetrics and gynecology at 
Hahnemann Medical College 
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and Hospital, Philadelphia. Dr. 
Lee's new address is 336 Crum 
Creek Lane, Newton Square 
19073. 

1944 
The Rev. HOWELL 0. WIL­ 

KINS, of Seaford, Delaware, 
represented the U.S. Committee 
at the Christian Peace Con­ 
ference meetings at Raden­ 
vorwald near Koln, Hochst, 
Odenwald. 

1946 
Mrs. MARJORIE MONROE 

ARNOLD, of Haver town, was 
appointed administrative assis­ 
tant of the Lankenau Hospital 
Child Guidance Clinic in January. 
She previous! y served as oflice 
manager. 

1947 
Samuel E. Gibson, husband 

of ELIZABETH ROULSTON 
GIBSON, King of Prussia, died 
suddenly on April 19. Mr. Gib­ 
son was a sales engineer for the 
W. S. Tyler Company, Cleveland, 
Ohio. He is also survived by 
two sons, John, 8, and Sammy, 7. 

MARVIN E. WOLFGANG 
has been re-elected president of 
the Pennsylvania Prison Society. 
The organization helps prisoners 
and their families. Mr. Wolf­ 
gang is professor of sociology at 
the University of Pennsylvania. 

1948 
The Rev. AUSTIN H. ARM­ 

ITSTEAD is the newly ap­ 
pointed pastor of Faith Methodist 
Church, Staten Island, New 
York, after serving nine years as 
a minister and civic leader in the 
Bay Ridge section of Brooklyn. 
He and his wife were honored at 
a testimonial dinner at which 
time he was presented a Cer­ 
tificate of Appreciation from the 
City of New York, signed by 
Mayor Lindsay, for his spiritual 
and civic contributions to the 
community. 

Dr. RICHARD F. STAAR, 
chairman of the political science 
department at Emory Univer­ 
sity, has been appointed pro­ 
fessor of foreign affairs at the 
National Wai· College in Wash­ 
ington, D. C. The NWC is the 
highest level military educa­ 
tional institution, operated under 
the Joint Chiefs of Staff by a 
commandant who is a three- 
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Lester A. Kern, '48 (second from left), won a Certificate of 
Recognition for being nominated "Civil Servant of the Year" 
for Central Pennsylvania. Left to right are his mother, Mrs. 
Lester M. Kern, Kern, his wife Dorothy, and his father, Lester 
M. Kern. Al is Office Services Manager and Assistant Adjutant 
of Carlisle Barracks and has been an employee therefor the past 
I8 years. 

star officer. Dr. Staar has been 
granted a leave-of-absence from 
Emory. 
HERBERT GILMAN WING 

is a Foreign Service Officer 
currently serving as Nepal Coun­ 
try Desk Officer in the Depart­ 
ment of State. His wife, the 
former DORIS SPANGEN­ 
BURG, is an attorney with the 
Department of Housing and 
Urban Development. Mr. Wing 
states that DAVID COHN 
works in the office next to his on 
Pakistan affairs. The Wings 
live in Rockville, Maryland. 
Mrs. MARY REYNOLDS 

DEGROOT was installed as 
president of the Town Club at 
the 15th anniversary luncheon 
in May. A member of the club 
for five years, she has served as 
chairman of the club drama 
group, as second vice president 
and first vice president. She and 
her husband, JOHN DEGROOT, 
the parents of three sons and a 
daughter, live at 1547 Mission 
Road, Lancaster. 
JOHN D. HOPPER, of Camp 

Hill, as been elected vice presi­ 
dent of Greater Harrisburg 
United Fund and also to the 
Board of Managers of the Holy 
Spirit Hospital. 
This year, WILLIAM D. 

NASH became a 32° Mason of 
the Detroit Consistory. He lives 
in Highland Park, Michigan. 

Dr. ROBERT K. HAFER, of 
Elizabethtown, has returned for 
the third year to Honduras, 
Central America, on a medical 
mrssion. He was awarded an 

Honorary Citizenship for the 
year 1966. He has been serving 
summers as a physician with 
"Amigo de Las Americas" from 
Houston, Texas. 
LESTER A. KERN, Office 

Services Manager and Assistant 
Adjutant of Carlisle Barracks, 
was one of 13 nominated for the 
Civil Servant of the Year Award. 
The event took place at New 
Cumberland Army Depot during 
an awards luncheon attended by 
more than 200 Civil Service 
employees from the Central 
Pennsylvania area. An employee 
of the Barracks since 1949, Mr. 
Kern also serves as a member of 
the Deputy Post Commander's 
staff for personnel, welfare and 
morale services. 

1949 
"1800 Days" was the topic 

VIRGINIA STIEB-HALES, a 
member of the Board of Na­ 
tional Missions of the United 
Presbyterian Church in the 
USA, spoke on at the annual 
spring meeting of the Geneva 
Presbyterial in the United 
Church of Canadaigua, New 
York. An assistant for adminis­ 
tration in the women's division 
of the Board of National Mis­ 
sions, Miss Stieb-Hales also has 
several positions in the New 
York City Presbytery. 
In May, PAUL G. BUCHER, 

Boiling Springs, was appointed 
branch administration officer of 
Cumberland County National 
Bank and Trust Company. 
Prior to this new assignment, he 

was vice president in the Com­ 
mercial Loan and Credit Depart­ 
ment of CCNB. 

1950 
Mrs. LORRAINE APPLE­ 

YARD GARWOOD, Yonkers, 
New York, was awarded a mas­ 
ter's degree in religious education 
from Union Theological Semi­ 
nary in May. She is director of 
religious education at the Bed­ 
ford Presbyterian Church. 
Dr. WILLIAM R. JACOBY 

has been appointed man ager of 
ceramic development for the 
Westinghouse Astronuclear Core 
Operations (WNCO) at Ches­ 
wick. Prior to joining Westing­ 
house, Dr. Jacoby was employed 
by Knolls Atomic Power Lab­ 
oratory. He lives with his wife 
and three sons in Pittsburgh. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Ericksen 
(DORIS FARQUHARSON) 
moved with their three children 
to 796 Lincoln Road, Grosse 
Pointe, Michigan 48230. Mr. 
Ericksen is director of adver­ 
tising for the Stroh Brewery 
Company, Detroit. 
Mrs. ANN OBERMILLER 

REED and her family returned 
in June after spending five 
months at Ft. Huachuca, Ari­ 
zona, where her husband, Lt. 
Col. Philip N. Reed, was Arizona 
Field Commander for Project 
Cloud Gap IA. The Reed family 
lives at 3506 Custis Court, 
Augusta, Georgia. 
VILLIE MEMMI was a­ 

warded a master of education 
degree from Western Maryland 
College in June. 
FREDRIC K. SPIES, pro­ 

fessor of law at the University 
of Arkansas, will lecture and do 
research at the State University 
of New York at Buffalo during 
the coming academic year. Pro­ 
fessor Spies introduced a course 
in law and medicine at Arkansas 
in 196o when only a few law 
schools in the country offered 
one. He has written two highly 
regarded articles on medical­ 
legal matters which have been 
published and distributed to 
ro.ooo physicians throughout 
the country. 

1951 
LOIS PRICE PAULEY, M.D., 

is Director of Health Services 
for Bristol Township School 
System and is also assistant 
attending physician in internal 

Dr. Richard F. Staar, '48 

Dr. Virgil Sherwood, '53 



Carolyn Kahle Davis, '53 

Robert]. Wise, '53 

'John B. Swift, '56 

medicine at Lower Bucks Hos­ 
pital. She and her husband, Dr. 
WILLIAM G. PAULEY, '49, 
and their five children live at 
142 Red Rose Drive, Levittown 
19056. 
Mrs.JANE LEHMER ALEX­ 

ANDER, member of the House 
of Representatives of the General 
Assembly of Pennsylvania, was 
the speaker at the Bradford 
County Federation of Women's 
Clubs held at Wyalusing in April. 
She had been appointed by 
Governor Scranton to serve as 
a member-at-large of the Citizen's 
Advisory Council on the Status 
of Women. 

G. KENNETH BISHOP, vice 
president in charge of sales for 
Daily Express, Inc., Carlisle, 
was the speaker at the annual 
banquet of the Greater Johns­ 
town Traffic Club in May. 
JOSEPH J. MILLER is em­ 

ployed as electronic sales en­ 
gineer by Wheelan Corp., Dayton 
Ohio. He lives with his wife and 
four children at 8323 Cedar 
Road, Chesterland, Ohio 44026. 
JOAN E. GIPPLE was re­ 

cently elected president of the 
Harrisburg Chapter of American 
Women in Radio and Television. 
She just completed a term as 
president of the Harrisburg 
branch of AAUW. 
Mrs. ALICE BROWN AVEY, 

of Pleasant Gap, spent six weeks 
this summer on a fellowship to 
the NDEA Institute in English 
at Indiana University. Her son, 
Jim, a r orh grade student was 
awarded a scholarship to the 
BOC (band, orchestra, chorus) 
School held at Pennsylvania 
State University during the 
summer. 
Mr. and Mrs. THOMAS H. 

McENTEE announced the birth 
of a daughter, Faith Ellen, on 
March 31. The McEntees live 
at 91 Kensett Road, Manhasser, 
New York 11030. 

1952 

DONALD M. McCURDY, 
Esq., of Springfield, is a member 
of the House of Representatives, 
Pennsylvania, 165th State Legis­ 
lature District. 

Mrs. ELIZABETH KELLER 
KENNEDY is teaching sixth 
grade ih Stonington, Connecti­ 
cut, where she is vice president 
of the Thames River Pi Phi 
Alumnae Club and also a member 
of the Mystic Junior Women's 

Club. Her husband, J. Gordon 
Kennedy, is office and production 
manager of Ashawny Line and 
Twine Manufacturing Company. 
The Kennedy's address is Box 
169, R. R. #1, Stonington, 
Connecticut 06378. 
The Rev. THOMAS WALTER 

BARE was appointed in june as 
pastor of Trinity Methodist 
Church, Havertown. He is the 
third generation of his family in 
the Methodist ministry of the 
Philadelphia Annual Conference. 
For the past seven years he 
served as pastor of Grace Metho­ 
dist Church, Philadelphia. 

1953 
In April, ROBERT J. WISE 

was named president of the Wise 
Potato Chip Company, a division 
of the Borden Foods Company. 
Mr. Wise joined the company 
in J 9·50, assumed managerial 
responsibilities in 1953, and be­ 
came executive vice presiclen t in 
1957. Mr. Wise resides in Ber­ 
wick with his wife and three 
children. 

Mrs. CAROLYN KAHLE 
DAVIS is assistant chairman of 
Baccalaureate Program at the 
Syracuse University School of 
Nursing, where she is also an 
assistant professor. 
JOHN J. GOODIER, of Wil­ 

mington, Delaware, has been 
promoted to trust officer of the 
Bank of Delaware where he had 
served as assistant trust officer 
in the personal trust section. 

Dr. VIRGIL SHERWOOD, 
recen ti y promoted to professor 
of education at Radford College, 
Radford, Virginia, has been 
appointed director of Radford's 
.student teaching program. 

Professor NORMAN Mc­ 
WHINNEY, chairman of the 
English Department at the 
University of Pittsburgh, was 
the Commencement speaker at 
the West Newton High School 
on June 6. 

1954 
For the past eight years, 

WILLIAM J. HISSNER, of 
Lebanon, has been associated 
with the investment firm of 
Newburger and Company, a 
member of the New York Stock 
Exchange, as an account ex­ 
ecutive in their Le ban on office. 

Mr. and Mrs. GEORGE E. 
ORWIG, II, announced the birth 
of twins, David Alan and Denise 
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Louise, on October 27. The Or­ 
wigs live in Williamsport, where 
Mr. Orwig is an attorney. 
The Rev. EDWIN LINTERN 

is the new director of the Wesley 
House and Methodist minister 
on Hartwick and SUCO cam­ 
puses, Oneonta, New York. 
Prior to accepting this position, 
he was minister of the Factory­ 
ville Methodist Church and 
chaplain at Keystone Junior 
College. 
RALPH E. OWENS has been 

named manager of personnel, 
purchasing and traffic division 
of the Everett Kelley Personnel 
Consultants of Philadelphia. For 
the past IO years he has been in 
various other personnel capaci­ 
ties. 
On January r st, CLIFFORD 

A. ROGERS, of Camp Hill, was 
promoted to State Coordinator 
for Data Processing in Education 
in Pennsylvania by IBM. 

In May, Dr. JOSEPH P. 
ZACCANO, JR., of Harrisburg, 
was promoted from associate 
professor to professor of history 
at Elizabethtown College. 

1955 
Mr. and Mrs. EARL M. REY­ 

NOLDS (JEAN COSLETT) 
recently moved to 6015 West 
76th Place, Los Angeles, Cali­ 
fornia 90045. Earl was trans­ 
ferred by UNIVAC, a division 
of Sperry Rand Corporation, to 
the Los Angeles Engineering 
Office. 

Mrs. BARBARA BURKET 
RITTER was appointed in May 
as a member of the laboratory 
department of the Blossburg 
State General Hospital, Bloss­ 
burg. She lives with her husband 
and three children at I 50 Main 
Street, Wellsboro. 
Mr. and Mrs. ALLEN G. 

BEACH, of Washington, D. C., 
announced the birth of their 
second daughter, Lacey Lorraine, 
on April 21. 

1956 
Since August 1966, DEAN J. 

BENNETT, JR., has been 
regional sales manager for New 
England and Eastern Canada­ 
Flexible Tubing Corporation. 
He lives in Madison, Connecticut 
with his wife, the former DORIS 
AZIN, '60. 

On May 5, JOHN A. MATTA, 
Esq., joined the law department 
of Pittsburgh Plate Glass Com­ 
pany. For the past five years he 



has served as administrative 
assistant to Judge John L. 
Miller, U. S. District Court, 
Pittsburgh. 
Mr. and Mrs. FREDERICK 

E. ROTH (JENNIFER WEST­ 
COTT) and their three children 
are now living at 212 Engert 
Road, Concord, Tennessee 37720. 
ROBERT J. MIDDLETON 

is executive director of the 
Pennsylvania Health Council, 
Inc., a private coordinating 
agency in the health field, head­ 
quartered in Harrisburg. His 
new address is 117 North Fourth 
Street, Lemoyne 17043. 
J. ROBERT FISCELLA is 

a district sales manager for 
CIBA Pharmaceutical Company, 
Summit, New Jersey. In Novem­ 
ber, he and his wife and four 
children moved to 4902 Park 
Plaza, Houston, Texas 77018. 
JOHN B. SWIFT was awarded 

the silver wings of an American 
Airlines flight officer after com­ 
pleting training at American's 
flight school in Chicago. Prior to 
joining American, he served in 
the U. S. Air Force for 10 years, 
attaining the rank of Captain. 
He and his wife and three chil­ 
dren will make their home in New 
York City. 
Announcement has been made 

of the appointment of ROBERT 
P. BEAVER as substitute judge 
of Hanover County, Virginia, 
court and of juvenile and do­ 
mestic relations court. Mr. 
Beaver has been practicing law 
in Richmond since he was 
graduated from the University 
of Richmond Law School in 
1959. 
Mr. and Mrs. William G. 

Hitchcock (SARAH ANDER­ 
SON), of Springfield, announced 
the birth of their first child, 
Joshua William, on January 21. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gordon M. 

Folger, (GAYLE COMPTON) 
of Augusta, Georgia, announced 
the birth of a daughter, Jocelyn 
Compton, on June IO, I 966. She 
joins three brothers. 

Mr. and Mrs. SHAYLE ROB­ 
INS, of South Norwalk, Con­ 
necticut, announced the birth 
of a daughter, Shari Beth, on 
December 8. Shayle married 
Viola Levy on March 28, 1965. 

1957 
Rev. HARRY A. LEDGARD 

was appointed minister of the 
Lodge Forest Methodist Church, 
Baltimore, Maryland, on April I. 

ROBERT L. BAILEY was 
appointed assistant claim mana­ 
ger at the Chicago claim office of 
Connecticut General Life In­ 
surance Company. Joining the 
company in 1960, he was named 
claim representative at the New 
York office in 1961 and was 
transferred to Newark in 1963 
where he became a senior claim 
representative and in 1964 was 
appointed manager of the office. 
He and his wife live at 8932 
Steven Drive, Des Plaines, Ill- 
1001s. 

DON WILLIAM LLEWEL­ 
LYN is an assistant professor in 
law at Willamette University 
College of Law, where he is 
teaching courses in taxation, 
property and corporations. A 
graduate of the Dickinson School 
of Law, he has been in private 
practice since 1962. 
MICHAEL SHOPPELL is 

en rolled under sponsorship of 
the G. I. Bill in the LaSalle 
University law course. He is 
employed by Carpenter Steel 
Company as warehouse manager 
of the Ft. Washington plant. 
He lives with his wife and six­ 
year old <laughter in Prospect­ 
ville. 
Mr. and Mrs. RONALD 

ZEITZEFF announced the birth 
of a son, Paul Ian, on March 13. 
Ronald is an estate planner for 
Girard Trust Bank, Philadelphia. 
The Zeitzeffs live with their two 
children at 305 Victor Avenue, 
Cherry Hill, New Jersey 08034. 
ROBERT W. PAGE was 

chosen one of the five Outstand­ 
ing Young Men of New Jersey 
at the New Jersey Jaycees' 
Annual Distinguished Service 
Awards Assembly in February. 
JAMES A. LANEVE is a 

junior engineer in the glass-to­ 
metal-seal section of the aero­ 
space components division of 
Atlas Chemical Industries, Inc., 
Wilmington, Delaware. He for­ 
merly was a process engineer 
with LaTronics Corporation, La­ 
trobe. 

1958 
Dr. and Mrs. KERMIT TAN­ 

TUM (ANNE BIDDLE), of 
Philadelphia announced the birth 
of their third son, John Douglas, 
on May 8. 
GEORGE H. EBNER and 

Kathleen Deger, an alumna of 
Trinity College, were married on 
May 27 in the Church of the 

--····-------·----------------------. 

Holy Angels, Dayton, Ohio. 
George is a member of Governor 
Shafer's staff. The couple now 
reside at 4233 King George 
Drive, Camp Hill. 
Dr. JOHN WILEY, JR. and 

Eva Marie Litzer, an alumna 
of Monmouth College, were 
married in August. Dr. Wiley is 
practicing dentistry in West­ 
field, New Jersey. 
ROBERT ARKING, who re­ 

ceived his Ph.D. in biology from 
Temple University in June, is 
doing genetic research work at 
the National Institute of Health 
under a post-doctoral grant. 
He and his family live in Char­ 
lottesville, Virginia. 

1959 
Since completing a tour of 

duty with the Army, Dr. DAVID 
F. GILLUM is now living at 135 
Main Street, Wellsboro 16901. 

Capt. EDWARD HALBERT 
is a patient at the 6th Convales­ 
cent Center, APO, San Francisco, 
California 96377, where he is 
recovering from an illness. 
Announcement has been made 

of the engagement of HENRY 
C. JONES and Betty L. Sell. 
Miss Sell is an executive secretary 
of the Central Pennsylvania 
Chapter of the National Hemo­ 
philia Foundation. Mr. Janes is 
a sportswear buyer for men for 
the Pomeroy Department Store, 
Harrisburg. 
JOSEPH B. CARVER has 

been appointed director of admis­ 
sions at Wells College, Aurora, 
New York. Prior to his new ap­ 
pointment, Mr. Carver had been 
associate director of admissions 
at Hobart College since 1965. 
Mr. and Mrs. WILLIAM E. 

UPDEGRAFF announced the 
birth of a daughter, Jane Ellen, 
on June I 8. Bill is presently on 
leave of absence from his position 
as assistant professor of physics 
at Lycoming College to work on 
his doctorate in physics at Ohio 
University. He received his 
master's degree from Pennsyl­ 
vania State University. The 
Updegraffs are living at 59 
Stewart Street, Athens, Ohio 
45701. 

Mr. and Mrs. DAVID GROVE 
(BARBARA FOGG, '62) have 
moved to 43 I 6 Ellicott Street, 
N.W., Washington, D. C., where 
David is working in the general 
counsel office of the Peace Corps. 

Robert L. Bailey, '57 

John E. Williams, III, '59 



Barbara received a master's 
degree in education from the 
University of Pennsylvania in 
December. 
MICHAEL R. GARDNER 

graduated in June from the 
Dickinson School of Law, where 
he served on the Moot Court 
Board and received several Amer­ 
ican Jurisprudence Awards for 
excellence in specific courses. 
This month he will return to 
active duty in the Marine Corps 
and will serve for a year with 
West Pac Ground Forces. His 
wife, ELEANOR SMITH 
GARDNER, '6o, lives at 253 
Walnut Bottom Road, Carlisle. 

Mr. and Mrs. Craig T. Wisot­ 
zki (CAROL DORSEY), of 
Cockeysville, Maryland, an­ 
nounced the birth of their second 
son, Gordon, on August 16, 1966. 
JOHN E. WILLIAMS, III, 

was elected an assistant treasurer 
of the First Pennsylvania Bank­ 
ing and Trust Company. Follow­ 
ing a year of elementary teach­ 
ing, he joined First Pennsylvania 
Bank in 1962 as a junior analyst 
in the commercial credit depart­ 
ment. He lives with his wife and 
two sons at 32 Greenhill Road, 
Springfield. 
EMIL G. MAURER, JR. was 

named assistant secretary and 
assistant treasurer of the Wil­ 
mington Savings Fund Society 
in May. He joined the bank in 
1960 as a management trainee 
and was named an investment 
assistant in 1961. Following 
recall to active duty the next 
year, he returned to the bank in 
1964 as assistant secretary. 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Urban 

(JUDITH FLACK), of Clarks­ 
boro, New Jersey, an nou need the 
birth of their second daughter, 
Diane Marie, on March 6. 
LAWRENCE J. WALSH and 

Mary A. Rogers, an alumna of 
St. Louis University, were 
married on July 22 in the Im­ 
macula te Conception Cathedral, 
Kansas City, Missouri. 

In September, ARTHUR CAP­ 
PELLO will sail for Greece 
where he has been awarded a 
grant to teach in that country 
for next year under the auspices 
of the Fulbright cultural ex­ 
change program. Awarded a 
master's degree from New York 
University, he has been teaching 
in Hawthorne, New Jersey. 
While in Greece, he will teach 
English and American Literature. 

1960 
Captain NEAL W. LOVSNES, 

JR. has returned to Germany 
following "Exercise Pathfinder 
Express," a joint airborne exer­ 
cise conducted in northeastern 
Spain near Zaragoza. Capt. 
Lovsnes is commanding officer 
of Battery C, 5th Battalion of 
the 8th Infantry Division's Sr st 
Artillery. 
Captain and Mrs. CHARLES 

E. WISOR (JOANNE MAC­ 
AULEY, '61) have been trans­ 
ferred to Giessen, Germany, 
where Capt. Wisor is battalion 
surgeon for an artillery group 
and works afternoons in the 
Dependents' Dispensary. Their 
new address is 24th General 
Dispensary, APO, New York, 
New York 09169. 
JOHN W. NORRIS was 

awarded a master of social 
studies degree at the May 
Commencement of Shippensburg 
State College. 
Captain ROBERT T. WIL­ 

SON was transferred from France 
to Germany where he is stationed 
with the 54 7th General Dis­ 
pensary near Norn berg. His 
new address is 547th Gen. Disp., 
APO, New York, New York 
09114. 

Mr. and Mrs. MARX S. 
LEOPOLD (JOAN YA VER­ 
BA UM, '61), of Harrisburg, 
have announced the birth of a 
daughter, Deborah, on April 22. 
She joins Ann, 4, Matthew, J, 
and twin brothers, John and 
David, 1),--2. 
DELBERT T. KIRK, JR. 

is manager of Cell Production, 
Static Power Conversion Com­ 
ponents Operations at General 
Electric in Collingdale. He lives 
with his wife and son at 4150 
School Lane, Brookhaven. 

Since the middle of January, 
MARK H. FREEMAN has 
been executive director of the 
Winston-Salem, North Carolina, 
Community Action Agency, a 
poverty program. He and his 
wife (JUDITH WARD) live at 
1231 Foxhall Drive, Winston­ 
Salem, North Carolina 27 i 06. 

W. ROBERT LIPSKY has 
been appointed assistant sales 
promotion manager for John H. 
Breck, Inc. He and his family 
now reside at 7 South Brookside 
Drive, White Meadow Lake, 
Rockaway, New Jersey 07866. 
WILLIAM M. ZIMMER­ 

MANN is production manager 

of the Knoxville Glove Com­ 
pany. His present address is 
905 Loghave Drive, Knoxville, 
Tennessee 37920. 
JAMES R. FLOYD and 

Sharon C. Graves, an alumna of 
Kent State University, were mar­ 
ried in the chapel of the Metho­ 
dist Church, Berea, Ohio. The 
cou pie now reside in Kent, Ohio. 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry W. 

Rhoads (CHARLEY PER­ 
KINS) of Harrisburg, announced 
the birth of their first child, 
Pamela Bertolet, on February 
24. 
ANDREW J. KNUTH, JR. 

and Lucinda E. Konopka, an 
alumna of Paterson State Col­ 
lege, were married on May 27 
in St. Aloysius Roman Catholic 
Church, Caldwell, New Jersey. 
The couple now reside in Fair­ 
fax, New Jersey. 

1961 

ROS EM ARY GOTTES­ 
MANN and Robert A. Baer, an 
alumnus of Champlain College, 
were married on July J in the 
Hampshire House in New York. 
Rosemary, who earned a mas­ 
ter's degree from Cornell Uni­ 
versity, is an editor with the 
Zirrnnn Publishing Company. 
Mr. Baer is in advertising sales 
with the Harr Publishing Com­ 
pany. 
HARRY DANNER, who 

has appeared in several pro­ 
ductions of the American Light 
Opera Company, is a soloist with 
the Manhattan School of Mu­ 
sic troupe which entertained at 
the White House on June 1 and 
2, at which time the Prime 
Ministers of Australia and Great 
Britain were honored. Later 
this year he will appear in Pitts­ 
burgh with Patrice Munsel in 
"The Song of Norway." Dur­ 
ing the summer he will appear 
in a concert with the Metro­ 
politan Opera Studio and also 
appear in "My Fair Lady" in 
stock. Early in the Fall Harry 
will make his American debut in 
Kansas City in "The Barber of 
Seville" and "Don Giovanni." 
On June 17 he was married to 
Dorothy Frank in New York 
City. 

BRUCE L. SMITH has be­ 
come associated with the law 
firm of Eckels, Blystone, Fuller 
and Kinunen, with offices in 
Meadville and Titusville. A 
1964 graduate of the Univer- 

sity of Pittsburgh School of Law, 
he is a member of the Allegheny 
County Bar and has been ad­ 
mitted to practice law before the 
Pennsylvania Supreme Court, 
the Federal District Court for 
the Western District of Penn­ 
sylvania, in addition to the Or­ 
phans, County and Common 
Pleas courts of Allegheny Coun­ 
ty. He and his wife live at 120 
West Spruce Street, Titusville. 
ESTHER JANE FEATH­ 

ERER is on the news staff of 
NBC television in Chicago. She 
is a candidate for a master's 
degree in journalism for radio 
and TV at the University of 
Missouri. 
Rev. and Mrs. ALEXANDER 

M. TICKNER, of Baltimore, 
Maryland, announced the birth 
of their second child, Chris­ 
topher James, on March 29. 
PETER R. ANDREWS is 

associated with the law firm of 
Laucks and Monroe, whose 
offices are located at l J9 East 
Market Street, York. A mem­ 
ber of the Pennsylvania Bar 
Association, Mr. Andrews has 
been admitted to practice before 
the Pennsylvania Supreme and 
Superior Courts of Pennsylvania. 
Rev. RICHARD A. VICK­ 

ERY, JR., of Denver, Colorado, 
has been awarded a Fellowship 
in Preaching for 1967-68. Mr. 
Vickery will attend Boston Uni­ 
versity, where he was awarded 
his S.T.B. 
In April, ROBERT G. GIL­ 

FILLIAN, 3rd, was appointed 
sales manager of the Diamond 
State Telephone Company, Wil­ 
mington, Delaware. He began his 
career as an engineering trainee 
in Philadelphia in 1962 and be­ 
came a staff associate in 1963; 
promoted to an engineering as­ 
sociate in 1964 and an adminis­ 
trative assistant in 1965. 
Mr. and Mrs. WILLIAM D. 

HUMPHREY, of Flourtown, 
announced the birth of a son, 
David Thomas, on January 17. 
Mr. and Mrs. Dallas Lokay 

(MELISSA HAYNES), of Plum 
Baro, announced the birth of 
their second son, Paul Henry, on 
May 8. 
Captain]. GARDNER ZER­ 

BY, JR. recently completed a 
supply officer course at the Army 
Quartermaster School, Fort Lee, 
Virginia. He has been assigned 
Company Commander of the 
97th Engineer Co., New Cum­ 
berland Army Depot. 



Captain Timothy S. Dinger, '6I, receives Bronze Star Medal 
from Colonel Charles A. Cannon, 'Ir-, Deputy Commander, 
I I Corps Advisory Group, at recent special ceremony at I I Corps 
Headquarters, Pleiku, Republic of Vietnam. Lieutenant Colonel 
Butler P. Hine, 'Ir-. I I Corps Engineer Advisor (left), admires 
the medal. (USM/JCV Photo) 

Captain DAVID W. KEL­ 
LER, USAF, is attending the 
Air University's Squadron Officer 
School at Maxwell AFB, Ala­ 
bama. 
The Rev. ALAN S. BROWN 

has been assigned as co-pastor 
of Otterbein Church, Lancaster, 
where he had been serving as 
associate pastor. 

GEORGE E. HOFFER 
and Anne Kramer, an alumna 
of Hollins College, were married 
in St. John's Episcopal Church, 
Carlisle, on June 24. 
Captain TIMOTHY S. 

DINGER was recently awarded 
the Bronze Star Medal for dis­ 
tinguished performance of duty 
in Vietnam. For the past year 
he has been a member of Advi­ 
sory Team 21, Headquarters, II 
Corps Tactical Zone, Republic 
of Vietnam. 

1962 

J. DAVID MORRISSEY is 
a pilot/flight engineer with Trans 
World Airlines based at John F. 
Kennedy Airport in New York. 
His wife, the former KAY 
STROCKBRIDGE, is serving 
as an elementary teacher with 
the Sparta, New Jersey Board 
of Education. 
ELIZABETH G. KRAFT is 

working on a master's degree in 

Far Eastern Studies at American 
University, Washington, D. C., 
where she is also the assistant 
head resident in the woman's 
dormitory. She spent last year 
as assistant to the librarians at 
the Northfield School. 
Captain WILLIAM D. BIT­ 

LER and Rachel P. Saffer, an 
alumna of Mary Washington 
College, were married on June 3 
in the Church of Our Redeemer, 
Aldie, Virginia. The couple now 
reside in State College, where 
Capt. Bitler is doing graduate 
work in nuclear physics. 
BERT S. GOWDY, JR. is 

branch manager for Draper Tag 
and Label Company, San Fran­ 
cisco. He lives with his wife 
(ELIZABETH CAVANAGH) 
and two children at 1213 Her­ 
mosa Avenue, Pacifica, Cali­ 
fornia 9404+ 
STUART A. WURTMAN 

and Enid L. Fishman, an alum­ 
na of New York University, were 
married on November 24, 1966. 
Mr. Wurtman is a staff attorney 
with the Public Defender's Of­ 
fice, Philadelphia. The couple 
reside at 2237 Bryn Mawr Ave­ 
nue, Philadelphia 19131. 
JOSEPH LIPINSKI, M.D., 

has been appointed a clinical 
and research fellow at Harvard 
University and resident phy­ 
sician in psychiatry at the Mass- 

achusetts General Hospital in 
Boston. Dr. Lipinski lives at 
53 Hancock Street, Boston 
02114. 
SACKETT COOK became a 

full partner and vice president 
of the Insurance Brokerage Firm 
of Stump, Harvey and Co., Inc. 
Baltimore, Maryland. He has 
been associated with the firm 
since January 1965. He and his 
wife (PHYLLIS FEFFER) live 
at 180 Stanmore Road, Baltimore 
21212. 
Capt.JAMES S. DILLMAN, 

USAF, and Constance E. Davis 
were married in August. 

Capt. COLIN P. KELLY, 
111, is the commander of Head­ 
quarters Company, rst Tank 
Battalion, 63rd Armor, t st In­ 
fantry Division, Fort Riley, 
Kansas. 
The University of Wisconsin 

awarded BENJAMIN D. GI­ 
ORGIO a Ford Foundation 
grant enabling him to continue 
his studies at Harvard Univer­ 
sity this year. He is working on 
a doctorate in English Litera­ 
ture at Wisconsin, where he has 
been an instructor in freshman, 
junior and senior English Lit­ 
era ture. Upon completion of his 
doctorate, Ben plans to join the 
Peace Corps and teach English 
at the University of Iran. 

1963 
Since graduating from the 

Wharton School of Business and 
Finance, RICHARD WARD­ 
EN has been employed by 
General Electric. He and his 
wife (BARBARA GREER) live 
at 391 Reef Road, Fairfield, 
Connecticut 06430. 
DAVID C. CLEA VER grad­ 

uated from the Dickinson School 
of Law in June. He was the 
recipient of the Abel Klaw Ad­ 
vocacy Prize for outstanding 
performance in the Mock Trial 
Competition. 
Announcement has been made 

of the engagement of JUDITH 
A. MONET A to C. W. Larue 
Dillon, an alumnus of Lafayette 
College. 
JOHN W. DOUGLAS and 

Lucy S. Simpson, an alumna of 
Bennett College, were married 
on June 24 in Zion Episcopal 
Church, Rome, New York. John 
is an industrial engineer with 
Republic Foil, Inc., Danbury, 
Connecticut. The couple now 
live in New York City. 

Dr. RICHARD B. KEO­ 
HANE, Dr. BARRY A. SIL­ 
VER and Dr. DON C. WEIS­ 
ER were graduated from 
Jefferson Medical College in 
June. Dr. Keohane is serving an 
internship at Pennsylvania Hos­ 
pital, Philadelphia; Dr. Silver, 
Abington Memorial Hospital, 
Abington; and Dr. Weiser, Coop­ 
er Hospital, Camden, New 
Jersey. 
Dr. ALLAN B. WICKS was 

graduated from Temple Uni­ 
versity School of Medicine in 
June. He is serving an internship 
at Presbyterian Medical Center, 
Denver, Colorado. 
Mrs. E. SUSAN KLINE 

HART was appointed an assist­ 
ant cashier at the Provident 
National Bank, Philadelphia. 
She is assistant branch manager 
of the Welsh Road Office. 
The Rev. THOMAS R. 

CHRISTIE became pastor of 
Montvale Methodist Church, 
Montvale, New Jersey, in June. 
He was accepted to full member­ 
ship in the Northern New 
Jersey Conference of the Meth­ 
odist Church. 

Dr. JEANNETTE MUN- 
SON PERGAM was graduated 
in June from Temple Univer­ 
sity School of Medicine. She 
will intern at Jefferson Hospital, 
Philadelphia. 
On July 1, HOWARD C. 

PRICE was married to Delores 
Wilson, a graduate of Wilson 
School of Nursing, in Wesley 
Methodist, Endicott, New York. 
Howard is a graduate student in 
chemistry at the State Univer­ 
sity of New York at Bingham­ 
ton. The couple now reside at 
123 Park Avenue, Binghamton, 
New York 13903. 

Dr. DAVID G. DRENNON 
was graduated from Temple Uni­ 
versity School of Dentistry in 
June. 

Since J anuar y, Mrs. JEAN 
VANORMER DICK has been 
employed as a phsychiatric social 
worker at the new community 
mental health center of St. 
Francis Hospital, Pittsburgh. 

On August 21, EDWARD D. 
BLANCHARD completed a 
three-year tour of duty with the 
Navy. He served with the 
HUBBARD (DD-748) in the 
western Pacific off the coast of 
Vietnam. His new address is 
1120 Woodmont Road, Glad­ 
wyne 19035. 



Capt. WAYNE CORDES, 
who graduated from the Dick­ 
inson School of Law, is serving 
in the Judge Advocate General's 
Office in the U. S. Army at 
Hunter Air Force Base, Georgia. 

THEODORE W. STELL­ 
WAG, JR. is a reporter and staff 
writer for the Patriot-News in 
Harris burg. 

PHILIP ROSENFELD, M.D. 
who graduated from Jefferson 
Medical College in June, is now 
living at Northgate Apartments 
#B-3, 409 North Easton Road, 
Willow Grove. Dr. Rosenfeld 
will intern at Abington Memorial 
Hospital. 

Capt. ROBERT L. KNUPP 
is serving with the Judge Ad­ 
vocate General's Corps in the 
Pentagon with the Military 
Affairs Division, Personnel Law 
Branch. 
Mr. and Mrs. RONALD K. 

ROGERS, of West Pittston, 
announced the birth of their 
first child, Jennifer Lynne, on 
March 29. 
KATHERYN LINDUFF 

completed her doctorate studies 
in April at the University of Pitts­ 
burgh and has begun intensive 
study of collections of art in 

Europe and Asia. In May she 
was awarded a Mellon Founda­ 
tion Travel Grant for a summer 
seminar to study in Germany, 
France, Italy and England. 
Early in Sep tern ber she will 
leave for Taipei, Taiwan under 
the auspices of a Fulbright 
Fellowship to begin work on her 
dissertation. 

DONALD R. BUXTON, JR. 
was awarded an M. D. degree in 
June from Hahnemann Medical 
College. In February, he married 
Jan ice F. Huggins of Philadel­ 
phia. Following a delayed honey­ 
moon in Nevus, British West 
Indies, Dr. and Mrs. Buxton 
will reside in Harrisburg, where 
Dr. Buxton will serve his in­ 
ternship at Harris burg General 
Hospital. 

Dr. and Mrs. VINCENT G. 
CARUSO announced the birth 
of a daughter, Christine Eliza­ 
beth, on April 28. Dr. Caruso 
graduated on June 2 from 
Jefferson Medical College. Their 
new address is #7 Pleasant Court, 
Geisinger Medical Center, Dan­ 
ville 17821. 
In June, Dr. H. ROY ROSEN 

graduated from the University 
of Maryland Medical School. 

He will intern at Mt. Zion 
Hospital and Medical Center, 
r 600 Di visadero Street, San 
Francisco, California 941I5. 
Dr. and Mrs. Vance R. Stouffer 

(MARY WAGNER) recently 
moved to 2705 North 6th Street, 
Harrisburg, where Dr. Stouffer 
will intern at the Polyclinic 
Hospital. During the past year, 
Mary worked for the University 
of Pennsylvania Medical School, 
Division of Graduate Medicine, 
doing research in virology. 
EDWARD F. ROCKMAN 

recently received his C.P.A. 
certificate from the State of 
Pennsylvania and is presently 
employed by the Pittsburgh 
firm of Bachrach, Sanderbeck 
and Company. Mr. and 
Mrs. Rockman (CONSTANCE 
COURTRIGHT, '64) live at 
9243 Marymont Drive, Pitts­ 
burgh I 5237. 
On June 1, Dr. RONALD T. 

E. RIZZOLO was graduated 
from the Hahnemann Medical 
College and Hospital of Phila­ 
delphia. He will intern at 
Harrisburg General Hospital. 
HARVEY A. TAFEL was 

awarded a bachelor of divinity 
degree at the Commencement 

Samuel W. Witwer, Jr., '63 was admitted to practice before the Supreme Court of Illinois. Those 
shown in the picture, left to right, are: Alexander J. Napoli, Judge of the United States District 
Court, Northern District of Illinois, who made the motion to admit the class; his son, Richard G. 
Napoli, a member of the class; Roy J. So{fisburg, '[r., Chief Justice of the Illinois Supreme Court 
who administered the oath; Witwer, and !zls father, Samuel W. Witwer, Esq., 'Jo, President of th~ 
Dickinson College Board of Trustees, who dehvered the address of welcome on behaif of the I ttinois 
State Bar Association to the class of I89 candidates for the bar, and their parents who assembled in 
Springfield fast May. Sam's twin brother, Mike, '63, received his M.D. from Northwestern 
University Medical School in June and is interning at Passavant Hospital in Chicago, 

- 

exercises of Andover Newton 
Theological School in May. He is 
serving as pastor of the Church 
of the Holy City, Edmonton, 
Alberta, Canada. 

1964 
SANDRA M. SCHIAVO and 

JOHN LASZLO were married 
in Boston on June 2+ John is 
completing work on his Ph.D. 
thesis in clinical psychology at 
Harvard and will serve a year 
of internship at Boston's Chil­ 
dren's Hospital. Sandra is com­ 
pleting her Ph.D. thesis in 
counseling psychology at Boston 
University. The couple now 
reside at 888 Massachusetts 
Avenue, Cambridge, Massachu­ 
setts 02139. 
KATHERINE E. BEST and 

John K. Stamboolian, j r., an 
alumnus of Millersville State 
College, were married on June 
I 7 in St. Paul's United Church 
of Christ, Mechanicsburg. Mr. 
Stamboolian is a professor of 
graphic arts at Cheyney State 
College. The couple now re­ 
side at 230 East North Everhart 
Avenue, West Chester. 
Announcement has been made 

of the engagement of LINDA 
JEAN JONES to Lt. Eric A. 
Westling. A fall wedding is 
planned. 
JAMES F. CARL, GLENN 

E. HITCHENS, WILLIAM M. 
McCARTY, JR., ALBERT R. 
RAGO, DAVID L. RICHARD, 
Il, ROBERT E. SCHLUSSER 
and ROGER C. STEEDLE 
graduated from the Dickinson 
School of Law in June. 
ALFRED R. STISCIA, Ches­ 

ter, was ordained on June 22 to 
the office of deacon at the Cathe­ 
dral Church of St. Stephen, 
Harrisburg. He graduated in 
May from the General Theolo­ 
gical Seminary of the Protestant 
Episcopal Church, New York 
City. He is a member of the 
staff of St. Joh n's Episcopal 
Church, Carlisle, where he will 
have a special ministry to the 
students of Dickinson and the 
families residing at the Army 
War College. 

IOLE Z. HAFER was married 
on June 14 to Leonard R. 
Picton, an Alumnus of Mor­ 
avian College, in the Church of 
the Epiphany, Ventnor, New 
Jersey. The couple now reside 
at 200 East Main Street, znd 
floor, Hamburg, New York 
14075. 
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CHARLOTTE L. RENSHAW 
and Chester 0. Jones will be 
married on August 19. For the 
past three years Charlotte has 
been teaching English and serving 
as a guidance counselor at 
Stetson Junior High School, 
West Chester. Mr. Jones, an 
alumnus of Olivet College, is a 
member of the Chester County 
Library staff, West Chester. 
JAMES H. WOODRING was 

graduated in June from Yale 
University Law School. He was 
awarded the John Currier Gal­ 
lagher prize for placing first in 
jury trial competition and won 
second place in the Thurman 
Arnold Appellate Competition. 
He has accepted a position with 
the law firm of Squire, Sanders 
and Dempsey, Cleveland, Ohio. 
H. RICHARD FLAMMER is 

a petrochemical sales repre­ 
sen ta ti ve with the Con ti nen tal 
Oil Company. He lives with his 
wife and two daughters at 4663 
Anderson Road, South Euclid, 
Ohio 44121. 
PHILLIP S. WASHBURN 

was awarded an appointment 
from Duke Divinity School to 
the assistantship at Dumfries, 
Scotland, where he will spend 
next year. 
ROBERT E. HINDLE was 

awarded a master of arts degree 
in history from American Uni­ 
versity in June. 
On June 10, JOHN T. KILLIP, 

JR. and Carol A. Long, an 
alumna of the University of 
Maryland, were married in the 
Protestant Community Church, 
Medford Lakes, New Jersey. 
The couple now reside in Bur­ 
lington City, New Jersey. 
NORMAN FARRELL, JR. 

has been working on a ranch in 
California since March. 

Captain RICHARD W. 
MORGAN was awarded the Air 
Medal for aerial support of 
ground operations in Vietnam 
in April. He is an aircraft main­ 
tenance officer in Co. C, r yth 
Transportation Battalion, r st 
Cavalry Division. 
Mr. and Mrs. JOHN L. LE­ 

ROY, JR. (SUSAN CROWLEY) 
recently moved to their new 
home at 516 Quincy Drive, 
Whitman Square, Blackwood, 
New Jersey 08012. 
Pvt. VAUGHAN W. PRATT 

recently completed eight weeks 
of advanced infantry training at 
Fort Dix, New Jersey. 

HENRY C. SMITHER, III, 
recently moved to Indianapolis, 
Indiana, where he is state man­ 
ager for Brown-Vintners, a sub­ 
sidiary of Seagrams. 
MILLARD M. RIGGS, JR. 

recently moved to Trafford 
where he has taken over the 
Pittsburgh, Buffalo, West Vir­ 
ginia area for Celanese Cor­ 
poration. He lives with his wife 
and daughter at 211 Woodlawn 
Drive, Trafford 1508 5. 
On September 1, CHRISTO­ 

PHER LOWELL wiJJ join the 
faculty as a member of the 
French Department at the Chest­ 
nut Hill Academy. He recently 
completed his master's work in 
French at Colgate. 
PETER B. ZUYUS was pro­ 

moted to Captain in May at 
Fort Belvoir, Virginia. He is 
attached to the U. S. Army 
Engineer's Corps. 
THOMAS F. CHRIST and 

WILLIAM C. LEE, JR. were 
graduated from Temple Uni­ 
versity School of Dentistry in 
June. Dr. Lee was one of the 
recipients of the Omicron Kappa 
Upsilon Scholastic Fraternity 
Award. 

1965 
KAREN E. ZWART and 

William B. Aarons, Jr., an 
alumnus of Lafayette, were 
married on May 1 !. Karen is 
teaching at Upper Dublin Junior 
High School and her husband is 
a third year student at Hahne­ 
mann Medical College. They 
now reside at #so 1300 Fayette 
Street, Conshohocken 19428. 

Lt. FREDERICK H. ETH­ 
ERINGTON, JR. and Priscilla 
V. Fox, an alumna of Spring­ 
field College, were married on 
June 24 in St. Martin's Church, 
Radnor. The couple now reside 
in Colorado. 
GILBERT B. HENYON and 

Cynthia M. Kichula, an alumna 
of Douglass College, were mar­ 
ried on June 17 in Kirkpatrick 
Chapel, Rutgers University, New 
Brunswick, New Jersey. Prior 
to reporting for active duty with 
the U. S. Army Signal Corps on 
August 1, Lt. Henyon was a 
statistician at Johnson & John­ 
son. Mrs. Henyon is teaching 
in the Sayreville schools. The 
couple now resides at the Madison 
Apartments, Old Bridge. 

WILLIAM L. ALDRED and 
Patricia A. Baird, an alumna of 

Russell Sage College, were mar­ 
ried on June 17 at Trinity 
Church, Swarthmore. 
Announcement has been made 

of the engagement of Lt. RICH­ 
ARD E. CHILDS, JR., to 
Patricia A. Peterman, a graduate 
of the Harris burg Polyclinic 
Hospital School o.f Nursing. Lt. 
Childs served with the 17 3rd 
Airborne Brigade in Vietnam 
and was awarded the Bronze 
Star and the Purple Heart. A fall 
wedding is planned. 

1 /Lt. LEE CORDES is serv­ 
ing with Military Intelligence in 
South Vietnam, stationed at Bien 
Hoa. 

During the summer, JAMES 
C. SHARF was a summer man­ 
agement trainee with Armstrong 
Cork Company. In September 
he will return to the University 
of Tennessee to complete work 
on his master's degree in organi­ 
zational psychology, where he is 
on a graduate assistantship as 
assistant head resident in a men's 
resident hall. 
NORMAN C. COYLE is 

working on a master's degree in 
social work at West Virginia Uni­ 
versity. He is presently at the 
Children's Home, York. 
In the fall, JOHN F. Mc­ 

CLELLAND will resign his po­ 
sition at the National Bureau of 
Standards, Atomic Physics Di­ 
vision, to accept a graduate 
teaching assistantship at Iowa 
State University, where he will 
be a graduate student in the 
physics department and instruct 
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Lt. Howard P. Lewis, '65 

Millard M. Riggs, '64 

Lt. Nickolas ']. Kempf, '66 



an undergraduate physics lab­ 
oratory. 

Mr. and Mrs. JONATHAN 
KINTNER (EDWINA CHAL­ 
LINOR) of Bloomington, Indi­ 
ana, announced the birth of a 
daughter, Jessica, on January 13. 

Announcement has been made 
of the engagement of WILLIAM 
N. McDONALD, I1l to Jill A. 
Harding, an alumna of the Uni­ 
versity of Delaware. A Novem­ 
ber wedding is planned. 

CAROL A. RASKOPF was 
awarded a master's degree in 
student personnel work at Mich­ 
igan State University in June. 
In July she began work as a pro­ 
grammer for the Advanced Ad­ 
ministrative Systems Depart­ 
ment of IBM in Kingston, New 
York. 

Sp/4 JAMES S. HATCH 
recently moved from Walter 
Reed Hospital, Finance Office, to 
the USA Courier Station, 70, 
A.G. Div., USAREUR, Heid­ 
leberg, Germany. 

ROBERT M. BEAGLE has 
been named instructor in speech 
at the Beaver Campus of the 
Pennsylvania State University. 
In 1963, he was named "Out­ 
standing Young Republican" of 
Columbia County. 
FORREST E. CRAVER, I1l 

is enrolled at Wayne State Uni­ 
versity, Detroit, Michigan, as a 
candidate for a master's degree in 
community organization. His 
address is 736 West Chicago 
Boulevard, Detroit 48202. 
JUDY ROGERS recently re­ 

turned from a five-month trip 
around the world where she visit­ 
ed 15 countries. Two months 
were spent in Singapore under 
the auspices of the U. S. Youth 
Council, where she worked in a 
community project center for the 
Singapore government. She is 
presently a caseworker for an 
antipoverty agency in Jersey 
City, New Jersey. 
Rev. JOHN W. THOMAS is 

serving as chaplain at the Wilt­ 
wyer School of Boys while com­ 
pleting his last year at Union 
Theological Seminary. His wife, 
who has just completed require­ 
ments for her master's degree, is 
a teacher in Harlem. John is 
applying for a Ph.D. in clinical 
psychology. 
ROBERT K. REID was a­ 

warded a master of arts degree 
in June from Oberlin College. 
LINNEA D. IMLER was 

awarded a master of science de- 

-- 

gree in mathematics from Car­ 
negie Institute of Technology in 
June. 

2/LT. HOWARD P. LEW­ 
IS has entered U. S. Air Force 
pilot training at Laredo Air Force 
Base, Texas. Upon completion 
of the year-long course he will 
be awarded silver pilot wings. 
DENNIS L. BARTON is en­ 

rolled as a graJuate student in 
electrical engineering at Ohio 
University. On August 25 he will 
enter the U. S. Army Signal 
Corps. 

1966 
2/Lt. NICKOLAS J. KEMPF, 

III has completed his solo flight 
in the T-37 jet trainer as a U. S. 
Air Force pilot trainee at Laugh­ 
lin Air Force Base, Texas. He 
will receive silver pilot wings 
upon completion of the year-long 
Air Training Command flying 
program. 
ALLISON A. BROWNING 

and Michael L. Richards, an a­ 
lumnus of Delaware University, 
were married on July 8. 
JAMES H. REINHART is 

campaign director of Public Ser­ 
vices Division with the United 
Community Fund of Northern 
Delaware. 

BARRY W. BARTO has 
been working for Nationwide 
Insurance Company in the Ches­ 
ter County area. On January 28 
he was married to Donna 
Weaver, an alumna of Shippens­ 
burg State College. The couple 
reside at Black Hawk Circle, 
Apt. K-2, Downingtown 19335. 
On May 14, 2/Lt. JOHN S. 

BOLAN completed the Adjutant 
General Officer basic course at 
Ft. Benjamin Harrison, Indiana. 

EDWARD F. LAMSON was 
commissioned on May 31 as a 
second lieu tenant upon gradua­ 
tion from the Army Transpor­ 
tation Officer Candidate School 
at Fort Eustis, Virginia. 
FRANK J. DODSON IS 

stationed with the army 111 

Korea. 
STERLING P. NEW- 

BERRY, Ill is teaching French 
in the Cleveland City School 
System, Ohio, and is also work­ 
ing as the Greater Cleveland 
Area Organizer for the Socialist 
Party, USA. 
PATRICIA A. KALISZ and 

John D. Previdi were married in 
June. 
ALLEN R. QUINN grad­ 

uated from the University of 
Connecticut with a master's de- 

gree in educational psychology. 
He will continue his studies at 
the University for a certification 
as a psychological examiner. 
Ensign and Mrs. RICHARD 

G. WOLF, JR. (ELIZABETH 
BISHOP, '67) are living at 1363 
Yosemite Street, Denver, Colo­ 
rado where Dick is taking Air 
Intelligence Officer Training at 
Lowry Air Force Base. 
ALFRED R. DERWART 

was awarded a master of science 
in library science from Western 
Reserve University in June. 
JAMES SOUTH was awarded 

a master of arts degree in Guid­ 
ance and Personnel Administra­ 
tion in Colleges and Universities 
at New York University. Last 
winter he was elected to mem­ 
bership in Phi Delta Kappa, 
national honorary for men in 
education. He has accepted a 
position as Program Director for 
Stud-ent Activities at Jefferson 
Medical College. He and his wife 
(GAIL THORNHILL, '65) 
moved to Aronirni nk Arms, Apt. 
H 1 D, Township Line Road and 
Wilde Avenue, Drexel Hill 19026. 

1967 
KATHRYN ELLIOTT·and 

RICHARD H. FOSLER were 
married on June 17 at the First 
Presbyterian Church, Elmira, 
New York. Dick is employed by 
the Metropolitan Division of the 
Chemical Bank, New York 
Trust. The couple now reside at 
15 Davenport Avenue, New Ro­ 
chelle, New York. 
Lt. WILLIAM A. NICKLES 

and Linda A. Westwood, an 
alumna of Wilson College, were 
married on June 7 in the Peters 
Creek United Presbyterian 
Church, Venetia, Pennsylvania. 
Lt. Nickles is scheduled to go to 
Saigon. 

SUSAN A. BARKER is 
teaching in the Plainfield, New 
Jersey school system. 

CAROLYN C. SMITH and 
George T. D. Ecker, an alumnus 
of Washington and Lee Univer­ 
sity, were married on June 24 in 
the Great Choir of Washington 
Cathedral, Washington, D. C. 
Mr. Ecker graduated from the 
University of Iowa Graduate 
School of Hospital Administra­ 
tion and is an assistant adminis­ 
trator at the Washington Hos­ 
pital Center. 
Announcement has been made 

of the engagement of ALLEN H. 
MacPHAIL and Kathe L. 
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Young, a member of the senior 
class. 
JON W. TARRANT will 

teach English at the Big Spring 
High School, Newville. 
SHERR YE D. GEESEY and 

Richard S. Garrett, an alumnus 
of Elizabethtown College, were 
married on May 28 in the Fourth 
Evangelical United Brethren 
Church, York. Sher rye is teach­ 
ing at Manheim Central High 
School. The couple now reside 
at 34 West Ferdinand Street, 
Manheim. 
VIRGINIA J. ELKINS will 

enter Northwestern University 
in September, where she will be­ 
gin graduate work at Garrett 
Theological Seminary. 

2/Lt. RAYMOND T. PHIL­ 
LIPS is taking eight weeks basic 
training at Fort Sill, Oklahoma. 
Upon completion of this training 
he will transfer to Fort Benning, 
Georgia. 

SUSAN HULL BUCKING­ 
HAM and PHILIP P. Mc­ 
GARVEY, '66, were married on 
June r o in Trinity Episcopal 
Church, Southport, Connecticut. 
Philip is a student at the Berke­ 
ley Divinity School. The couple 
now reside in New Haven. 

CHARLES W. SLAVIN is 
in San Francisco where he will 
join other Peace Corps Volun­ 
teers. He will go to the Island of 
Moen, Truk District, Micro­ 
nesia, where he will receive 
training to teach English. 

Announcement has been made 
of the engagement of ANDREA 
L. HOWDON to William D. 
Shay, Jr., an alumnus of Brown 
University and a student at the 
Dickinson School of Law. The 
couple plan to be married on 
November 18. 

1968 
Airman Second Class RICH­ 

ARD G. MOHRFELD was 
graduated at Sheppard Air Force 
Base, Wichita Falls, Texas, from 
the training course for U. S. Air 
Force missile equipment special­ 
ists. He has been assigned to 
Davis Monthan Air Force Base, 
Arizona. 

1969 
DAVID M. CONST AN- 

TINE and Joy E. Williams were 
married in St. Paul's Lutheran 
Church, Dillsburg in June. 
David is stationed with the army 
at Fort Bragg, North Carolina. 



Obit1...:t.aries. 

1896 The Alumni Office re­ 
ceived word of the death of I. 
GRANT HOERNER, Esq., of 
New York City, who received 
his LL.B. from Columbia Uni­ 
versity in 1907. 

1905 WILLIAM H. ROGERS 
distinguished Jacksonville, Flor~ 
ida, attorney, died there on 
April 29. A partner in the law 
firm of Rogers, Towers, Bailey & 
Jones, he was the Florida counsel 
for The Corporation Trust Com­ 
pany of New York City and 
Lawyers Title Insurance Cor­ 
poration of Richmond, Virginia. 
During World War II he was 
special assistant to the U. S. 
Attorney General and from 1955 
to 1960 he was general counsel 
of the Jacksonville Expressway 
Authority. He was a director 
counsel and president of th~ 
Florida Title and Guaranty Co., 
director and member of the 
Florida National Bank and 
Trust Company; director, mem­ 
ber of the finance committee and 
general counsel of Gulf Life 
Insurance Co.; director and 
counsel of First Federal Savings 
and Loan Association, of which 
he was one of the organizers. A 
member of the Masonic orders, 
he was a member of the Ameri­ 
can, Florida and Jacksonville 
Bar Associations, American Ju­ 
dicature Society, American Law 
Institute, American Academy of 
Poli tic al and Social Science, 
Academy of Political Science, 
Phi Beta Kappa, Phi Kappa 
Sigma, and many other local 
clubs. He is survived by his wife. 

1910 The Alumni Office re­ 
ceived word of the death of Mrs. 
ANNE GLAZIER STACK­ 
HOUSE, of Harrisburg, on June 
15. 

1911 The Alumni Office has 
been informed of the death of 
WILLIAM D. BOTTGEN­ 
BACH, of Miami, Florida, on 
May 3. 

1912GEORGE LEROY 
MOORHEAD, of Hollywood, 
Florida, died on May 5. Rev. 
Moorhead received a B.D. de- 

gree from Eastern Theological 
Seminary. He is survived by his 
wife. 

1913 EDWARD EUGENE 
REINDOLLAR died of a cere­ 
bral hemorrhage on June 13 at 
the Lebanon Veterans' Hospital 
at the age of 77. A member.of 
Phi Delta Theta Fraternity, he 
was also a member of Advent 
Lutheran Church, York, where 
he resided. He was a 1909 
graduate of Conway Hall Pre­ 
paratory School. Mr. Rein­ 
dollar was a sales representative 
for Harrison & Company, in­ 
vestment banking. He is sur­ 
vived by his wife, a son and two 
<laughters and six grandchildren. 

1919 SYLVESTER M. EVANS 
LTC, ret., died on January 24 i~ 
Daytona Beach, Florida at the 
age of 72. Prior to his retirement 
in 1960, he was former Director 
of the Pa tent Department of the 
Monsanto Company, St. Louis, 
Missouri. He received an LL.B. 
from Yale University. He held 
membership in the Reserve 
Officers' Association, Retired 
Officers Association, the Ameri­ 
can Chemical Society, Lions Club 
and Kiwanis Club. A member of 
Alpha Chi Rho, he was also a 
member of the Methodist Church. 
He is survived by his wife. 

1922 JOHN L. PIPA, JR., well­ 
known attorney and businessman 
of Shamokin, died on June 26 at 
Geisinger Medical Center, Dan­ 
ville, at the age of 68. A graduate 
of the Dickinson School of Law 
he was an outstanding football 
player while a student at the 
College. He was a founder and 
treasurer of KP Television Sys­ 
tems, Inc., and the Municipal 
Television Corporation. A for­ 
mer solicitor for the Coal Town­ 
ship and Mt. Carmel Township 
school districts, he was also an 
appeal agent for the Selection 
Service Board in Northumber­ 
land County for the past 25 
years. A life member of the 
General Alumni Association, he 
was also a member of Sigma 
Alpha Epsilon Fraternity, the 

Elks and the Moose. He is 

survived by two daughters, a 
brother and four sisters. 

1924 The Rev. GORDON F. 
HINKLE, SR., retired Metho­ 
dist minister, was found dead in 
his home in Monroeville on May 
10 with his wife and mother all 
victims of carbon mono~ide 
poisoning which had seeped into 
the house from the pastor's auto 
which had been left running in 
the basement garage. A graduate 
of Drew Theological Seminary 
in 1927, he was ordained in 
Altoona in 1928. He had served 
as pastor of McKnight Metho­ 
dist Church until June, 1965 
when he retired from the active 
ministry. The couple is survived 
by three children and three 
grandchildren. 

1925 Mrs. DOROTHY ELIZA­ 
BETH WILDER TYSON died 
at her home in London, England 
in March. She was awarded a 
master of arts degree from Bryn 
Mawr College and London Uni­ 
versity. Prior to her marriage in 
1933, she was an instructor in 
English at Temple University. 
A member of Phi Mu sorority, 
she was a member of the Ameri­ 
can Red Cross at High Wycombe, 
Buckinghamshire, the National 
Council of Women and served 
for many years as a director of 
the American Women's Club in 
London. She is survived by her 
husband, Thomas L. Tyson, 
managing director of two in­ 
surance companies, and a daugh­ 
rer, who is on the Paris staff of 
NATO. 

1925 Dr. A. HARVEY SIM­ 
MONS, prominent Harrisburg 
area physician who specialized 
in allergies, died on June 5 in the 
Harrisburg Hospital at the age 
of 65. A University of Pennsyl­ 
vania Medical School graduate, 
Dr. Simmons was a member of 
the Harrisburg Hospital staff 
and a past president of the 
Dauphin County Medical So­ 
ciety. He was also a member of 
the Harris burg Academy of 
Medicine and the Pennsylvania 
Medical Society. A member of 
Alpha Chi Rho fraternity, he was 
a life member of the General 
Alumni Association and a Mason. 
He is survived by his wife, three 
daughters and a stepson. 

1927 The Alumni Office re­ 
cently received word of the 

death of JOHN R. WEST­ 
WOOD, of Highland Park, New 
Jersey. 

1941 Miss MARIANNE E. 
COPE died while visiting her 
father in Carlisle on May 13 at 
the age of 47. During World 
War II she served as a com­ 
missioned officer in the Women's 
Army Corps, receiving her dis­ 
charge in 1945. Before moving to 
Washington, D. C. in 1953, she 
was a teacher in public and pri­ 
vate schools in Illinois and 
Missouri. Miss Cope was a 
member of Zeta Tau Alpha 
Sorority, the Doctor's Nurse 
Association of Washington and 
the Allison Methodist Church. 
She is survived by her father and 
a sister, JEAN M. COPE, '45. 

1946 Dr. STANLEY G. WIL­ 
SON, JR., medical director of 
General American Life Insur­ 
ance Company, died on April 29 
in St. John's Mercy Hospital, 
St. Louis, Missouri of cancer at 
the age of 44. After graduation 
from Temple Medical School, he 
interned at Mercer Hospital, 
Trenton, New Jersey, and then 
entered private practice for live 
years in Lawrenceville, New 
Jersey. He was assistant medi­ 
cal director of the Connecticut 
General Life Insurance Company 
for eight years prior to joining 
General American Life. He was a 
member of the national, state 
and local medical societies; the 
Board of Life Insurance Medi­ 
cine; the Life Insurance Medical 
Directors of America; the medi­ 
cal section of the American Life 
Convention; and the Health 
Insurance COL111cil and American 
Henrr Association. He was a 
member of Theta Chi Fraternity 
He is survived by his wife, two 
sons, a daughter, his parents 
Mr. and Mrs. STANLEY G. 
WILSON, '15, and a brother, 
Dr. FREDERICK WILSON,'48. 

1969 JOHN V. BAUM, of 
Marborough, England, died on 
June 5 of injuries suffered in an 
automobile accident on the New 
Jersey Turnpike. He was 22 
years of age and would have 
entered upon his junior year at 
the College. He was enroute to 
New York City to board a plane 
to England when the accident 
occurred. He is survived by his 
parents and a brother, who is a 
member of the incoming fresh­ 
man class. 



Paul L. Hutchison, '18, a member of 
the Board of Trustees and a Past Presi­ 
dent of the Alumni Association, died 
last May 30th. He leaves his wife, 
Florence Baker Hutchison, '17 and a 
host of other Dickinsonians who knew 
him as "Uncle Paul." 
Likely, no one except "Red" Malcolm 

knew intimately more alumni between 
the classes of the years 1914 and 1967. 
A very dear friend of "Hutch's," 

Paul Walker, '21, President of the 
Home Star Co., Inc., of Harrisburg, pub­ 
lished an obituary in his newspaper 
which read in part: 

"You started young and were out of 
college at an age when most youngsters 
are just getting in. I wasn't there but 
they tell me you were pledged Phi 
Kappa Sigma, the fraternity that 
brought us together, in knee pants. 
"Later in more mature years you were 

the Phi Kap chapter visitor and your 
advice and counsel to the undergrad­ 
uates is well and pleasantly remem­ 
bered. Their problems became your 
problems and you helped many a lad 
find the way when .the going was rough. 
Like "Mr. Chips," you had many 

children-and they were all boys. You 
and I never missed a Commencement, 
well hardly ever, and the oft-heard 
question was: "Is 'Hutch' here yet?" 
"The "L" in your name stood for 

Loomis. It could well have stood for 
Loyalty, for loyalty was one of your 
outstanding virtues-loyalty to friends, 
to family, to church, to college, to fra­ 
ternity, to profession, to whatever 
organization or cause you were affiliated 
with was one hundred percent. And no 
one knows it better than I since the Fall 
of 1917 in old Carlisle. 

"You paid your civic rent many 
times over in service to the community 
-and it's on the record: President of 
Tri-County Assn. for the Blind; Presi­ 
dent of the Camp Hill Library Assn.; 
Dauphin County Bar; Pa. Supreme 
Court; American Bar Association; U.S. 
District Court; Superior Court; Counsel 
for Pa. Dept. of Forests and Waters; 
Deputy Atty. General of Pa.; President, 
Phi Kappa Sigma Club of Central Pa.; 
Mason-Shrine; President, Hbg. Chapter 
of the Red Cross; President of the Hbg. 
Community Theatre; President of the 
Dickinson Alumni Assn. (and what a 

job you did there') Quite a list and 
these are but some of the highlights of 
your many civic activities. 

"You fought the good fight, you 
played a good part in this dizzy old 
world, you have finished the course, and 
all is well. And your friends are so glad 
that you left them happy when you said 
goodbye." 

May Morris, the librarian of Dickin­ 
son College for 29 years until her re­ 
tirement with professor emerita rank in 
I 956, died Jan. 27 in Carlisle Hospital 
after a long illness. 

Miss Morris, who was 81 years old, 
was the last surviving member of a 
family that had helped settle what is 
now the state of Delaware. 

Although she maintained an apart­ 
ment here, she regarded Morris'Pleasure, 
the family estate near Greenwood, Del., 
as her home. The property had been in 
the family from Colonial times. 

She was born in Greenwood, the 
daughter of William Wilkinson Morris 
and Mary Lutner Collison. The late 
Judge Hugh Martin Morris, of Wilming­ 
ton, a prominent Delaware resident was 
a brother. He was a United States 
District Judge and a prominent Cor­ 
poration Lawyer. 

Miss Morris was graduated from 
Dickinson in I 909 and the Pratt Insti­ 
tute of Library Science in 1917. After 
ten years on the library staff of Bryn 
Mawr College, she became the Dickin­ 
son librarian in 1927. 

--- 

In 1949 she was made a full professor, 
the second woman to gain that rank at 
Dickinson. 

A good manager and resourceful, 
Miss Morris left a profound mark upon 
the library. She tripled the number of 
catalogued books, modernized its pro­ 
cedures and, according to associates, 
brought it into the life of the campus to 
an extent matched at few other colleges. 
To bring the library staff, faculty and 

students closer together, she introduced 
a weekly library tea and this became a 
Dickinson tradition. 
In 1947 Miss Morris helped establish 

the Boyd Lee Spahr Lectures in Ameri­ 
cana which explore the colonial college's 
relations with the men, events and cul­ 
ture of 18th century America. Prom­ 
inent historians give the lectures. 
At her retirement the president of the 

College said Miss Morris had "served 
Dickinson beyond computation." In a 
tribute to her, admiring alumni estab­ 
lished the May Morris Associates to 
encourage financial support for the 
library. 
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"Anyone interested in American 
liberal arts colleges," said a Dickinson 
official, "will applaud Miss Morris' 
contribution to Dickinson as its Ji_ 
brari an for 29 years. 
"She made the library function 

efficiently on modern principles, made 
it indeed an integral part of the College. 
What Dickinson also had in her was a 
great and gracious lady of courage, 
imagination, and elegance." 

Miss Morris early set up a student 
advisory committee on the library, 
anticipating by many years the clamor 
of today's students for a voice in college 
management. In addition, she main­ 
tained close relationship with her stu­ 
dent assistants, many of whom went on 
to prominent place in scholarship and 
the professions. 
Last June when Dickinson broke 

ground for a new $2.3 million library 
Miss Morris had helped to plan, she 
turned over the first spadeful of earth. 
A room in this Library will bear her 
name. 



Special 
~eritic::>ri 

More than roo undergraduates and 
alumni of Phi Epsilon Pi Fraternity 
gathered on May 17 at the Marriott 
Motor Hotel, Philadelphia, to pay 
tribute to Paul Hodge on the occasion 
of 50 years of service to the Phi Ep 
chapter house at Dickinson. 

Prominent alumni, including Judge 
Leon Leonard, of the New Jersey 
Superior Court, and Judge J. Sydney 
Hoffman, of the Pennsylvania Superior 
Court, attended the surprise affair for 
"Pappy" Hodge, a campus institution 
at Dickinson. 
Tributes, telegrams of good wishes, 

greetings from President Howard L 
Rubendall, and gifts from under­ 
graduates and alumni filled the evening 
for Hodge, who began his career as 
house man for Phi Epsilon Pi when the 
fraternity started operation there in 
r9r7. 

ROBERT Brasier, of Philadelphia, a 
Dickinson-Phi Ep alumnus, was Chair­ 
man of the reception and dinner. 

Most of the brothers in the chapter 
house at Dickinson came to Philadelphia 
by chartered bus for the tribute to 
Hodge, who acknowledged the event 
and the tribute with gracious words of 
thanks. Alumni as far back as the Class 
of 1917 turned out, and they came from 
as far away as Ann Arbor, Mich., 
Washington, Baltimore, Stamford, 
Conn., and New York to pay honor 
to the popular Hodge. 

A scroll from Phi Epsilon Pi Fra­ 
ternity, which has national headquarters 
in Philadelphia, and a special parchment 
salute signed by everyone in attendance 
were also presented to the campus 
"landmark," name of Paul Hodge. 

Phi Eps Honor 
'Pappy' Hodge 
For 50 Years 
At Dickinson 

• 

General view of more than IOO who attended dinner in honor of Paul 
Hodge. Phi Epsilon Pi fraternity sponsored the event at the Marriott 
Motor Hotel in Philadelphia. 

Paul Hodge receives a fancy checker set from Dickinson Phi Ep 
Alumnus, Meyer "Patsy" Potampkin, 'J2. 



The 
General 
Alumni 
Association 
Term expires in 1968 
G. Harold Keatley, Esq., '27 
Austin W. Brizendine, Esq., '39 
Mrs. Mary Kirkpatrick Breene, '40 
Catherine S. Eitemiller, '46 
John D. Hopper, Esq., '48 
Sidney D. Kime, Jr., Esq., '54 
Thomas V. Zug, Esq., '33 
Andrew Y. Rogers, Jr., '65 

DIRECTORY OF ALUMNI CLUBS 

CALIFORNIA 
LOS ANGELES. President Joseph S. 
Stephens, '26, 5315 Garth Ave., 90056 
SAN DIEGO. President Mrs. Sanford 
Sweet, '52, 10005 S. Cole Rd., Whittier, 
906o3 
SAN FRANCISCO. President Mrs. 
Robert E. Bernard, '48, 83 Silverwood 
Drive, Lafayette, 94549 

COLORADO 
DENVER. President George F. Barbary, 
44, Box 658, G. Route #3, Golden, 80401 

CONNECTICUT 
Hartford. President Robert B. Cohen, '5 4, 
2, Northbrook Dr., West Hartford, 06100 

DELAWARE 
WILMINGTON. President Ohrum J. 
Small, '15, 48 Baynard Blvd., 19803 

DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 
WASHINGTON. President Walter E. 
Beach, '56, 5719 Chevy Chase Parkway, 
N.W., 20015 

FLORIDA 
FLORIDA GULF COAST. President 
Joseph Miele, '59, 6414-28 Terrace N. 
Street, St. Petersburg, 33710 
JACKSONVILLE. President Delbert M. 
Francis, '41, 4215 Water Oak Lane, Ortega 
Forrest, 322rn 
MIAMI. President Arthur A. Pendleton, 
'48, 6871 SW 76th Terrace, 33143 

GEORGIA 
ATLANTA. President Harry A. McKee, '42 
900 Landmark Drive, N.E., 30305 

ILLINOIS 
~HICAGO. President William Ragolio, 
35, 1500 W. Monroe St., 6o607 

President 
Sidney D. Kline, Jr., '54 

Vice President 
John D. Hopper, '48 

Secretary 
Mary Mackie Eshelman, '43 

THE ALUMNI TRUSTEES 

Winfield C. Cook, '32 

THE ALUMNI COUNCIL 

Term expires in 1969 
Fred A. Lumb, '29 
Harry E. Hinebauch, '34 
George G. Lindsay, Esq., '48 
Dr. Hampton P. Corson, '49 
George C. Hering, III, Esq., '53 
Constance W. Klages, '56 
Robert E. Young, '59 
Bradley B. Geist, '66 

MARYLAND 
BALTIMORE. President H. Chase Davis, 
'50, 224 W. Lafayette Ave., 21217 
OCEAN CITY (Del-Mar-Va.). Presi­ 
dent Kendall K. McCabe, '61, Smith Island, 
21824 

MASSA CHU SETTS 
BOSTON. Charles A. Ferrone, '57, 108 
Clark Rd., Needham, 02192 

MICHIGAN 
ANN ARBOR. President Donald E. 
Shapiro, '53, 352 E. Huron River Dr., 48103 

NEW JERSEY 
DELAWARE VALLEY. President Wal­ 
ter Benner, '47, 525 William St., Trenton, 
08600 
NEW YORK ALUMNAE. President 
Ruth Cain Connor, '30, 755 W. Broad St., 
Westfield, New Jersey, 07090 
NORTHERN NEW JERSEY. President 
Laurence V. Radtke, Jr., '54, 299 Springfield 
Ave., Berkeley Heights, 07922 
SOUTHERN NEW JERSEY. President 
Ronald Goldberg, '54, 11 I Rich Ave., 
Berlin, 08009 

NEW YORK 
NEW YORK CITY. President Robert 
J. Weinstein, '50, 272 Hewes St., Brooklyn, 
I !2Il 

ROCHESTER. President Holland Taylor, 
'48, 170 Non Hill, 14617 
SOUTHERN TIER. President Charles 
F. Saam, '43, 101 Gilmore Ave., Hillcrest, 
Binghamton, 13900 
SYRACUSE. President Robert J. Thomas, 
'40, 333 Roosevelt Ave., 13200 

OHIO 
CLEVELAND. President Thomas B. 
Price, '60, 14619 Clifton Blvd., Lakewood, 
44!07 

Mrs. Katherine Smith Carpenter, '25 
Professor Roy R. Kuebler, Jr., '33 
Weston C. Overholt, jr., Esq., '50 

Term expires in 1970 
Virginia Watts, '24 
Dorothy Chamberlain, '28 
James K. Nevling, Esq., '30 
Mary Mackie Eshelman, '43 
Rev. Ralph L. Minker, Jr., '47 
Douglas Rehor, '48 
H. Chase Davis, Jr., '50 
Joel B. Kerin, '67 

COLUMBUS. President Robert A. Aaron­ 
son, '43, Seneca Hotel, 361 E. Broad St., 
43215 

PENNSYLVANIA 
BERKS-READING. President Sidney 
D. Kline, Jr.,' 54, 46 Wyomissing Hills Blvd. 
Wyomissing Hills, Reading, 19600 ' 

HARRISBURG. President James W. 
Evans, '51, 2301 Oakwood Road, 17rn4 
LEHIGH VALLEY. President Kenneth L. 
Harvey, '53, 302 Walnut St., Catasauqua, 
18032 
NORTHEASTERN PENNSYLVANIA. 
President Mrs. Esther C. Teller, '32, 181 N. 
Franklyn St., Wilkes-Barre, 18700 
PHILADELPHIA. President Robert M. 
Brasier, '58, 1504 Pine St., 19102 
PITTSBURGH. Presid~nt Daniel B. 
Winters.ta«, 293 Old Farm Rd., Mt. Lebanon, 
15228 
WEST BRANCH VALLEY. President 
Frank W. Ake, '31, 441 Pine St., Williams­ 
port, 17701 
YORK. President J. Richard Budding, 
32, 124 E. Market St., 17400 

SAVE THE DATES FOR THESE 
ALUMNI CLUB MEETINGS 

October 
6 Hartford, Conn. 

10 Boston, Mass. 
11 Albany, N. Y. 
12 Syracuse, N. Y. 
13 Rochester, N. Y. 
17 Bingham ton, N. Y. 
20 North Jersey 
24 Cleveland, Ohio 
25 Detroit, Mich. 
27 Chicago, Ill. 




